BID Tabulation RFQ # 21-002, Cable, Luminaires & Electrical Supplies
Due: Monday, March 08,2021 @ 1 PM CT

Supplier =| City Elec.| Crescent| GexPro Graybar Neher
ltem Qt Description Mfg/Model Price Each /] Price Each| Price Each/] Price Each/ | Price Each/
y P And Part Total [ Total Total Total Total
Number
$9.02 ea $3.66 ea $3.41 ea $3.75 ea $6.70 ea
Fuse, 5 Amp, 500V, FNQ, $3,608.00 | $1,344.00 | $1,364.00 | $1,500.00 $2,680.00
A 400 each | Time-Delay. Bussmann .
FNQ5 or equal Littlefuse | Bussmann | Bussmann Bussmann Bussmann
qual. FLQOO05 FNQ5 FNQ5 FNQ5 FNQ5
. $7.63 ea $4.40 ea $4.10 ea $4.50 ea $7.05 ea
HEB In-Line Fuse Holder, $2,899.40 | $1,672.00 | $1,558.00 | $1,710.00 | $2,679.00
B 380 each Bussmann HEB-AA or )
Equal Littlefuse | Bussmann | Bussmann Bussmann Bussmann
q LEBAA HEB-AA HEB-AA HEB-AA HEB-AA
Multi-Tap Connector.
) $12.15ea | $10.44ea | $19.15ea $17.60 ea
C | 360each| 3-wire, ILSCO PBTS-3-4 $4,374.00 | $3,758.40 | $9.894.00 | $6,336.00 NO BID
NO SUBS
Multi-Tap Connector
. ’ $1547ea | $13.28ea | $24.35ea $22.42 ea
D | 70each | 4wire, ILSCO PBTS-4-4 $1,082.90 | $926.60 | $1,70450 | $1,569.40 NO BID
NO SUBS
Multi-Tap Connector
. ' $8.22 ea $7.06 ea $12.90 ea $11.90 ea
E | 100each] 2wire, ILSCO PBTS-2-4 $822.00 | $706.00 | $1,290.00 | $1,190.00 NO BID
NO SUBS
$121.7142
= |12 Rolls off Wire, THHN #10, Stranded $62.355 roll|  roll $$j11i'25§ 63” $§f3‘§3 éj" $112.00 Roll
500 Feet Black, 500 feet per roll $1,108.26 | $1,460.51 CME WYRPA $1,344.00
Alan
$121.7142
o |12 Rolis off wire, THHN #10, Stranded $62.355 roll|  roll $$j11i'25§ 6%” $$?1291'§17 éj" $112.00 Roll
500 Feet Red, 500 feet per roll $1,108.26 | $1,460.51 CME WYRPA $1,344.00
Alan
25,000
’ $1.27368/ft 1.2584/ft
feet.5 | Burial Cable, Type TC §31,842.00 |  S1.66/M | 182645/ | gq3 46000 | 31552
H $41,500.00 ] $45,661.25 $38,800.00
reels of Power, XHHN General Basic Wire | Basic Wire Lake Cable # Basic Wire
5,000 feet Wire VGX82
. $1.75789/ft
Alternate #1 for Burial $43.947.25
Cable :
Southwire
o $179.59 ea | $186.00 ea] $180.10 ea $180.00 ea $179.00 ea
| | 355each| LED StreetLuminaire, $63,754.45 | $66,030.00 | $63,935.50 | $63,900.00 | $63,545.00
Type I, 8K
Cree Cree Cree Cree Cree
355 each
. . $7.14 each| $3.52ea | $7.15each $3.35 each
J Twist L"L‘fjkmir:]‘;rfr'gg Capfor $2.534.70 | $1.249.60 | $2,538.25 NO BID $1,189.25
Cree Intermatic Cree Intermatic
TOTAL ORDER FOR EACH VENDOR = $2,216.52 | $5,391.00 $2,922.00 $31,460.00 $64,734.25




