
RFP # 19-023   Spring Trees for 
2020

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Vendor Total Arbor Vantage ACORN CHESTNUT 

1 3
Acer platanoides ‘Columnare’, 

Columnare Norway Maple,                               
1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR

3 $65.00 mckay $195.00 No Bid no bid no bid

2 1

Acer platanoides ‘Emerald 
Queen’ or ‘Emerald Lustre’, 
Emerald Queen or Emerald 

Lustre Norway Maple,              1-
1/2-1-3/4" BR

0 $53.00 acorn $0.00
Low tree 

count
$53.00 $62.00

3 1
Acer platanoides   ‘Royal Red’ 

Royal Red Norway Maple,                                                 
1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR

1 $53.00 acorn $53.00 $53.00 $60.00

4 0
Acer saccharum  Sugar Maple,  1-

1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
0 $56.00 schichtel $0.00 $61.00 $79.00

5 1

Acer truncatun x A.platanoides 
‘Warrenred’, Pacific Sunset 

Hybrid Maple,    1-1/2 – 1-3/4" 
BR

1 $60.00 schichtel $60.00 $61.00 $72.00

6 7
Aesculus x ‘Homestead’, 

Homestead Buckeye,                          
1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR

7 $78.00 schichtel $546.00 $84 sub aut. 
Splendor, cont.

$82.00

7 1
Betula alleghaniensis, Yellow 

Birch, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
1 $68.00 schichtel $68.00 no bid no bid

8 15
Betula nigra, River Birch,        1-

1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
15 $46.00 schichtel $690.00 $58.00 $62.00

9 13

Carpinus carolinana ‘J.N. 
Upright’, Firespire American 

Hornbeam,           1-1/2 – 1-3/4” 
BR

13 $98.00 schichtel $1,274.00 no bid no bid



RFP # 19-023   Spring Trees for 
2020

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Vendor Total Arbor Vantage ACORN CHESTNUT 

10 1

Carpinus carolinana ‘J.N. 
Upright’, Firespire American 

Hornbeam,           1-1/2 – 1-3/4” 
B&B

1 $137.00 acorn $137.00 $137.00 no bid

11 7
Catalpa speciosa, Northern 
Catalpa, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR

7 $52.00 schichtel $364.00 $78.00 $72.00

12 4
Catalpa speciosa, Northern 
Catalpa, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” B&B

5 $104.00 schichtel $520.00 no bid $165.00

13 7
Catalpa bungei, 'Umbrella' 

Umbrella Catalpa,                       1-
1/2 – 1-3/4” Cont.

7 $156.00 schichtel $1,092.00 no bid no bid

14 0
Catalpa bungei, 'Umbrella' 

Umbrella Catalpa,                       2-
1/2 B&B

13 $185.00 schichtel $2,405.00 no bid no bid

15 24
Celtis occidentalis, Hackberry, 1-

1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
24 $59.00 schichtel $1,416.00 $138 B&B $69.00

16 2
Celtis occidentalis ‘JFS-KSU1’, 
Prairie Sentinel Hackberry,  1-

1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
2 $85.00 schichtel $170.00 $48   6 ft $90.00

17 2
Celtis occidentalis ‘JFS-KSU1’, 
Prairie Sentinel Hackberry,  1-

1/2 – 1-3/4” B&B
2 $138.00 leaves $276.00 $138.00 $175.00

18 3
Cercidiphyllum japonicum, 

Katsura Tree, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
3 $64.00 schichtel $192.00 no bid $71.00

19 6
Cladrastis kentukea,  American 
Yellowwood,     1/2 - 1-3/4" BR

6 $78.00 acorn $468.00 $78.00 $90.00



RFP # 19-023   Spring Trees for 
2020

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Vendor Total Arbor Vantage ACORN CHESTNUT 

20 2
Cornus mas ‘Golden Glory’, 

Golden Glory Corneliancherry 
Dogwood,      1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR 

2 $80.00 chestnut $160.00 $56  7 ft $80.00

21 26
Eucommia ulmoides, Hardy 

Rubber Tree, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
26 $68.00 schichtel $1,768.00 $136.00 $77.00

22 5
Fagus sylvatica ‘Dawckii Purple’, 
Dawick Purple European Beech,                                 

1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
$0.00 sub b&b no bid

23 14
Fagus sylvatica ‘Dawckii Purple’, 
Dawick Purple European Beech,                                 

1-1/2 – 1-3/4” B&B
19 $138.00 acorn $2,622.00 $138.00 no bid

24 12
Fagus sylvatica ‘Riversii’, Riversii 
European Beech,   1-1/2 – 1-3/4” 

BR
$0.00 sub b&b no bid

25 14
Fagus sylvatica ‘Riversii’, Riversii 
European Beech,   1-1/2 – 1-3/4” 

B&B
27 $138.00 acorn $3,726.00 $138.00 no bid

26 16
Ginkgo biloba 'Princeton Sentry', 
Princeton Sentry Ginkgo, 1-1/2 - 

1-3/4" BR
18 $77.00 chestnut $1,386.00 $148 cont. $77.00

27 2
Gleditsia tricanthos 'Draves', 
Street Keeper Honeylocust,                              

1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
3 $61.00 acorn $183.00 $61.00 $79.00



RFP # 19-023   Spring Trees for 
2020

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Vendor Total Arbor Vantage ACORN CHESTNUT 

28 2
Gleditsia tricanthos 'Sky line ', 

Skyline Honeylocust,                              
1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR

2 $65.00 Leaves $130.00

29 24
Gleditsia tricanthos 'Draves', 
Street Keeper Honeylocust,                              

1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B
24 $106.00 schichtel $2,544.00 sub br $189.00

30 28
Gymnocladus dioicus ‘Espresso’, 
Espresso Kentucky Coffeetree’,                      

1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
15 $76.00 chestnut $1,140.00 $81.00 $76.00

14 $76.00 schichtel $1,064.00 $76.00

31 3

Gymnocladus dioicus ‘Skinny 
Latte’, Skinny Latte Kentucky 

Coffeetree’,                      1-1/2 – 
1-3/4” BR

3 $89.00 schichtel $267.00 no bid no bid

32 34
Liriodendron tulipfera, Tuliptree,  

1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
17 $59.00 chestnut $1,003.00 $61 sub E. City $59.00

17 $59.00 schichtel $1,003.00 $59.00



RFP # 19-023   Spring Trees for 
2020

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Vendor Total Arbor Vantage ACORN CHESTNUT 

33 17
Liriodendron tulipfera, Tuliptree,  

1-1/2 - 1-3/4" Cont.
17 $120.00 schichtel $2,040.00 $138.00 $159.00

34 17
Liriodendron tulipfera, Tuliptree,  

1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B
17 $107.00 acorn $1,819.00 $107.00 $179.00

35 8

Liriodendron tulipfera 
'Fastigiatum' or Emerald City , 

Fastigate or Emerald City 
Tuliptree, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B

9 $125.00 schichtel $1,125.00 $138.00 $179.00

36 6

Maackia amurensis 
‘MaacNificent’, Maacificent 

Amur Maackia,                     1-1/2 - 
1-3/4" BR

6 $90.00 schichtel $540.00 $107.00 $99.00

37 14
Maclura pomifera ‘white shield’, 

White Shield Osage Orange,                             
1-1/2 - 1-3/4"  BR

15 $59.00 schichtel $885.00 no bid $70.00

38 2
Magnolia 'Elizabeth'           1-1/2 - 

1-3/4" B&B
2 $153.60 goodmark $307.20 no bid no bid

39 9
Magnolia acuminata 

Cucumbertree 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" 
B&B

12 $157.00 acorn $1,884.00 $157.00 no bid

40 1
Malus ‘Adirondak’, Adirondak 
Crabapple, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR

1 $65.00 chestnut $65.00 $68.00 $65.00

41 4
Malus 'Firebird' Firebird 

Crabapple, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
0 $0.00 $83.00 no bid



RFP # 19-023   Spring Trees for 
2020

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Vendor Total Arbor Vantage ACORN CHESTNUT 

42 1
Malus 'Ivory Spear'          Ivory  

Spear Crabapple,        1-1/2 – 1-
3/4” BR

2 $73.00 acorn $146.00 $73.00 no bid

43 2
Malus 'Raspberry Spear'  

Raspberry Spear Crabapple, 1-
1/2 – 1-3/4” BR

3 $73.00 acorn $219.00 $73.00 no bid

44 1
Ostrya virginiana, Ironwood,  1-

1/2 – 1-3/4” B&B
1 $98.00 acorn $98.00 $98.00 $179.00

45 5

Phellodendron lavallei 
'Longnecker' or ‘His Majesty’, 

Eyestopper or His Majesty 
Corktree, 1-1/2-1-3/4" BR

5 $88.00 leaves $440.00 $137.00 $149.00

46 7

Platanus x acerfolia ‘Morton 
Circle’, Exclamation London 

Planetree,                             1-1/2 - 
1-3/4" BR

8 $56.00 chestnut $448.00 $58.00 $56.00

47 1

Pyrus calleryana 'Chanticleer' OR 
'Cleveland Select', Chanticleer or 
Cleveland Select Callery Pear, 1-

1/2 - 1-3/4" BR

1 $61.00 chestnut $61.00 no bid $61.00

48 9
Quercus bicolor, Beacon Oak, 1-

1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B
9 $118.00 schichtel $1,062.00 $119.00 $189.00

49 11
 Quercus bicolor, Swamp White 

Oak, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B
12 $90.00 schichtel $1,080.00 $119.00 $189.00

50 3
Quercus macrocarpa, Bur Oak,  1-

1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B
3 $90.00 schichtel $270.00 $119.00 $189.00



RFP # 19-023   Spring Trees for 
2020

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Vendor Total Arbor Vantage ACORN CHESTNUT 

51 1
Syringa reticulata ‘Ivory Silk’, 

Ivory Silk Japanese Lilac,                                       
1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR

1 $58.00 schichtel $58.00 $63.00 $69.00

52 6
Tilia Americana 'Redmond', 

Redmond Linden, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” 
BR

6 $59.00 schichtel $354.00 $63.00 $64.00

53 3
Tilia cordata ‘Corzam’, 

Corinthian Littleleaf Linden, 1-
1/2 – 1-3/4” BR

3 $68.00 schichtel $204.00 $68.00 $68.00

54 3
Tilia cordata ‘Glenleven', 

Glenleven Littleleaf Linden,                                    
1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR

3 $68.00 acorn $204.00 $68.00 $79.00

55 6
Tilia cordata ‘Halka’, Summer 

Sprite Littleleaf Linden,                                       
1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR

$0.00 no bid no bid

56 4
Tilia Tomentosa ‘Sterling’, 

Sterling Silver Linden,         1-1/2 - 
1-3/4" BR

4 $57.00 schichtel $228.00 $68.00 $68.00

57 17
Ulmus x ‘Frontier’, Frontier 

Hybrid Elm,    1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
17 $108.00 acorn $1,836.00 $108.00 $169.00

58 17
Ulmus x ‘New Horizon’, New 

Horizon Hybrid Elm,                               
1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR

17 $55.00 chestnut $935.00 $81.00 $55.00

59 17
Ulmus x 'Regal', Regal Hybrid 

Elm,    1-1/2 – 1-3/4” B&B
17 $140.00 mckay $2,380.00 $108 sub 

prospector
$169.00



RFP # 19-023   Spring Trees for 
2020

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Vendor Total Arbor Vantage ACORN CHESTNUT 

60 2
Ulmus Triumph, Triumph Elm, 1-

1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
2 $56.00 schichtel $112.00 $68.00 $60.00

61 12
Zelkova serrata ‘Green Vase’, 

Green Vase Zelkova,                                          
1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR

12 $64.00 schichtel $768.00 no bid $74.00

62 5
Zelkova serrata ‘Musashino’, 
Musashino Zelkova, 1-1/2 - 1-

3/4" BR
5 $64.00 schichtel $320.00 $83.00 $74.00

12
Zelkova serrata ‘Musashino’, 
Musashino Zelkova, 1-1/2 - 1-

3/4" B&B
12 $178.00 schichtel $2,136.00

Payment Terms

P-Card Acceptance

Acorn Chestnut

$9000 min.

508 $46,810.20
BR 294 112 $13,395.00 79 $5,198.00

Cont 24

B&B 190

Total 508

508 $46,810.20



350

GOODMARK JOHNSONS KANKAKEE
LAKE 

COUNTRY
LEAVES 

INSPIRED
MEACHAM McKAY SCHICHTEL'S Silver Creek TILLMANN TIMBER LINE

$152.60   B&B no bid $108.00 no bid no bid $65.00 $74.00 NO BID $145 B&B no bid

$152.60   B&B no bid $105.00 no bid no bid $55.00 $64.00
LOW TREE 

COUNT
$140 B&B no bid

$161.60   B&B no bid no bid $87.00 $84.50 $75.00 $64.00 $155 B&B no bid

$185.00   B&B no bid
$105 sub fall 

fiesta
no bid $89.50 no bid $56.00 $150 B&B no bid

$158.00   B&B   no bid no bid no bid $89.50 no bid $60.00 $145 B&B no bid

$190.40   B&B $213         B&B
$155 pot  
sub aut 

splendor

$151  B&B  4 
avail

no bid no bid $78.00 $170 B&B no bid

no bid $121        B&B no bid no bid no bid no bid $68.00 no bid no bid

no bid $121        B&B $82.00 no bid $53.50 $54.00 $46.00 $125 B&B no bid

same B&B
$210         
cont

$90 sub 
species

no bid no bid same B&B $98.00 no bid no bid



350

GOODMARK JOHNSONS KANKAKEE
LAKE 

COUNTRY
LEAVES 

INSPIRED
MEACHAM McKAY SCHICHTEL'S Silver Creek TILLMANN TIMBER LINE

$152.60
$210         
cont

$130 sub 
species

no bid no bid $165.00 $153.00 no bid no bid

same B&B $140      cont no bid $79.00 no bid same B&B $52.00 no bid no bid

$133.70 $161.00 no bid $116.00 no bid $150.00 $104.00 $145.00 no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $156.00  Cont no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $185.00 B&B no bid no bid

$152.60   B&B $154         B&B $100.00 $83.00 $89.50 $60.00 $59.00 $145 B&B no bid

same B&B no bid no bid $87.00 no bid no bid $85.00 no bid no bid

$152.60 no bid no bid
$125 chg 2" 

$138
no bid no bid $148.00 no bid no bid

$152.00   B&B $187        B&B no bid no bid no bid
$150 grow 

bag
$64.00 $160 B&B no bid

$213.00   B&B no bid no bid $99.00 no bid no bid $79.00 no bid no bid



350

GOODMARK JOHNSONS KANKAKEE
LAKE 

COUNTRY
LEAVES 

INSPIRED
MEACHAM McKAY SCHICHTEL'S Silver Creek TILLMANN TIMBER LINE

$128.70   B&B $161        B&B no bid no bid no bid no bid $84.00 no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid
$105            4 

avail
no bid no bid $68.00 no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid sub b&b no bid no bid

5@ $275   
9@ $300   

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $154.00 no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid sub b&b no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $154.00 no bid no bid

$234.00   B&B $210        cont $138.00 no bid $135.50
$185 grow 

bag
$81.00 $185 B&B no bid

$147.60   B&B no bid $95.00 no bid no bid no bid $69.00 no bid no bid

mailto:5@%20$275
mailto:5@%20$275


350

GOODMARK JOHNSONS KANKAKEE
LAKE 

COUNTRY
LEAVES 

INSPIRED
MEACHAM McKAY SCHICHTEL'S Silver Creek TILLMANN TIMBER LINE

$147.60 no bid $140.00 no bid no bid $170.00 $106.00 no bid no bid

$157.10   B&B $185        cont no bid no bid no bid $140.00 $76.00 no bid no bid

$76.00

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $89.00 no bid no bid

same B&B no bid $101.00
$102          12 

avail
no bid no bid $59.00 no bid no bid

$59.00



350

GOODMARK JOHNSONS KANKAKEE
LAKE 

COUNTRY
LEAVES 

INSPIRED
MEACHAM McKAY SCHICHTEL'S Silver Creek TILLMANN TIMBER LINE

same B&B $232.00 no bid $97.00 no bid no bid $120.00 no bid no bid

$142.70 sub cont $150.00
$150          12 

avail
no bid no bid $116.00 no bid no bid

$152.60 no bid $155.00
$175            1 

avail
no bid no bid $125.00 no bid no bid

$116.10   B&B $219         B&B no bid
$88           

sub Starburst
no bid no bid $90.00 no bid no bid

$152.60   B&B no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $59.00 no bid no bid

$153.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

$166.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $92  cont no bid no bid

$147.20   B&B $121        B&B no bid $80.00 $74.50 no bid $74.00 $125 B&B no bid

$147.20   B&B $161         B&B no bid no bid no bid
$120 grow 

bag
$74.00 $130 B&B no bid



350

GOODMARK JOHNSONS KANKAKEE
LAKE 

COUNTRY
LEAVES 

INSPIRED
MEACHAM McKAY SCHICHTEL'S Silver Creek TILLMANN TIMBER LINE

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $74.00 no bid no bid

$160.70   B&B $117.25   cont no bid no bid no bid no bid $74.00 no bid no bid

$152.60 $154.00 no bid $94 BR $163.75 $175.00 $110.00 $150.00 $112.00

$241.70   B&B $165         B&B no bid $88.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid $140        cont  $93.00 $106.00 no bid no bid $57.00 $150 B&B no bid

no bid $165        cont no bid $98.00 $84.50 no bid $68.00 no bid no bid

$130.00 $100        cont
$175 sub 
kind spirit

$134    sub 
Regal Prince

no bid no bid $118.00 no bid no bid

$161.60
$165         
cont

$150 cont $134.00 $151.75 $150.00 $90.00 $150.00 $120.00

$161.60 $165        cont $155 cont no bid $163.75 $150.00 $90.00 $150.00 $117.00



350

GOODMARK JOHNSONS KANKAKEE
LAKE 

COUNTRY
LEAVES 

INSPIRED
MEACHAM McKAY SCHICHTEL'S Silver Creek TILLMANN TIMBER LINE

$171.50   B&B $165      cont no bid $82.00 $89.50 $60.00 $58.00 $150 B&B no bid

$161.60  B&B $140        cont $75.00 $86.00 $92.50 $75.00 $59.00 $150 B&B no bid

no bid no bid $90.00 no bid no bid no bid $68.00 $150 B&B no bid

$175.10   B&B no bid $90.00 $86.00 $92.50 $75.00 $68.00 no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

$161.60  B&B $140      cont
$93 sub 
species

$86.00 $92.50 no bid $57.00 no bid no bid

$152.60   B&B no bid $126.00 no bid no bid
$130 grow 

bag
$121.00 $145.00 no bid

no bid   $140      cont $105.00 $123.00 $89.50 $65.00 $56.00 $130 B&B no bid

no bid no bid
$117 sub 

accolade br 
no bid no bid

$65 BR    
$140.00 B&B

$56 br sub 
discovery

no bid no bid



350

GOODMARK JOHNSONS KANKAKEE
LAKE 

COUNTRY
LEAVES 

INSPIRED
MEACHAM McKAY SCHICHTEL'S Silver Creek TILLMANN TIMBER LINE

$152.60   B&B $140        cont $93.00 $85.00 $89.50 $70.00 $56.00 $130 B&B no bid

$171.50   B&B no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $64.00 no bid no bid

$171.50   B&B no bid $97.00 no bid no bid no bid $64.00 no bid no bid

Goodmark Johnson Kankakee Leaves Meacham Mckay Schichtel Tillman Timberline

2 $307.20 9 $846.00 20 $2,575.00 286 $24,489.00

12 $2,136.00

State



WAYSIDE CD STREET Ash Grant

1 $65.00 2 $130.00 $0.00

0 $0.00 0 $0.00 0 $0.00

1 $53.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

0 $0.00 0 $0.00 0 $0.00

0 $0.00 0 $0.00 0 $0.00

0 $0.00 7 $546.00 $0.00

0 $0.00 1 $68.00 $0.00

11 $506.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

6 $588.00 6 $588.00 1 $98.00



WAYSIDE CD STREET Ash Grant

0 $0.00 1 $137.00 $0.00

1 $52.00 6 $312.00 $0.00

1 $104.00 0 $0.00 4 $416.00

0 $0.00 0 $0.00 7 $1,092.00

0 $0.00 0 $0.00 13 $2,405.00

12 $708.00 9 $531.00 3 $177.00

1 $85.00 1 $85.00 $0.00

2 $276.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

2 $128.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 6 $468.00 $0.00



WAYSIDE CD STREET Ash Grant

$0.00 2 $160.00 $0.00

11 $748.00 10 $680.00 2 $136.00

0 $0.00 0 $0.00 0 $0.00

19 $2,622.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

0 $0.00 0 $0.00 0 $0.00

3 $414.00 20 $2,760.00 4 $552.00

13 $1,001.00 5 $385.00 $0.00

0 $0.00 3 $183.00 $0.00



WAYSIDE CD STREET Ash Grant

0 $0.00 0 $0.00 2 $130.00

24 $2,544.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

3 $228.00 2 $152.00 10 $760.00

0 $0.00 4 $304.00 10 $760.00

1 $89.00 2 $178.00 $0.00

8 $472.00 9 $531.00 $0.00

2 $118.00 15 $885.00 $0.00



WAYSIDE CD STREET Ash Grant

8 $960.00 9 $1,080.00 $0.00

8 $856.00 4 $428.00 5 $535.00

3 $375.00 6 $750.00 $0.00

1 $90.00 5 $450.00 $0.00

2 $118.00 9 $531.00 4 $236.00

1 $153.60 0 $0.00 $0.00

11 $1,727.00 1 $157.00 $0.00

1 $65.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

0 $0.00 0 $0.00 0 $0.00



WAYSIDE CD STREET Ash Grant

2 $146.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

2 $146.00 1 $73.00 $0.00

1 $98.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

2 $176.00 3 $264.00 $0.00

4 $224.00 2 $112.00 2 $112.00

0 $0.00 1 $61.00 $0.00

3 $354.00 3 $354.00 3 $354.00

6 $540.00 6 $540.00 $0.00

1 $90.00 2 $180.00 $0.00



WAYSIDE CD STREET Ash Grant

1 $58.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

5 $295.00 1 $59.00 $0.00

3 $204.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

1 $68.00 2 $136.00 $0.00

0 $0.00 0 $0.00 0 $0.00

2 $114.00 0 $0.00 2 $114.00

1 $108.00 15 $1,620.00 1 $108.00

2 $110.00 14 $770.00 1 $55.00

4 $560.00 12 $1,680.00 1 $140.00



WAYSIDE CD STREET Ash Grant

2 $112.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

5 $320.00 4 $256.00 1 $64.00

4 $256.00 0 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 12 $2,136.00 $0.00

CD Street Ash Grant
22075225635316 c21401 10043015335302

208 $19,124.60 211 $18,584.00 76 $8,244.00



56th 90th 75th 86th Dakota



56th 90th 75th 86th Dakota

1 $64.00



56th 90th 75th 86th Dakota

3 $204.00



56th 90th 75th 86th Dakota



56th 90th 75th 86th Dakota

1 $153.60



56th 90th 75th 86th Dakota



56th 90th 75th 86th Dakota



56th 90th 75th 86th Dakota

2 $128.00

1 $64.00

56th 90th 75th 86th Dakota
35060085313102 p2124s p2129s p2127s p1930s p1931s

3 $204.00 1 $64.00 1 $153.60 2 $128.00 1 $64.00



82nd 62nd Washington 58th

1 $60.00

4 $184.00



82nd 62nd Washington 58th



82nd 62nd Washington 58th



82nd 62nd Washington 58th



82nd 62nd Washington 58th



82nd 62nd Washington 58th



82nd 62nd Washington 58th



82nd 62nd Washington 58th

82nd 62nd Washington 58th
p2122s p2123s p2126s p2023s

0 $0.00 1 $60.00 0 $0.00 4 $184.00 13 $857.60

Total 508 Total $46,810.20
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