
From: Rosolino, Krista
To: Rebecca Hammock
Subject: RE: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
Date: Tuesday, April 21, 2020 8:28:14 AM
Attachments: image001.jpg

Troia - signed release.pdf

Good morning Rebecca,
Attached please find the signed release for Peter Troia. He did contact his bank and was unable to
get it notarized, so included are the DLs for him and his wife. Please confirm once the check is in the
mail. Thank you!

Krista
______________________________________
Krista Rosolino
414-276-4970 / fax: 414-276-5533
Please be advised the law firm of Warshafsky, Rotter, Tarnoff and Bloch, S.C. does not consent to accept service of
pleadings and other papers under Wis. Stat. § 801.14 via email and hereby requests that any such documents be served by
other means as set forth in Wis. Stat. § 801.14(2).

From: Rebecca Hammock <RHammock@westalliswi.gov> 
Sent: April 20, 2020 08:13 AM
To: Rosolino, Krista <KristaR@warshafsky.com>
Subject: RE: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
We got the release from Attorney Mundt. We have staff in the office on Tuesdays and Fridays to
complete mailings and check on received mail. If I get the email with the Troia’s release before noon
tomorrow, I should be able to make sure that the check gets in the mail tomorrow.
Thank you.
Rebecca Hammock
Principal Assistant City Attorney | City Attorney's Office
City of West Allis
7525 W. Greenfield Ave. | West Allis, WI 53214
Dept: 414-302-8450
thatswhywestallis.com

From: Rebecca Hammock 
Sent: Friday, April 17, 2020 12:36 PM
To: 'Rosolino, Krista'
Subject: RE: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
Ok.
We will follow up with Attorney Mundt regarding that subrogated party’s release. We of course
want to be careful that they don’t claim additional money owed somewhere down the line. I’m
surprised that there’s not a similar agreement as was already completed by Attorney Falk releasing
their interest.
Thanks for your patience.
Rebecca Hammock
Principal Assistant City Attorney | City Attorney's Office
City of West Allis
7525 W. Greenfield Ave. | West Allis, WI 53214
Dept: 414-302-8450
thatswhywestallis.com

From: Rosolino, Krista [mailto:KristaR@warshafsky.com] 
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Sent: Friday, April 17, 2020 11:24 AM
To: Rebecca Hammock
Cc: Kail Decker
Subject: RE: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
I am waiting on the signed release from my client. I think it is unlikely that he would be able to get it
notarized but will send copies of his driver’s license instead. The few insurers that require notaries
on releases are waiving them at this time, given the difficult time.
Regarding Mr. Mundt’s signature, did you send him the release? I have yet to have a defendant
require a subrogated party to sign the plaintiff’s release. I have no control over Mr. Mundt or him
signing the release, so please contact him if you would like his signature.
I’ll email you the signed release as soon as I receive it.
______________________________________
Krista Rosolino
414-276-4970 / fax: 414-276-5533
Please be advised the law firm of Warshafsky, Rotter, Tarnoff and Bloch, S.C. does not consent to accept service of
pleadings and other papers under Wis. Stat. § 801.14 via email and hereby requests that any such documents be served by
other means as set forth in Wis. Stat. § 801.14(2).

From: Rebecca Hammock <RHammock@westalliswi.gov> 
Sent: April 10, 2020 03:45 PM
To: Rosolino, Krista <KristaR@warshafsky.com>
Cc: Kail Decker <KDecker@westalliswi.gov>
Subject: RE: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
That’s correct. It is our policy in all cases.
I did send the release as soon as we reached settlement three weeks ago on 3/20.
Given that Attorney Falk provided the subrogation settlement information including a release, you
can omit that part from the release I sent.
If you can provide the same subrogation release from Attorney Mundt that likely would be suitable
in that regard leaving only the Troias themselves.
I do understand that the notarization part of the Troias’ signatures may cause a delay in processing
their release.
If you are unable to notarize your client’s signatures our office would accept the executed release
and photo copies or electronic photos of their driver’s licenses in place of notarization.
Thank you.
Rebecca Hammock
Principal Assistant City Attorney | City Attorney's Office
City of West Allis
7525 W. Greenfield Ave. | West Allis, WI 53214
Dept: 414-302-8450
thatswhywestallis.com

From: Rosolino, Krista [mailto:KristaR@warshafsky.com] 
Sent: Friday, April 10, 2020 3:16 PM
To: Rebecca Hammock
Subject: RE: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
Is this a city policy when you are dealing with counsel in a case in litigation? I understand for
individuals, but this is a different situation. And, given COVID, it seems even more understandable to
route the check to my office as quickly as possible. I have noticed a slowdown with our mail.
______________________________________
Krista Rosolino
414-276-4970 / fax: 414-276-5533
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Please be advised the law firm of Warshafsky, Rotter, Tarnoff and Bloch, S.C. does not consent to accept service of
pleadings and other papers under Wis. Stat. § 801.14 via email and hereby requests that any such documents be served by
other means as set forth in Wis. Stat. § 801.14(2).

From: Rebecca Hammock <RHammock@westalliswi.gov> 
Sent: April 10, 2020 03:09 PM
To: Rosolino, Krista <KristaR@warshafsky.com>
Subject: RE: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
It is City policy to have fully executed waivers prior to releasing any checks.
Thanks for your understanding.
Rebecca Hammock
Principal Assistant City Attorney | City Attorney's Office
City of West Allis
7525 W. Greenfield Ave. | West Allis, WI 53214
Dept: 414-302-8450
thatswhywestallis.com

From: Rosolino, Krista [mailto:KristaR@warshafsky.com] 
Sent: Friday, April 10, 2020 8:24 AM
To: Rebecca Hammock
Subject: RE: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
Hi Rebecca,
I anticipate having the release to you soon. In the meantime, please send the check to my office. I
will not disburse any funds until the release is signed and returned to you. There is no reason to
delay sending the check, especially in light of the fact it will likely take some time for the mail to
arrive in light of COVID. Thank you.

Krista
______________________________________
Krista Rosolino
414-276-4970 / fax: 414-276-5533
Please be advised the law firm of Warshafsky, Rotter, Tarnoff and Bloch, S.C. does not consent to accept service of
pleadings and other papers under Wis. Stat. § 801.14 via email and hereby requests that any such documents be served by
other means as set forth in Wis. Stat. § 801.14(2).

From: Rebecca Hammock <RHammock@westalliswi.gov> 
Sent: April 9, 2020 03:51 PM
To: Rosolino, Krista <KristaR@warshafsky.com>
Subject: RE: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
I received a release from Attorney Mundt’s office, but have not received a release from anyone else.
Our office did receive the check today from the finance department; however, we can’t send it out
until we have all the releases completed.
Thank you.
Rebecca Hammock
Principal Assistant City Attorney | City Attorney's Office
City of West Allis
7525 W. Greenfield Ave. | West Allis, WI 53214
Dept: 414-302-8450
thatswhywestallis.com

From: Rebecca Hammock 
Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 3:46 PM
To: 'Rosolino, Krista'
Subject: RE: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
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Krista,
Attached is the release I prepared.
As you can imagine we are short staffed, we will request the check on Monday. Normally that would
result in us getting a check by mid-April, but there is nothing normal about what’s going on so I can’t
say with certainty when it will be issued. However, I can update you next week.
Thanks.
Rebecca Hammock
Principal Assistant City Attorney | City Attorney's Office
City of West Allis
7525 W. Greenfield Ave. | West Allis, WI 53214
Dept: 414-302-8450
thatswhywestallis.com

From: Rosolino, Krista [mailto:KristaR@warshafsky.com] 
Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 3:27 PM
To: Rebecca Hammock
Subject: Confirming settlement of Troia v. West Allis
Rebecca,
This email will confirm that we have reached a settlement of the Troia v. West Allis case for
$8,000.00. Please send the check payable to the Warshafsky, Rotter, Tarnoff & Bloch, S.C. Trust 
Account and please do not include Mr. Troia on the payable line. You can mail it to the address 
below. If you want to email me the release to review, I would appreciate it.
Thank you, 
Krista
______________________________________
Krista Rosolino
Attorney
Warshafsky, Rotter, Tarnoff & Bloch, S.C.
839 North Jefferson Street, Suite 300
Milwaukee WI 53202
414-276-4970 / fax: 414-276-5533
kristar@warshafsky.com

Please be advised the law firm of Warshafsky, Rotter, Tarnoff and Bloch, S.C. does not consent to accept service of 
pleadings and other papers under Wis. Stat. § 801.14 via email and hereby requests that any such documents be served by 
other means as set forth in Wis. Stat. § 801.14(2).
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­­

Due to COVID-19 precautions, City offices and buildings are closed to the public until further notice; 
however, City operations are still ongoing. Staff are working regular business hours Monday - Friday 
from 8 a.m. - 5 p.m (Monday - Friday from 7 a.m. - 3:30 p.m. for Public Works). During this time, 
please submit all applications, licenses, payments, permits, and inquiries via regular mail, e-mail or 
the City Hall drop-box, and they will be processed and paid in the same fashion. Larger plans or 
documents can be submitted using an electronic link, available upon request. Inspectors are still 
performing field inspections, plan reviews, and answering questions. Please visit our coronavirus 
resource pages here. Thank you for your patience during this time. ­
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