
s

Supplier = City Elec. Crescent GexPro Graybar Neher Werner

Mfg/Model

And Part 
Number

C 100 each

Multi-Tap Connector.           

3-wire, ILSCO PBTS-3-4  

NO SUBS

$12.49 ea  

$1,249.00

$16,81 ea  

$1,681.00

$17.86 ea 

$1,786.00

$16.00 ea 

$1,600.00
NO BID

$9.40  ea 

$940.00

D 30 each

Multi-Tap Connector,          

4 wire, ILSCO PBTS-4-4    

NO SUBS

$15.90 ea  

$477.00

$21.396 ea 

$641.88

$22.74 ea  

$682,20

$20.00 ea 

$600.00
NO BID

$11.96 ea  

$358.80 

G

10 Rolls 

of 500 

Feet

Wire, THHN #10, Stranded 

Red, 500 feet per roll

$64.85 roll  

$648.50  

$64.95 roll 

$649.50  

Alan

$68.00 roll 

$680.00  

CME

$64.00 roll 

$640.00  

WYRPA

$85.00 Roll 

$850.00

$64.00 roll 

$640.00  

Southwire

s

H

25,000 

feet. 5 

reels of 

5,000 feet

Burial Cable, Type TC 

Power, XHHN

$0.84891/ft  

$21,222.75  

General 

Cable

$1.311/ft  

$32,775.00  

Basic Wire

$1.31/ft  

$32,750.00  

Basic Wire

1.3568/ft 

$33,920.00 

Priority

$1.29/ft 

$32,250.00  

Basic Wire

$0.745/ft  

$18,625.00 

ADC

Prefer Basic Wire, whick has 19 strands of 

wire making it more flexible. Looking into the 

possible use of ADC wire for future 

purchases.

I 230 each
LED Street Luminaire, 

Type II, 8K

$188.00 ea  

$43,240.00  

Cree

$193.00 ea  

$44,390.00 

Cree

$183.33 ea  

$42,165.90  

Cree

$186.00 ea 

$42,780.00 

Cree

$181.00 ea 

$41,630.00 

Cree

LED Luminaires from CREE were selected 

this year, because of familiarity with the 

product. However, we are interested in 

learning about the other lower cost 

luminaires. We would like to test out a few. 

Please set-up a review of your product with 

Don Molleson 414-302-8873

Alternate #1 LED Street 

Luminaire

$125.10 ea 

$28,773.00  

TGS

$124.00 ea 

$28,520.00 

TGS

Alternate #2 LED Street 

Luminaire

$167.00 ea 

$38,410.00  

AEL

$167.95 ea 

$38,628.50 

AEL

Alternate #3 LED Street 

Luminaire

$116.00 ea 

$26,680.00 

LUMEC

$120.00 ea 

$27,600.00 

Leotek

J 40 each
20ft round tapered 

Aluminum street light pole 

with 6 ft arm.

$1,089.00e  

$43,560.00  

Lightpoles

$544.09 ea 

$21,763.60  

Hapco

$521.45 ea 

$20,858.00 

Hapco

$528.00 ea 

$21,120.00 

Hapco

$559.00 ea 

$22,360.00 

Flagpole

$531.24 ea 

$21,249.60 

HAPCO

Alternate #1 20ft Street 

Light Pole

$886.00 ea 

$35,440.00 

Holophane

Alternate #2 20ft Street 

Light Pole

$575.00 ea 

$23,000.00  

Flagpole

K

8 Reels of 

2,000 ft
HDPE 2" Duct, SCH-40, 

Black, Smooth outer wall, 

ribbed inner wall

NO BID

$1,326.00 

reel  

$10,608.00 

Duraline

NO BID

$1,292.00 

reel     

$10,336.00 

Duraline

NO BID

TOTAL ORDER FOR EACH VENDOR =

Item Qty

$11.36 ea  

$545.28
E 48 each

Description
Price Each 

/ Total

 Price Each 

/ Total

B 300 each

HEB In-Line Fuse Holder, 

Bussmann HEB-AA or 

Equal

$31.18 ea  

$9,354.00  

Ferraz FEB-

11-11

$4.60 ea  

$1,380.00  

Bussmann 

HEB-AA

A 300 each

Fuse, 5 Amp, 500V, FNQ, 

Time-Delay. Bussmann 

FNQ5 or equal.

$13.38 ea  

$4,014.00  

Ferraz 

ATQ5

Multi-Tap Connector,          

2 wire, ILSCO PBTS-2-4    

NO SUBS

$8.44 ea  

$405.12

$64,95 roll 

$649.50  

Alan

$4.85 ea  

$1,455.00  

Bussmann 

FNQ5

F

10 Rolls 

of 500 

Feet

Wire, THHN #10, Stranded 

Black, 500 feet per roll

$64.85 roll  

$648.50  

$64.00 roll 

$640.00  

WYRPA

$68.00 roll  

$680.00  

CME

 Price Each / 

Total

$4.63 ea  

$1,389.00  

Bussmann 

FNQ5

$4.40 ea  

$1,320.00  

Bussmann 

HEB-AA

$4.45 ea 

$1,335.00 

Bussmann 

HEB-AA

$12.05 ea 

$578.40

 Price Each / 

Total

$5.00 ea  

$1,500.00 

Bussmann 

FNQ5

$5.00 ea  

$1,500.00 

Bussmann 

HEB-AA

$11.00 ea 

$528.00
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 Price Each / 

Total

$3.66 ea 

$1,098.00  

Littlefuse 

FLQ005

$5.29 ea 

$1,587.00 

Littlefuse 

LEBAAK

NO BID
$6.35 ea  

$304.80

$64.00 roll 

$640.00  

Southwire

$85.00 Roll 

$850.00

 Price Each 

/ Total

$4.68 ea 

$1,404.00 

Bussmann 

FNQ5


