BID Tabulation RFQ # 23-003, Cable, Luminaires & Electrical Supplies
Due: Monday, March 13,2023 @ 1 PM CT

Werner /
Crescent/ City
Supplier =| Electric | Crawford| GexPro Graybar Neher
ltem Qt Description Mfg/Model Price Each /| Price Each| Price Each/| Price Each/ | Price Each/
Y P And Part Total / Total Total Total Total
Number
$14.53ea | $20.19 each $4.94 ea
Fuse, 5 Amp, 500V, FNQ, .
A 250 each Time-Delay. Bussmann No Bid Al No Bid $3,632.50 $5,047.50 $1,235.00
FNQ5 or equal. Items Bussmann Bussman Bussmann
FNQ5 FNQ5 FNQ5
) $16.74 ea $31.36 ea $8.72 ea
o | ien | TS e er oaso | S | S
Equal Bussmann Bussmann Bussmann
q HEB-AA HEB-AA HEB-AA
Multi-Tap Connector.
C | 225each| 3-wire, ILSCO PBTS-3-4 $§§Zf;ggh NO BID 2299'2; o NO BID
NO SUBS S D
Multi-Tap Connector,
D | 48each | 4 wire, ILSCO PBTS-4-4 $g:13.g£2)1eggh NO BID gga‘gz ?g NO BID
NO SUBS e S
Multi-Tap Connector,
E | 72each | 2wire, ILSCO PBTS-2-4 %ffgoe?gh NO BID 3%2':;’%3%0 NO BID
NO SUBS S D
F 10 Rolls of| Wire, THHN #10, Stranded $135.97 roll| $134.16roll | $135.23 roll NO BID
500 Feet Black, 500 feet per roll $1,359.70 $1,341.60 $1,352.30
G 10 Rolls of| Wire, THHN #10, Stranded $135.97 roll| $134.16 roll | $135.23 roll NO BID
500 Feet Red, 500 feet per roll $1,359.70 $1,341.60 $1,352.30
LED Street Luminaire, Type $200.63 each| $246.75 ea $192.75 ea
H 350 each | lll, 8K, XSPSM-D-HT-3ME- $70,220.50 $86,362.50 $67,462.50
8L-30K7-UL-BZ Bronze Cree Cree Cree
$9.50 each $11.69 ea
| |350 aach | TWist Lock Shorting Cap for $3,325.00 | $4,091.50 %ﬁiﬂga;;
Lumenaires Cree XA- Cree XA- Int,ermétic
XSLSHRT XSLSHRT
LED Street Luminaire, Type $200.63 each| $246.75ea | $192.75 each
J 24 each | IIl, 8K, XSPSM-D-HT-3ME- $4,812.12 $5,922.00 $4,626.00
8L-30K7-UL-SV Cree Cree Cree
Option 1:
Burial Cable, Type TC $3.257.14 ft
35,000 | power Cable, XHHW, 8- $113,999.90
feet, 7 gauge, 600v, 2-conductor, Service Wire 1.71 ft
K reels of | red and black with ground, NO BID TCXH8/3G. $59,850.00
5,000 feet | heat, moisture, and sunlight Option 2: Basic Wire
each resistant, Basic Wire #6- $2.22297 ft
2602-G or Equal $77,803.95
Kris-Tech
TOTAL ORDER FOR EACH VENDOR = $7,924.08 $2,683.20 $0.00 $135,288.00
Alternate part #'s are being researched for Item K. Total all order=[ $145,895.28
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