
RFP # 22-0009   Fall Trees for 2022

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Bid Total

1 5
Acer platanoides ‘Columnare’, Columnare 
Norway Maple,                            1-1/2 – 1-

3/4” BR
5 $84.00 Schichtel $420.00

2 1
Acer platanoides ‘Deborah’, Deborah 

Norway Maple,                            1-1/2 – 1-
3/4” BR

1 $82.00 Chestnut $82.00

3 4

Acer platanoides ‘Emerald Queen’ or 
‘Emerald Lustre’, Emerald Queen or 

Emerald Lustre Norway Maple,         1-1/2-1-
3/4" BR

4 $82.00 Chestnut $328.00

4 1
Acer saccharum 'Legacy'              Legacy  

Sugar Maple, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
1 $86.00 Schichtel $86.00

5 4
Acer truncatun x A.platanoides ‘JFS-

KW202’, Crimson Sunset Hybrid Maple,    1-
1/2 – 1-3/4" B&B,cont,bag

4 $140.00 Kankakee $560.00

6 3
Acer truncatun x A.platanoides 

‘Warrenred’, Pacific Sunset Hybrid Maple,    
1-1/2 – 1-3/4" BR

3 $82.00 Chestnut $246.00

7 1
Aesculus x ‘Homestead’,    Homestead 

Buckeye,                                                   1-1/2 
– 1-3/4” B&B,cont,bag

1 $110.00 Chestnut $110.00

8 20
Amelanchier arborea 'Autumn Brillance'  

Autumn Brillance Serviceberry 1-1/2-1-3/4" 
BR

20 $85.00 Mckay $1,700.00

9 17
Amelanchier laevis 'Cumulus'  Cumulus 

Serviceberry 1-1/2-1-3/4" BR
17 $90.00 Schichtel $1,530.00

10 2
Catalpa speciosa, Northern Catalpa, 1-1/2 – 

1-3/4” B&B,Cont,Bag
2 $100.00 Kankakee $200.00

11 2
Cladrastis kentukea,  American 
Yellowwood,     1/2 - 1-3/4" BR

2 $90.00 Schichtel $180.00

12 1
Cornus mas ‘Golden Glory’, Golden Glory 
Corneliancherry Dogwood,          1-1/2 - 1-

3/4" BR 
1 $90.00 Chestnut $90.00

13 3
Crataegus crusgalli inermis, Thornless 

Cockspur Hawthorn,             1-1/2 – 1-3/4” 
B&B,cont,bag

3 $139.00 Schichtel $417.00

14 1
Eucommia ulmoides, Hardy Rubber Tree, 1-

1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B,cont,bag
1 $145.00 Chestnut $145.00

15 12
Ginkgo biloba 'Princeton Sentry', Princeton 
Sentry Ginkgo, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B,Cont,Bag

12 $150.00 Mckay $1,800.00

16 15
Ginkgo biloba 'Princeton Sentry', Princeton 

Sentry Ginkgo, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
15 $95.00 Chestnut $1,425.00

17 20
Gleditsia tricanthos 'Skyline', Skyline 

Honeylocust,                              1-1/2 - 1-3/4" 
BR

20 $79.00 Chestnut $1,580.00



18 19
Gleditsia tricanthos 'Draves', Street Keeper 
Honeylocust,                              1-1/2 - 1-3/4" 

B&B,cont,bag
19 $139.00 Schichtel $2,641.00

19 3
Gymnocladus dioicus ‘Espresso’, Espresso 

Kentucky Coffeetree’,                      1-1/2 – 1-
3/4” B&B,cont,bag

3 $135.00 Kankakee $405.00

20 1
Maackia amurensis ‘MaacNificent’, 

Maacificent Amur Maackia,                     1-
1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B,cont,bag

1 $160.00 Schichtel $160.00

21 2
Maclura pomifera ‘white shield’, White 

Shield Osage Orange,                             1-1/2 - 
1-3/4"  BR

2 $85.00 Chestnut $170.00

22 4
Maclura pomifera ‘white shield’, White 

Shield Osage Orange,                             1-1/2 - 
1-3/4"  B&B,cont,bag

4 $149.00 Chestnut $596.00

23 4
Magnolia acuminata Cucumbertree 1-1/2 -" 

B&B,cont,bag
4 $160.00 Schichtel $640.00

24 3
Malus ‘Adams’, Adams Crabapple,    1-1/2 – 

1-3/4” BB,cont,bag
3 $105.00 Kankakee $315.00

25 7
Malus ‘Adirondak’, Adirondak Crabapple, 1-

1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
7 $76.00 Schichtel $532.00

26 3
Malus ‘Firebird’, Firebird  Crabapple, 1-1/2 

– 1-3/4” BR
3 $76.00 Schichtel $228.00

27 7
Malus 'Ivory Spear' Ivory  Spear Crabapple, 

1-1/2 – 1-3/4” B&B,cont,bag
7 $125.00 Kankakee $875.00

28 8
Malus 'Raspberry Spear'  Raspberry Spear 
Crabapple, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” B&B,cont,bag

8 $125.00 Kankakee $1,000.00

29 3
Pyrus calleryana 'Jack'   Jack Callery Pear, 1-

1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
3 $87.00 Schichtel $261.00

30 6
Syringa reticulata ‘Ivory Silk’, Ivory Silk 

Japanese Lilac,                                       1-1/2 – 
1-3/4” BR

6 $76.00 Schichtel $456.00

31 5
Taxodium distichum 'Mickelson', Shawnee 

Brave Baldcypress, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B, 
Cont. or Grow Bag

5 $130.00 Kankakee $650.00

32 5
Tilia Americana 'Redmond', Redmond 

Linden, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
5 $77.00 Schichtel $385.00

33 4
Tilia cordata ‘Corzam’, Corinthian Littleleaf 

Linden, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
4 $77.00 Schichtel $308.00

34 13
Tilia cordata ‘Glenleven', Glenleven 

Littleleaf Linden,                                    1-1/2 
– 1-3/4” BR

13 $77.00 Schichtel $1,001.00

35 2
Ulmus 'Prospector', Prospector Elm,            

1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
2 $79.00 Chestnut $158.00

36 7
Ulmus x ‘New Horizon’, New Horizon 
Hybrid Elm,                               1-1/2 - 1-

3/4” B&B,cont,bag
7 $85.00 Kankakee $595.00

37 4
Ulmus x 'Emerald Sunshine', Emerald 

Sunshine Elm,                          1-1/2 – 1-3/4” 
B&B,cont,bag

$0.00

38 4
Ulmus Triumph, Triumph Elm,            1-1/2 

– 1-3/4” BR
4 $79.00 Chestnut $316.00

39 1
Ulmus Accolade, Accolade Elm,            1-1/2 

– 1-3/4” B&B,cont,bag
1 $108.00 Kankakee $108.00

Payment Terms



P-Card Acceptance
Total 
Trees

Total Trees

227 223 $22,699.00 43

BR 4 no bid

Cont CDBG
B&B

Total



ACORN CHESTNUT GOODMARK JOHNSONS KANKAKEE
LAKE 

COUNTRY
LEAVES 

INSPIRED

no bid $89.00 no bid $95.00 no bid

no bid $82.00 no bid $90.00 no bid

$107 BB $82.00 no bid $85.00 no bid

no bid no bid no bid
$140 Sub GN 

MT BB
no bid

$118.00 $169.00 $190.00 140  B&B $151.00

$110 BB $82.00 no bid no bid $112.00

no bid 110   B&B $295.00
$145 sub Ear 

Glow
no bid

$119 BB $92.00 no bid $105.00 no bid

$119 BB $95.00 no bid $165 BB no bid

$106.00 $130.00 $170.00
100 Grow 

Bag
$139.00

$120 BB $93.00 $190 BB $150 BB $124.00

$125 BB $90.00 $165 BB no bid no bid

$120.00 no bid $140.00 no bid no bid

no bid 145   B&B no bid no bid $174.00

$125.00 $172.00 $245.00 $170.00 no bid

$125 BB $95.00 $245 BB no bid no bid

$120 BB $79.00 $165 BB $85.00 $86.00



no bid $180.00 $180.00 no bid no bid

$110.00 $180.00 $215.00
135   

Container
no bid

$120.00 no bid no bid no bid $156.00

$110 BB $85.00 no bid no bid no bid

$110.00 149   B&B no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid $149.00 no bid 105   B&B no bid

$105 BB $80.00 $155 BB $130 BB no bid

$105 BB $99.00 $165 BB
$90 sub Tina 

cont
$116.00

$110.00 $170.00 no bid
125   

Container
no bid

$110.00 $170.00 no bid
125   

Container
$157.00

no bid $88.00 $155 BB $90.00 $121.00

$116 BB $87.00 $190 cont $150 BB no bid

no bid no bid $190.00
130   

Container
$142.00

$112 cont $80.00 $155 BB $82.00 $119.00

$115 BB $93.00 no bid
$105 sub Gn 

Spire
$117.00

$115 BB $93.00 no bid $85.00 $119.00

$108 BB $79.00 no bid $110 BB $142.00

$109.00 $170.00 $155.00 125   B&B $135.00

no bid no bid no bid
$125 sub 
Princeton

no bid

$108 BB $79.00 no bid $125 cont $170 BB

$108.00 $170.00 no bid 125   B&B no bid

$9000 min.



Acorn Chestnut Goodmark Johnson Kankakee Leaves

$4,980.00 58 $5,246.00 40 $4,708.00 only 1 tree

Did not meet 
min

27 $2,668.00 7 $835.00

223 $22,699.00



MEACHAM MidPark McKAY SCHICHTEL TILLMANN TIMBER LINE WAYSIDE

no bid no bid $84.00 $165 BB $110.00

$99.00 $100.00 $84.00 $150 BB $110.00

$94 sub S. 
Glenn

$100.00 $90.00 $165 BB $110.00

$114 sub 
Grn Mt

no bid $86.00 no bid no bid

$145 sub 
Pacific

no bid no bid no bid $175.00

$104.00 no bid $94.00 $165 BB $150.00

$162 sun 
Ohio B

no bid $160.00 no bid no bid

$104.00 $85.00 $90.00 $160 BB $145.00

no bid no bid $90.00 no bid no bid

no bid no bid $139.00 no bid $160.00

no bid no bid $90.00 no bid no bid

$90 sub 
Pagda

no bid $90.00 no bid $140.00

no bid no bid 139   B&B $150.00 $140.00

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

$170.00 150 ontainer $160.00 $180.00 $265.00

$125.00 no bid $96.00 no bid $250.00

$90.00 $85.00 $86.00 $160 BB $140.00



$134 sub 
sky line

$140.00 139   B&B $145.00 $170.00

$145 sub 
common

no bid $160.00 $180.00 $225.00

$177 sub 
Strburst

no bid 160   B&B no bid no bid

no bid no bid $96.00 no bid no bid

no bid no bid $160.00 no bid no bid

no bid no bid 160   B&B no bid no bid

$130 sub 
Red Jewel

no bid $110.00 $140.00 $120.00

no bid no bid $76.00 $130 BB $100.00

no bid no bid $76.00 $130 BB $115.00

$120 sub 
Hargozam

no bid
$245.00 only 

3
no bid $155.00

$120 sun 
Indn 

Summer
no bid $170.00 no bid $155.00

$81 sub 
Clvlnd Slct

no bid $87.00 $135 BB no bid

$90.00 $85.00 $76.00 $160 BB $170.00

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

$95.00 $85.00 $77.00 $170 BB $150.00

$95 sub 
Grnspr

no bid $77.00 $170 BB no bid

$95.00 $85.00 $77.00 no bid no bid

$81 sub Vlly 
Frg

no bid $86.00 no bid $140.00

$130.00 85   BR $140.00 $135.00 $150.00

$130 sub 
Vlly Frg

no bid no bid no bid no bid

$81.00 $85.00 $86.00 $135 BB $140.00

$135.00 no bid $140.00 $135.00 $150.00

$550  Freight $325 freight



50 trees min

Meacham Mckay Schichtel Tillman Timberline

32 $3,500.00 93 $9,245.00

12 $1,800.00 40 $4,245.00

86 $9,548.00



22075225635316 10043015335302

CD STREET

5 $420.00 0 $0.00

$0.00 1 $82.00

$0.00 4 $328.00

$0.00 1 $86.00

$0.00 4 $560.00

3 $246.00 0 $0.00

$0.00 1 $110.00

$0.00 20 $1,700.00

2 $180.00 15 $1,350.00

$0.00 2 $200.00

2 $180.00 0 $0.00

$0.00 1 $90.00

$0.00 3 $417.00

$0.00 1 $145.00

12 $1,800.00 0 $0.00

15 $1,425.00 0 $0.00

$0.00 20 $1,580.00



17 $2,363.00 2 $278.00

$0.00 3 $405.00

$0.00 1 $160.00

1 $85.00 1 $85.00

4 $596.00 0 $0.00

$0.00 4 $640.00

3 $315.00 0 $0.00

$0.00 7 $532.00

$0.00 3 $228.00

$0.00 7 $875.00

$0.00 8 $1,000.00

3 $261.00 0 $0.00

6 $456.00 0 $0.00

4 $520.00 1 $130.00

5 $385.00 0 $0.00

$0.00 4 $308.00

$0.00 13 $1,001.00

$0.00 2 $158.00

$0.00 7 $595.00

$0.00 0 $0.00

4 $316.00 0 $0.00

$0.00 1 $108.00



C22401

220-7522-563-53-16 100-4301-563-53-02

86 $9,548.00 137 $13,151.00



RFP # 22-0009   Fall Trees for 2022

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Bid Total SCHICHTEL

1 5
Acer platanoides ‘Columnare’, Columnare 
Norway Maple,                            1-1/2 – 1-

3/4” BR
5 $84.00 Schichtel $420.00 $84.00

4 1
Acer saccharum 'Legacy'              Legacy  

Sugar Maple, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
1 $86.00 Schichtel $86.00 $86.00

9 17
Amelanchier laevis 'Cumulus'  Cumulus 

Serviceberry 1-1/2-1-3/4" BR
17 $90.00 Schichtel $1,530.00 $90.00

11 2
Cladrastis kentukea,  American 
Yellowwood,     1/2 - 1-3/4" BR

2 $90.00 Schichtel $180.00 $90.00

13 3
Crataegus crusgalli inermis, Thornless 

Cockspur Hawthorn,             1-1/2 – 1-3/4” 
B&B,cont,bag

3 $139.00 Schichtel $417.00 139   B&B

18 19
Gleditsia tricanthos 'Draves', Street Keeper 
Honeylocust,                              1-1/2 - 1-3/4" 

B&B,cont,bag
19 $139.00 Schichtel $2,641.00 139   B&B

20 1
Maackia amurensis ‘MaacNificent’, 

Maacificent Amur Maackia,                     1-
1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B,cont,bag

1 $160.00 Schichtel $160.00 160   B&B

23 4
Magnolia acuminata Cucumbertree 1-1/2 -" 

B&B,cont,bag
4 $160.00 Schichtel $640.00 160   B&B

25 7
Malus ‘Adirondak’, Adirondak Crabapple, 1-

1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
7 $76.00 Schichtel $532.00 $76.00

26 3
Malus ‘Firebird’, Firebird  Crabapple, 1-1/2 

– 1-3/4” BR
3 $76.00 Schichtel $228.00 $76.00

29 3
Pyrus calleryana 'Jack'   Jack Callery Pear, 1-

1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
3 $87.00 Schichtel $261.00 $87.00

30 6
Syringa reticulata ‘Ivory Silk’, Ivory Silk 

Japanese Lilac,                                       1-1/2 – 
1-3/4” BR

6 $76.00 Schichtel $456.00 $76.00

32 5
Tilia Americana 'Redmond', Redmond 

Linden, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
5 $77.00 Schichtel $385.00 $77.00

33 4
Tilia cordata ‘Corzam’, Corinthian Littleleaf 

Linden, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
4 $77.00 Schichtel $308.00 $77.00

34 13
Tilia cordata ‘Glenleven', Glenleven 

Littleleaf Linden,                                    1-1/2 
– 1-3/4” BR

13 $77.00 Schichtel $1,001.00 $77.00

Payment Terms

P-Card Acceptance
Total 
Trees

Total Trees Schichtel

93 93 $9,245.00 93 $9,245.00



RFP # 22-0009   Fall Trees for 2022

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Bid Total McKAY

8 20
Amelanchier arborea 'Autumn Brillance'  

Autumn Brillance Serviceberry 1-1/2-1-3/4" 
BR

20 $85.00 Mckay $1,700.00 $85.00

15 12
Ginkgo biloba 'Princeton Sentry', Princeton 
Sentry Ginkgo, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B,Cont,Bag

12 $150.00 Mckay $1,800.00 150 ontainer

Payment Terms

P-Card Acceptance
Total 
Trees

Total Trees Mckay

32 32 $3,500.00 32 $3,500.00



RFP # 22-0009   Fall Trees for 2022

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY Price Low Bid Total KANKAKEE

5 4
Acer truncatun x A.platanoides ‘JFS-

KW202’, Crimson Sunset Hybrid Maple,    1-
1/2 – 1-3/4" B&B,cont,bag

4 $140.00 Kankakee $560.00 140  B&B

10 2
Catalpa speciosa, Northern Catalpa, 1-1/2 – 

1-3/4” B&B,Cont,Bag
2 $100.00 Kankakee $200.00 100 Grow 

Bag

19 3
Gymnocladus dioicus ‘Espresso’, Espresso 

Kentucky Coffeetree’,                      1-1/2 – 1-
3/4” B&B,cont,bag

3 $135.00 Kankakee $405.00 135   
Container

24 3
Malus ‘Adams’, Adams Crabapple,    1-1/2 – 

1-3/4” BB,cont,bag
3 $105.00 Kankakee $315.00 105   B&B

27 7
Malus 'Ivory Spear' Ivory  Spear Crabapple, 

1-1/2 – 1-3/4” B&B,cont,bag
7 $125.00 Kankakee $875.00 125   

Container

28 8
Malus 'Raspberry Spear'  Raspberry Spear 
Crabapple, 1-1/2 – 1-3/4” B&B,cont,bag

8 $125.00 Kankakee $1,000.00 125   
Container

31 5
Taxodium distichum 'Mickelson', Shawnee 

Brave Baldcypress, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B, 
Cont. or Grow Bag

5 $130.00 Kankakee $650.00 130   
Container

36 7
Ulmus x ‘New Horizon’, New Horizon 
Hybrid Elm,                               1-1/2 - 1-

3/4” B&B,cont,bag
7 $85.00 Kankakee $595.00 125   B&B

39 1
Ulmus Accolade, Accolade Elm,            1-1/2 

– 1-3/4” B&B,cont,bag
1 $108.00 Kankakee $108.00 125   B&B

Payment Terms

P-Card Acceptance
Total 
Trees

Total Trees Kankakee

40 40 $4,708.00



RFP # 22-0009   Fall Trees for 2022

Item # QTY Description NEW QTY CHESTNUT total

2 1
Acer platanoides ‘Deborah’, Deborah 

Norway Maple,                            1-1/2 – 1-
3/4” BR

1 $82.00
$82.00

3 4

Acer platanoides ‘Emerald Queen’ or 
‘Emerald Lustre’, Emerald Queen or 

Emerald Lustre Norway Maple,         1-1/2-1-
3/4" BR

4 $82.00

$328.00

6 3
Acer truncatun x A.platanoides 

‘Warrenred’, Pacific Sunset Hybrid Maple,    
1-1/2 – 1-3/4" BR

3 $82.00
$246.00

7 1
Aesculus x ‘Homestead’,    Homestead 

Buckeye,                                                   1-1/2 
– 1-3/4” B&B,cont,bag

1 $110.00
$110.00

12 1
Cornus mas ‘Golden Glory’, Golden Glory 
Corneliancherry Dogwood,          1-1/2 - 1-

3/4" BR 
1 $90.00

$90.00

14 1
Eucommia ulmoides, Hardy Rubber Tree, 1-

1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B,cont,bag
1 $145.00 $145.00

16 15
Ginkgo biloba 'Princeton Sentry', Princeton 

Sentry Ginkgo, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR
15 $95.00

$1,425.00

17 20
Gleditsia tricanthos 'Skyline', Skyline 

Honeylocust,                              1-1/2 - 1-3/4" 
BR

20 $79.00
$1,580.00

21 2
Maclura pomifera ‘white shield’, White 

Shield Osage Orange,                             1-1/2 - 
1-3/4"  BR

2 $85.00
$170.00

22 4
Maclura pomifera ‘white shield’, White 

Shield Osage Orange,                             1-1/2 - 
1-3/4"  B&B,cont,bag

4 $149.00
$596.00

35 2
Ulmus 'Prospector', Prospector Elm,            

1-1/2 – 1-3/4” BR
2 $79.00 $158.00

38 4
Ulmus Triumph, Triumph Elm,            1-1/2 

– 1-3/4” BR
4 $79.00 $316.00

Payment Terms

P-Card Acceptance
Total 
Trees

Total Trees

58 58 $5,246.00


	Bid Tab
	Schichtel
	McKay
	Kankakee
	Chestnut

