
Graybar Electric Neher Electric Traffic & Parking Control

I.  (28) Round tapered aluminum poles, 30' 

mounting height, brushed aluminum finish

Yr/Mfg/Model
2012 Flagpole Inc

FPSLS8430C-DC-WA

2012 Flagpole

FPSLS8430C-DC-WA

2012 Flagpoles

FPSLS8430C-DC-WA

Price Each 559.80 532.50 554.07

Total/28 15,674.40 14,910.00 15,513.96

IA.  (28) 6' bracket arms

Yr/Mfg/Model

2012 Flagpole Inc

FPEA352375-6-30-115WA

2012 Flagpole

FPEA352375-6-30-115WA

2012 Flagpoles

FPEA352375-6-30-115WA

Price Each 73.20 70.35 72.42

Total/28 2,049.60 1,969.80 2,027.76

II.  (3) Round tapered aluminum poles, 30' 

mounting height w/bronze anodized finish.  

Yr/Mfg/Model
2012 Flagpole Inc

FPSLS8430D-DBA-DC-WA

2012 Flagpole

FPSLS8430D DBA-DL-WA

2012 Flagpoles

FPSLS8430D-DBA-DC-WA

Price Each 1,017.50 977.15 1,007.12

Total/3 3,052.50 2,931.45 3,021.36

III.  (1) Round tapered aluminum poles, 30' 

mounting height, brushed aluminum finish. 

 Yr/Mfg/Model
2012 Flagpole Inc

FPFLS8430C-TDC-WA

2012 Flagpole

FPFLS8430C-TDL-WA

2012 Flagpoles

FPFLS8430C-TDC-WA

Total/1 609.50 560.00 590.82

IV. (1) Round tapered aluminum

traffic signal pole, 20' mounting

height w/brushed alumimum finish.  

Yr/Mfg/Model

2012 Flagpole Inc

FPFLS8620D-WA (.250" wall)

2012 Flagpole

FPFLS8620D-WA (.250 wall)

2012 Flagpoles

FPFLS8620D-WA (.250 wall)

Total/1
586.50

525.00 (.250 wall)

418.00 (.188 wall) 568.36

V. (1) Round tapered aluminum poles, 28' 

mounting height w/brushed aluminum finish

Yr/Mfg/Model
2012 Flagpole Inc

FPFLS84530D-DC-WA

2012 Flagpole

FPFLS84530D-DC-WA

2012 Flagpoles

FPFLS84530D-DC-WA

Total/1 714.75 655.00 692.86
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Graybar Electric Neher Electric Traffic & Parking Control

VI.  (6) Round, tapered, truss arm

aluminum poles, 30' mounting height

Yr/Mfg/Model

2012 Flagpole Inc

FPFLS8428D-TDL-DBA-WA

2012 Flagpole

FPFLS8428D-TDL-DBA-WA

2012 Flagpoles

FPFLS8428D-TDL-DBA-WA

Price Each 884.50 849.00 875.51

Total/6 5,307.00 5,094.00 5,253.06

VII.  (6) 12' Aluminum Roadway Lighting 

Pole.  Color-Green

Yr/Mfg/Model

2012 Holophane

NYA 12 T5C 17 PO7 ABG RAL6005

2012 P&K

RTA5M12MGS-WA

2012 P&K

RTA5M12MGS-WA

Price Each 1,105.26 880.00 910.77

Total/6 6,631.56 5,280.00 5,464.62

VIII.  (6) 30' Aluminum Street Lighting 

Pole.  Color-Green

Yr/Mfg/Model
2012 Holophane

(AOL21874) NY30RTACAT (3x4) PROBA no bid

2012 Sternberg

1-1914G3/SMA6-

MOD/9230T8/250HPSMT/HPS250/MO

G/1-HDBA/CM Finish

Price Each 1,657.90 5,007.11

Total/6 9,947.40 30,042.66

VIIIA. (6) Clamshell Base

Yr/Mfg/Model

2012 Holophane

NY24CSBCAR6005RFD106131 no bid See above

Price Each 1,921.00

Total/6 11,526.00

IX. (2) Cast Aluminum Twin Cross

Luminaire Arm.  Color-Green

Yr/Mfg/Model

2012 Holophane

CAM144/2U231B RFD106132 no bid

2012 Sternberg

2-1914

Price Each 1,047.00 6,651.05

Total/2 2,094.00 13,302.10

X. (4) Cast Aluminum Banner Pole

Arm-Break-away style.  Color-Green

Yr/Mfg/Model

2012 Holophane

BAB26H4BBA RAL6005 no bid no bid

Price Each 268.40

Total/4 1,073.60

Delivery

98 days

Holophane-13-14 lead time

Flagpole 4-8 weeks 6-10 weeks 10-12 weeks

Terms 1%/15 Net 30 Net 30

Credit Card Payment Accepted? Yes No Yes


