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City of West Allis est Alls, Wi 53214

Resolution

File Number: R-2003-0041 Final Action:
[-2)-03

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of various nurseries for furnishing and delivering 278
trees for spring planting for a total sum of $18,764.00.

WHEREAS, The Purchasing/Central Services Division has reported that it duly advertised a request
for proposal for various species of trees for the Public Work's Department of the City of West Allis,
that the proposals received as shown on the attached bid report were reasonable; and,

WHEREAS, The Common Council deems it to be in the best interests of the City of West Allis that
the proposals hereinafter mentioned be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Common Council of the City of West
Allis that the proposal submitted by Johnson's Nursery for $1,746.00, Kankakee Nursery for
$2,534.00, Erv Larsen Landscape for $1,864.00, McKay Nursery for $4,306.50, Midpark Nursery
for $1,042.00, Needles & Leaves for $980.00, Schichtel's Nursery for $4,723.00, Silver Creek
Nursery for $528.50 and Wayside Nursery for $1,040.00 for a total sum of $18,764.00 in
accordance with City of West Allis RFP #758 be and is hereby accepted.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Purchasing/Central Services Division be and is hereby
authorized to issue purchase orders for the aforesaid trees.

PCSD758
ADOPTED Q/ 1, 2 203 APPROVEDQWW }} 2003
7 z//% T W
Paul M. Ziehler, Acting ‘Qtté Clerk/Treasurer Jeannette Bell, Mayor
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CITY OF WEST ALLIS

TABULATION
RFP #758 Spring Trees Open: 1/9/03
Tree Description Acorn Farms Erv Larsen Johnson’s Nursery Kankakee Nursery Manbeck Nursery McKay Nursery - Midpark Nursery
Landscape

Item [ - 3 Acer ginnala 'Flame’ Amur no bid no bid

Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR B&B B&B B&B
Price/each 79.00 90.00 72.00 44.50 *115.00
Total/3 237.00 270.00 216.00 133.50 345.00
Item 2 - 9 Acer platanoides ‘Columnare’ no bid no bid
Norway Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4"” B&B

Price/each *120.00 97.00 74.00 75.00 92.50

Total/9 1,080.00 873.00 666.00 675.00 832.50 :

item 3 - 10 Acer platanoides ‘Columnare’ no bid no bid no bid
Norway Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR B&B

Price/each 49.00 97.00 53.00 57.50

Total/10 490.00 970.00 530.00 575.00

Item 4 - 8 Acer platanoides ‘Deborah’ no bid no bid
Norway Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B B&B B&B

Price/each *89.00 79.00 97.00 *75.00 47.50

Total/8 712.00 632.00 776.00 600.00 380.00

ltem 5 - 3 Acer platanoides ‘Emerald no bid
Queen’ Norway Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B

Price/each 89.00 119.00 97.00 74.00 75.00 92.50

Total/3 267.00 357.00 291.00 222.00 225.00 277.50

Item 6 - 17 Acer platanoides 'Emerald no bid no bid no bid
Queen’ Norway Maple, 1-1/2-1-3/4" BR B&B B&B

Price/each *89.00 49.00 97.00 47.50

Total/17 1,513.00 833.00 1,649.00 807.50

item 7 - 3 Acer rubrum x freemanii no bid

‘Autumn Blaze’ Red Maple,

1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B B&B B&B B&B
Price/each *86.00 82.00 102.00 72.00 *67.50 *118.00
Total/3 258.00 246.00 306.00 216.00 202.50 354.00
Item 8 - 4 Acer saccharum ‘Legacy’ Sugar no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B

Price/each 49.00 72.00

Total/4 196.00 288.00

Item 9 - 1 Acer tataricum, Tatarian Maple, no bid no bid no bid no bid

1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each 72.00 117.00 *126.00
Total/1 72.00 117.00 126.00
Item 10 - 4 Acer tataricum, Tatarian no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B B&B

Price/each 72.00 117.00

Total/4 288.00 468.00




Tree Description Acorn Farms Erv Larsen Johnson’s Nursery Kankakee Nursery Manbeck Nursery McKay Nursery Midpark Nursery
Landscape

Item 11 - 2 Acer truncatun x A. no bid no bid no bid no bid
platanoides, "Warrenred’, Pacific Sunset

Hybrid Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B

Price/each 89.00 79.00 *47.50

Total/2 178.00 158.00 95.00

{tem 12 - 7 Acer truncatun x no bid no bid no bid

A.platanoides Warrenred*, Pacific Sunset

Hybrid Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each 89.00 120.00 *97.00 *144.00
“Total/7 623.00 840.00 679.00 1,008.00
Item 13 - 6 Alnus glutinosa, European no bid no bid no bid no bid
Alder, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B .
Price/each 85.00 72.00 45.00

Total/6é _ﬁ 510.00 432.00 270.00

Item 14 - 1 Alnus glutinosa, European no bid no bid no bid

Alder, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4"” B&B

Price/each 85.00 99.00 *97.50 *132.00
Total/1 85.00 99.00 97.50 132.00
Item 15 - 5 Amelanchier x grandiflora no bid no bid
rAutumn’ Brilliance Serviceberry,

1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each 88.00 119.00 97.00 *82.00 *97.50

Total/5 440.00 595.00 485.00 410.00 487.50

Item 16 - 12 Carpinus betulus ‘Fastigiata’ no bid no bid no bid no bid
Pyramidal European, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each 98.00 *98.00 106.00

Total/12 1,176.00 1,176.00 1,272.00

Item 17 - 13 Carpinus caroliniana, no bid no bid no bid

American Hornbeam, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each 95.00 95.00 106.00 *172.00
Total/13 1,235.00 1,235.00 1,378.00 2,236.00
item 18 - 10 Catalpa speciosa 'Northem no bid no bid no bid

Catalpa, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B B&B B&B
Price/each 69.00 *97.00 75.00 *119.00
Total/10 _ 690.00 970.00 750.00 1,190.00
Item 19 - 3 Celtis occidentalis, Hackberry

1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each 85.00 109.00 92.00 *74.00 82.00 *97.50 *140.00
Total/3 255.00 327.00 276.00 222.00 246.00 292.50 420.00
Item 20 - 17 Celtis occidentalis, no bid no bid
Hackberry, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B B&B

Price/each 85.00 79.00 92.00 43.00 57.00

Total/17 1,445.00 1,343.00 1,564.00 731.00 969.00




Tree Description Acorn Farms Erv Larsen Johnson’s Nursery Kankakee Nursery Manbeck Nursery McKay Nursery Midpark Nursery
Landscape

item 21 - 2 Cercidiphyllum japonicum, no bid no bid no bid
Katsura Tree, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each 98.00 120.00 *134.00 101.00
Total/2 196.00 240.00 268.00 202.00
Item 22 - 7 Corylus colurna Turkish : no bid
Filbert, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B
Price/each 95.00 125.00 107.00 70.00 *117.50 *165.00
Total/7 665.00 875.00 749.00 490.00 822.50 1,155.00
Item 23 - 1 Fagus sylvatica 'Riversii’ no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
European Beech, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each 98.00 *90.00
Total/1 98.00 90.00 .
Item 24 - 9 Fraxinus americana ‘Empire’ no bid no bid no bid no bid
White Ash, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4: B&B
Price/each *89.00 102.00 *80.00
Total/9 801.00 918.00 720.00
Item 25 - 1 Fraxinus Nigra "Fallgo!d' Fall no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Gold Black Ash, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B
Price/each 72.00 117.00
Total/1 72.00 117.00
Item 26 - 3 Fraxinus quadrangulata, Blue no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Ash, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B
Price/each *59.00 97.00
Total/3 177.00 291.00
Item 27 - 6 Gleditsia tricanthos var.
imermis ‘Skyline’ Honey locust,
1-1/2 - 1-3/4”" BR B&B B&B B&B
Price/ea 78.00 72.00 102.00 *37.00 78.50 *48.50 *125.00
Total/6 468.00 432.00 612.00 222.00 471.00 291.00 750.00
Item 28 - 5 Malus 'Prairifire’ Crabapple, no bid no bid
1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each 58.00 92.00 92.00 64.00 *119.00
Total/5 290.00 460.00 460.00 320.00 595.00
Item 29 - 1 Phellodendron amurense, no bid no bid no bid no bid
Macho Amur Corktree, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B
Price/each 85.00 *134.00 *210.00
Total/1 85.00 134.00 210.00
Item 30 - 6 Pyrus calleryana ‘Autumn no bid no bid
Blaze’ Callery Pear, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each 66.00 129.00 92.00 *78.00 *108.00
Total/é 396.00 774.00 552.00 468.00 648.00
Item 31 - 5 Pyrus calleryana ‘Chanticleer’ no bid
Callery Pear, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each 66.00 92.00 68.00 *78.00 99.75 *108.00
Total/5 330.00 460.00 340.00 390.00 498.75 540.00




Tree Description Acorn Farms Erv Larsen Johnson's Nursery | Kankakee Nursery Manbeck Nursery McKay Nursery Midpark Nursery
Landscape

Item 32 - 1 Quercus alba x robur *Crimson no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Spire’ Oak, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4"” B&B

Price/each 97.00 *180.00
Total/1 97.00 180.00
Item 33 - 1 Quercus macrocarpa, Bur Oak, no bid

1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B

“Price/each 88.00 92.00 112.00 92.00 98.00 *180.00
Total/1 88.00 92.00 112.00 92.00 98.00 180.00
Item 34 - 7 Quercus robur ‘Skymaster’ no bid no bid no bid
. ('Pyramich’) English Oak,

1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BaB

Price/each 95.00 97.00 *99.00 *180.00
Total/7 665.00 679.00 693.00 1,260.00
Item 35 - 7 Quercus robur ‘Skyrocket’, no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
English Oak, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each 97.00 *98.00

Total/7 - 679.00 686.00

Item 36 - 8 Syringa retucla ‘Ivory Silk’ no bid no bid no bid
Japanese Lilac, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B B&B B&B

Price/each 79.00 79.00 102.00 98.50

Total/8 632.00 632.00 816.00 788.00

Item 37 - 4 Syringa reticulata ‘lvory Silk’ no bid

Japanese Lilac, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B

Price/each 79.00 116.00 102.00 98.50 124.50 *165.00
Total/4 316.00 464.00 408.00 394.00 498.00 660.00
Item 38 - 6 Tilia Americana ‘Redmond’ no bid no bid no bid

Linden, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR B&B B&B
Price/each 59.00 92.00 39.00 *148.00
Total/6 _ 354.00 552.00 234.00 888.00
Item 39 - 5 Tilia cordata 'Corzam’ no bid no bid no bid no bid

Corinthian Littleleaf Linden,

1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B Bareroot

Price/each 88.00 *52.00 *248.00
Total/5 440.00 260.00 1,240.00
Item 40 - 1 Tilia cordata 'Glenleven’ no bid no bid no bid

Littleaf Linden, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B

Price/each 120.00 92.00 *78.00 *148.00
Total/1 120.00 92.00 78.00 148.00
Item 41 - 5 Tilia cordata 'Glenleven’ no bid no bid no bid no bid
Littleleaf Linden, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B

Price/each 49.00 92.00 41.00

Total/s _ 245.00 460.00 205.00

Item 42 - 5 Tilia tomentosa ‘Sterling’ no bid no bid

Silver Linden, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B B&B B&B B&B
Price/each 88.00 *52.00 112.00 78.00 *148.00
Total/5 440.00 260.00 560.00 390.00 740.00




Allis

$4500

Tree Description Acorn Farms Erv Larsen Johnson’s Nursery Kankakee Nursery Manbeck Nursery McKay Nursery Midpark Nursery
Landscape
Item 43 - 1 Ulmus parvifolia, Lacebark no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Elm, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B
Price/each 70.50 *154.00
Total/1 _ 70.50 154.00
ftem 44 - 6 Ulmus wilsoniana ‘Prospector’ no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
‘Elm, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B
Price/each *148.00
Total/6 888.00
. Item 45 - 6 Ulmus x ‘New Horizon’ Hybrid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Elm, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B B&B
Price/each 145.00 92.00
Total/6 870.00 552.00
item 46 - 16 Ulmus x ‘Regal’ Hybrid Elm, no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
1-1/2 - 1-3/4"” BR
Price/each 59.00 *54.00
Total/16 944.00 864.00
Item 47 - 3 Ulmus x 'Regal’ Hybrid Elm, no bid no bid no bid no bid
1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B »
Price/each 129.00 *109.00 *148.00
Total/3 387.00 327.00 444.00
Terms Net 2%/10 Net 30 Net Net 30 Net Net 30
Minimum order
$4000 for FOB West Minimum order




Tree Description Needles & Leaves | Schichtel’s Nursery Silver Creek Tillmann Wholesale | Timberline Trees Wayside Nursery
Nursery Growers

Item | - 3 Acer ginnala ‘Flame’ Amur no bid no bid no bid
Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B

Price/each *68.00 72.00 122.00

Total/3 204.00 216.00 366.00

Item 2 - 9 Acer platanoides ‘Columnare’ no bid no bid
"Norway Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B

Price/each 81.00 87.50 75.00 *100.00
Total/9 729.00 787.50 675.00 900.00
,item 3 - 10 Acer platanoides ‘Columnare’ no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Norway Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR

Price/each 69.00

Total/10 690.00

item 4 - 8 Acer platanoides ‘Deborah’ no bid no bid no bid
Norway Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B B&B

Price/each 69.00 87.50 102.00

Total/8 552.00 700.00 816.00

Item 5 - 3 Acer platanoides ‘Emerald

Queen’ Norway Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B

Price/each *80.00 81.00 85.50 107.00 75.00 *100.00
Total/3 240.00 243.00 256.50 321.00 225.00 300.00
Item 6 - 17 Acer platanoides ‘Emerald no bid no bid no bid
Queen’ Norway Maple, 1-1/2-1-3/4” BR B&B

Price/each *72.00 69.00 85.50

Total/17 1,224.00 1,173.00 1,453.50

Item 7 - 3 Acer rubrum x freemanii no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
'Autumn Blaze’ Red Maple,

1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR

Price/each 86.00

Total/3 258.00

Item 8 - 4 Acer saccharum ‘Legacy’ Sugar no bid no bid no bid no bid
Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&8

Price/each 96.00 117.00

Total/4 384.00 468.00

Item 9 - 1 Acer tataricum, Tatarian Maple, no bid
1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each *95.00 81.00 87.50 122.00 75.00

Total/1 95.00 81.00 87.50 122.00 75.00

Item 10 - 4 Acer tataricum, Tatarian no bid no bid no bid no bid
Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B

Price/each 72.00 87.50

Total/4 288.00 350.00




Tree Description

Needles & Leaves

Schichtel’s Nursery

Silver Creek
Nursery

Tillmann Wholesale
Growers

Timberline Trees

Wayside Nursery

Item 11 - 2 Acer truncatun x A.
platanoides, "Warrenred’, Pacific Sunset
Hybrid Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR
Price/each

Total/2

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

L Item 12 - 7 Acer truncatun x
A.platanoides Warrenred’, Pacific Sunset
Hybrid Maple, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each

Total/7

no bid

no bid

no bid

112.00
784.00

75.00
525.00

no bid

Item 13 - 6 Alnus glutinosa, European
Alder, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR

Price/each

Total/6

no bid

66.00
396.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 14 - 1 Alnus glutinosa, European
Alder, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each

Total/1

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 15 - 5 Amelanchier x grandiflora
‘Autumn’ Brilliance Serviceberry,
1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each

Total/5

no bid

no bid

117.00
585.00

no bid

no bid

item 16 - 12 Carpinus betulus 'Fastigiata’
Pyramidal European, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each

Total/12

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

item 17 - 13 Carpinus caroliniana,
American Hornbeam, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each

Total/13

no bid

91.00
1,183.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

*80.00
1,040.00

Item 18 - 10 Catalpa speciosa ‘Northemn
Catalpa, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR

Price/each

Total/10

no bid

69.00
690.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 19 - 3 Celtis occidentalis, Hackberry
1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each

Total/3

*88.00
264.00

no bid

no bid

75.00
225.00

no bid

Item 20 - 17 Celtis occidentalis,
Hackberry, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR
Price/each

Total/17

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid




Tree Description

Needles & Leaves

Schichtel’s Nursery

Silver Creek
Nursery

Tillmann Wholesale
Growers

Timberline Trees

Wayside Nursery

Item 21 - 2 Cercidiphyllum japonicum,
Katsura Tree, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each

Total/2

no bid

81.00
162.00

no bid

100.00
200.00

no bid

no bid

Iitem 22 - 7 Corylus colurna Turkish
. Filbert, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each

Total/7

no bid

110.50
773.50

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 23 - 1 Fagus sylvatica 'Riversii’
" European Beech, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B
Price/each

Total/1

no bid

105.00
105.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 24 - 9 Fraxinus americana ‘Empire’
White Ash, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4: B&B
Price/each

Total/9

no bid

81.00
729.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 25 - 1 Fraxinus Nigra ‘Fallgold’ Fall
Gold Black Ash, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR
Price/each

Total/1

*80.00
80.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 26 - 3 Fraxinus quadrangulata, Blue
Ash, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B

Price/each

Totat/3

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 27 - 6 Gleditsia tricanthos var.
imermis ‘Skyline’ Honey locust,
1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR

Price/ea

Total/6

no bid

396.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

B&B
*78.00
468.00

Iitem 28 - 5 Malus 'Prairifire’ Crabapple,
1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each

Total/5

no bid

81.00
405.00

75.50
377.50

87.00
435.00

no bid

“93.00
465.00

Item 29 - 1 Phellodendron amurense,
Macho Amur Corktree, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each

Total/1

no bid

no bid

no bid

no I;id

no bid

no bid

Item 30 - 6 Pyrus calleryana ‘Autumn
Blaze’ Callery Pear, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B
Price/each

Total/6

*70.00
420.00

no bid

112.00
672.00

no bid

*105.00
630.00

Item 31 - 5 Pyrus calleryana ‘Chanticleer’
Callery Pear, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&8
Price/each

Tatal/5

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

*105.00
525.00




Tree Description Needies & Leaves | Schichtel’s Nursery Silver Creek Tillmann Wholesale | Timberline Trees Wayside Nursery
Nursery Growers

Item 32 - 1 Quercus alba x robur ‘Crimson no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Spire’ Oak, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4"” B&B

Price/each 91.00

Total/1 91.00

Item 33 - 1 Quercus macrocarpa, Bur Oak, no bid no bid no bid
(1+1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B

Price/each 120.00 91.00 135.00

Total/1 _ 120.00 91.00 135.00

Item 34 - 7 Quercus robur 'Skymaster’ no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
('Pyramich’) English Oak,

1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each 91.00

Total/7 637.00

Item 35 - 7 Quercus robur ‘Skyrocket’, no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

English Oak, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4"” B&B

Price/each 91.00

Total/7 637.00

Item 36 - 8 Syringa retucta ‘Ivory Silk’ no bid no bid

Japanese Lilac, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR B&B B&B

Price/each *55.00 82.00 90.50 110.00

Total/8 - 440.00 656.00 724.00 880.00

Item 37 - 4 Syringa reticulata ‘Ivory Silk’

Japanese Lilac, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each *75.00 91.00 90.50 110.00 80.00 *107.00

Total/4 300.00 364.00 362.00 440.00 320.00 428.00

Item 38 - 6 Tilia Americana ‘Redmond’ no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Linden, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR

Price/each 82.00

Total/é6 492.00

Item 39 - 5 Tilia cordata ‘Corzam’ no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Corinthian Littleleaf Linden,

1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each

Total/5

Item 40 - 1 Tilia cordata 'Glenleven’ no bid no bid no bid

Littleaf Linden, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" B&B

Price/each *85.00 92.00 92.00

Total/1 _ 85.00 92.00 92.00

Item 41 - 5 Tilia cordata ‘Glenleven’ no bid no bid no bid no bid

Littleleaf Linden, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR

Price/each *70.00 82.00

Total/5 350.00 410.00

Item 42 - 5 Tilia tomentosa ‘Sterling’ no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Silver Linden, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR

Price/each 82.00

Total/5 410.00




Tree Description

Needles & Leaves

Schichtel’s Nursery

Silver Creek
Nursery

Tillmann Wholesale
Growers

Timberline Trees

Wayside Nursery

Item 43 - 1 Ulmus parvifolia, Lacebark
Elm, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each

Total/1

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

tem 44 - 6 Ulmus wilsoniana ‘Prospector’
‘Elm, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR

Price/each

Total/6

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 45 - 6 Ulmus x ‘New Horizon' Hybrid
Elm, 1-1/2 - 1-3/4” BR

Price/each

Total/é

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 46 - 16 Ulmus x ‘Regal’ Hybrid Elm,
1-1/2 - 1-3/4" BR

Price/each

Total/16

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Item 47 - 3 Ulmus x ‘Regal’ Hybrid Elm,
1-1/2 - 1-3/4” B&B

Price/each

Total/3

no bid

no bid

88.50
265.50

no bid

no bid

no bid

Terms

Net 30

Net 30

Net 30

"2%/10

Net 30

Net 30

¢ Substitution (tree size or species)
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