BID TABULATION

RFP #983

Water Valves & Accessories
Due: 1/29/08, 10:30 AM

ITEM/QTY

Davies Water

First Supply-Oak Creek

First Supply-Madison

HD Supply Waterworks

A. 25 (89004014005)

Curb Box Bottom Section 16"

Tyler 152

Price/ea

16.40

17.15

No bid

18.00

Total/10

164.00

171.50

180.00

B. 45 (89004014007)

Curb Box Top Section 30"

Tyler 30T

Price/ea

27.35

28.60

No bid

29.00

Total/10

273.50

286.00

290.00

C. 75 (89004015002)

Valve Box Top, 26"

Tyler 26T

Price/ea

43.75

49.30

No bid

46.00

Total/120

5,250.00

5,916.00

5,520.00

D. 25 (89004015004)

Valve Box Base #6

Tyler #6-600X

Price/ea

38.30

42.85

No bid

43.00

Total/110

4,213.00

4,713.50

4,730.00

E. 25 (89004015003)

Valve Box Bottom Section, 36"

Tyler #36B

Price/ea

45.15

50.70

No bid

48.00

Total/115

5,192.25

5,830.50

5,520.00




ITEM/QTY Davies Water First Supply-Oak Creek First Supply-Madison HD Supply Waterworks

F. 125 (89004017001)

Valve Box Lid, 5-1/4"

Tyler MWW600-6

Price/ea 10.55 12.15 No bid 13.00
Total/150 1,582.50 1,822.50 1,950.00
G. 72 (89004510003)

Gate Valve, 6", R/S

Mfg/Model Kennedy 157 Mueller C-2360 No bid Mueller C-2360
Price/ea 478.40 497.50 459.00
Total/55 26,312.00 27,362.50 25,245.00
H. 12 (89004510004)

Gate Valve, 8", R/S

Mfg/Model Kennedy 157 Mueller C-2360 No bid Mueller C-2360
Price/ea 739.60 775.00 709.00
Total/20 14,792.00 15,500.00 14,180.00
I. 52 (89004510016)

Gate Valve Adapter, 6"

Mfg/Model Kennedy Mueller No bid Kennedy or Mueller
Price/ea 61.40 69.30 72.00
Total/85 5,219.00 5,890.50 6,120.00
J. 16 (89004510018)

Gate Valve Adapter 8"

Mfg/Model Kennedy Mueller No bid Kennedy or Mueller
Price/ea 62.40 70.60 73.00
Total/24 1,497.60 1,694.40 1,752.00




ITEM/QTY

Davies Water

First Supply-Oak Creek

First Supply-Madison

HD Supply Waterworks

K. 4 (89004511001)

Butterfly Valve, MJ, 12" open right

Mfg/Model

M&H 450

M&H 450

No bid

Mueller B-3211

Price/ea

755.35

1,190.10

900.00

Total/4

3,021.40

4,760.40

3,600.00

L. 1 (89004511002)

Butterfly Valve, MJ, 16" open right

Mfg/Model

M&H 450

M&H 450

No bid

Mueller B-3211

Price/ea

1,468.25

2,352.20

1,650.00

Total/1

1,468.25

2,352.20

1,650.00

M. 40 (89004501001)

Corporation Stop, 1"

Mfg/Model

McDonald 4701B

Mueller B25000

No bid

Ford FB600

Price/ea

30.15

28.90

31.00

Total/40

1,206.00

1,156.00

1,240.00

N. 10 (89004501003)

Corporation Stop, 2"

Mfg/Model

Mueller B25000

No bid

Ford FB600

Price/ea

113.95

109.10

115.00

Total/10

1,139.50

1,091.00

1,150.00

0. 20 (89003002010)

Chimney Seal 26" w/taper sleeve

Mfg/Model

Cretex 092634

No bid

Cretex 092634

Cretex 092634

Price/ea

164.00

158.00

175.00

Total/20

3,280.00

3,160.00

3,500.00

Delivery

30 days

60 days

7 days

12 days

Terms

Net

Net 30

Net 30

Net 30




