|$.

T THE CE
C‘YA NTE}‘,

M&um

7525 W. Greenfield Ave.
WEST ALLIS

West Allis, WI 53214

City of West Allis
Matter Summary

File Number Title Status

R-2009-0263 Resolution Introduced

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of Ewald Automotive Group for furnishing and
delivering three (3) vehicles for a total sum of $59,902.00 and the transferring of $59,902.00
from the Contingency Fund to the Public Works Dept Automotive Capital Account

Introduced: 12/1/2009 Controlling Body: Public Works Committees~
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Sponsor(s): Administration & Finance Committee and
Public Works Committee
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Resolution

File Number: R-2009-0263 Final Action:

DEC 0 1 2009

Sponsor(s): Administration & Finance Committee and Public Works
Committee

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of Ewald Automotive Group for furnishing and
delivering three (3) vehicles for a total sum of $59,902.00 and the transferring of $59,902.00 from
the Contingency Fund to the Public Works Dept Automotive Capital Account.

WHEREAS, The Purchasing/Central Services Division has reported that it has received a joint
proposal through V.A.L.U.E. in Local Government for furnishing and delivering vehicles for the
Public Works Department of the City of West Allis, that the proposals received as shown on the
attached bid report were reasonable; and,

WHEREAS, the ordering window is only two (2) weeks, we have to contract for these vehicles with
2009 budget, and repay the Contingency Fund from the 2010 Dept of Public Works Automotive
Capital Budget; and,

WHEREAS, The Common Council deems it to be in the best interests of the City of West Allis that
the proposal of Ewald Automotive Group be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Common Council of the City of West
Allis that the proposal submitted by Ewald Automotive Group for furnishing one (1) 2010 Ford
11250, 8,600 GVW pickup truck for $15,485.00, one (1) 2010 Ford F450, 15,000 GVW cab &
chassis for $27,683.00, and one (1) 2010 Ford E250, 8,600 GVW cargo van for $16,734.00 for a
total sum of $59,902.00 be and is hereby accepted.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Purchasing/Central Services Division be and is hereby
authorized to enter a contract for the aforesaid equipment.

PCSD2009-210

ADOPTED—~ DEC 01 2009 APPROVED |7 /4/q
A N

Payé/l\/l‘ fiehler, City AA%in. Officer, Clerk/Treas. Dan Devine, Mayor
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d below

Pickup, 8600 GVW, 4x2 and dx4 as specif
Bed Size as specified below

L& Truck Ces Stumpf Neuville
Item # Description Qty UOM | Badger Truck Bob Fish Ewald Chevy | Ewald Chrysler | Ewald's Ford Holz Motors Center Ford Chrysler Van Horn Chevy
Pickup, 8600 GVW, 4x4, Long Bed. Price to include: Tilt
Steering, Power Windows, Power Locks, Trailer/Tow Mirrors.
Power, Mud Flaps-Front & Rear, Auto Locking Front Hub,
Extra Keys (3), Trailer Package Less Hitch Receiver,
Limited Slip/Posi-Traction/Locking Differential, Plow 2010 $20990 ,
23 Package 2 Each| § 2150617 | § 23,002.00 $22,548.00 $21,733.00|2011 §21629 $22,946.00 $21,602.00 NO BID NOBID | § 25,662.80
SUBTOTAL] $ 43,012.34 [ § 46,004.00 | § 45,096.00 | § 43,466.00 $41,980.00{ $ 45,892.00 | $ 43,204.00 $ 51,325.60
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each Included -$74.80
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each Included $85.00 -$88.00
2010
($22,145.17 -
2011) - Ford GMC Sierra CHEVY Chev/Silverado/C! Silverado
Make/Model Number F250 F2B TK20903 CK20903 DJ7L62 FORD F2B K20803 FORD F250 2500HD K20903
3 yr/36000
Basic 3 BASIC BASIC 3-yr/36000 bumper-to-
Yr./36,000 - 3YR/36000 Basic 3 yr/36000 (3YR/36000, bumper to bumper - 5
Powertrain 5 DRIVETRAIN mile, Pwr 5 DRIVETRAIN 3yr/36000 BTB- [bumper plus 5- yr/100000
Warranty Yr./60,000 3 Yr./36,000 5YR/100000 yr/100000 mile  |5YR/60000 S5yr/100000 PT _ |yr/60000 powertrain
Deliver to: Waukesha County (Internal Note:
P31066/P32072) $25 per vel
MIRRORS ARE Price quoted for
POWER & model year 2010
HEATED, BUT only. Model year
. Cannot delete NOT TRAILER 2011 price is
COMMENTS: hitch receiver TOW $22241
Pickup, 8600 GVW, 4x2, Long Bed. Price to include:
Trailer/Tow Mirrors Manual, Mud Flaps Front & Rear, Extra 1
Keys (2), Sliding Rear Window, Bed liner Insert Over Rail, 2010 $15485, \

24 1 Each| § 16.099.17 | § 19.486.00 $19,368.00 $18,880.00/2011 $17877 $19,952.00 $15,864.00 NO BID NOBID [ § 21,962.80
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each Included u -$74.80
Delete XM Radio only, if i Each Included $85.00 -$88.00

2010
($21,491.17 -
2011) - Ford GMC Sierra CHEVY Chev/Silverado/C Silverado 2500
Make/Model Number F250 F2A TC20903 CC20303 DODGE DJ2L62 |[FORD F2A C20803 FORD F250 C20903
3 yr/36000
Basic 3 BASIC BASIC 3-yr/36000 bumper-to-
Yr./36,000 - 3YR/36000 Basic 3 yr/36000 [3YR/36000, bumper to bumper - 5
_ Powertrain 5 DRIVETRAIN mile, Pwr 5 DRIVETRAIN 3yr/36000 BTB- |bumper plus 5- yr/100000
Warranty Yr./60,000 3 Yr./36,000 5YR/100000 yr/100000 mile  |5YR/60000 S5yr/100000 PT _ |yr/60000 . powertrain
.|Deliver to: City of West Allis $25 per vehicle
Under rail
bedliner insert.
Price quoted for
model year 2010
9 SLIDING REAR only. Model year
WINDOW IS 2011 price
COMMENTS: NOT AVAILABLE $18256
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Cabl/Chassis, GVW and CI/A Rating
As specified below

L &S Truck Ces Stumpf Neuville
Item # Description Qty |UOM | Badger Truck Bob Fish Ewald Chevy | Ewald Chrysler| Ewald's Ford Holz Motors Center Ford Chrysler Van Horn Chevy
Cab & Chassis, 11000 GVW, 4x4, Diesel, 60" Cab/Axle.
Price to include: Power Windows, Power Locks, Trailer/Tow
Mirrors-Power, Off-Road Package, HD Package, Plow 2010 $26730,
33 Package, Extra Keys (3), Allison Transmission 1 Each| § 27,288.97 NO BID NO BID $32,038.00|12011 $29863 NO BID $26,775.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each
2010 ($30,421.97
-2011) - Ford
Make/Model Number| F350 F3H DODGE FORD F3H FORD F350
3-yr/36000
BASIC bumper to
3YR/36000, bumper plus 5-
Basic 3 DRIVETRAIN yr/60000
Yr./36,000 - Basic 3 yr/36000 [5YR/60000 powertrain plus
Powertrain § mile, Pwr 5 DIESEL- 5/yr100000 $100
Warranty Yr./60,000 yr/100000 mile  |5YR/100000 deductible engine
Deliver to: Waukesha County (Internal Note: P23386)
Off road package
and Allison
transmission not
available. Price
quoted for model
ALLISON ALLISON year 2010 only.
Allison Trans. TRANS. NOT TRANSMISSION Model year 2011
COMMENTS: N/A AVAILABLE NOT AVAILABLE price is $29908
Cab & Chassis, 15000 GVW, 4x2, Diesel, 60" C/A. Price to
r/Tow Mirrors Manual, HD Package, Back up
Alarm Electric 87 dba mounted away from road splash, Extra
Keys (2), Dual Batteries DEDUCT 2010 $27683 ,
34 AIR CONDITIONING 2 Each| § 28,221.82 NO BID NO BID $30,350.00/{2011 $30598 No Bid $27,728.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SUBTOTAL| $ 56,443.64 $ 60,700.00 $55,366.00 $ 55,456.00
2010 ($31,136.82
-2011) - Ford
Make/Model Number: F450 F4G DODGE DMA4L63|FORD F4G Ford F450
3-yr/36000
BASIC bumper to
3YR/36000, bumper plus 5-
Basic 3 DRIVETRAIN yr/60000
Yr./36,000 - Basic 3 yr/36000 |5YR/60000 powertrain plus
Powertrain 5 mile, Pwr 5 DIESEL- 5/yr100000 $100
Warranty Yr./60,000 yr/100000 mi 5YR/100000 deductible engine

Deliver to: City of West Allis

COMMENTS:

Price quoted for
model year 2010
only. Model year
2011 price is

$30642
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Van, Cargo, 8600 GVW, 4x2
Standard Length unless otherwise specified

L & S Truck Les Stumpf Neuville
Item # Description Qty |UOM | Badger Truck Bob Fish Ewald Chevy | Ewald Chrysler| Ewald's Ford Holz Motors Center Ford Chrysler Van Horn Chevy
Van, Cargo, 8600 GVW, 4x2, Glass in Rear Only. Price to
include: Sliding Side Door in lieu of double, Trailer Package,
Power Windows/Locks, Power Mirrors, Power Seat, Extra
57 Keys (3), Galvanized Roof Rack 1 Each| § 17,484.84 | $ 18,431.00 $18,536.00 NO BID $17,895.00 $18,181.00 $18,597.00 NO BID NOBID | $ 20,175.00
| Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each N/A N/A
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each N/A N/A
Ford E250 Cargo|GMC Savana CHEVY Chev/Express/C Express Cargo
) Make/Model Number Van E2E TG23405 CG23405 FORD E2E G23405 Ford E250 Van CG23405
3-yr/36000 3 yr/36000
Basic 3 BASIC BASIC bumper to bumper-to-
Yr./36,000 - 3YR/36000 3YR/36000, bumper plus 5- bumper - 5
Powertrain 5 DRIVETRAIN DRIVETRAIN 3yr/36000 BTB- |yr/60000 yr/100000
Warranty Yr./60,000 3 Yr./36,000 5YR/100000 5YR/60000 5yr/100000 PT  [powertrain powertrain
Deliver to: Waukesha County (Internal Note: P20010) $25 per vehicle
COMMENTS:
Van, Cargo, 8600 GVW, 4x2, Standard Length, Glass in
Side and Rear Doors. Price to include: Trailer Package,
58 Mud Flaps-Front/Rear DEDUCT AIR CONDITIONING 1 Each| § 17,046.84 | $ 17,103.00 $16,946.00 NO BID $16,734.00 $16,919.00 $17,088.00 NO BID NOBID | § 18,925.00
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each N/A N/A
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each N/A N/A
Ford E250 Cargo|GMC Savana CHEVY Chev/Express/C Express Cargo
Make/Model Number Van E2E TG23405 CG23405 FORD E2E G23405 Ford E250 Van CG23405
3-yr/36000 3 yr/36000
Basic 3 BASIC BASIC bumper to bumper-to-
Yr./36,000 - 3YR/36000 3YR/36000, bumper plus 5- bumper - 5
Powertrain 5 DRIVETRAIN DRIVETRAIN 3yr/36000 BTB- |yr/60000 yr/100000
Warranty Yr./60,000 3 Yr./36,000 5YR/100000 5YR/60000 5yr/100000 PT |powertrain powertrain

Deliver to: City of West Allis

$25 per vehicle

COMMENTS:
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WEST ALLIS CITY OF-LEGALS
CLERK/TREASURER'S OFFICE
7525 W GREENFIELD AVE

West Allis, WI 53214

Lisa Wisniewski hereby states that she 1is authorized by Journal
Sentinel Inc. to certify on behalf of Journal Sentinel Inc., publisher
of Community Newspapers, public newspapers of general circulation,
printed and published in city and county of Milwaukee; was published

in the My Community Now- Midwest on 12/17/2009 ;that said printed copy

was taken from said printed newspaper(s).

Lisa Wisniewskil

State of Wisconsin )
) SS:
County of Milwaukee)

Subscribed and sworn before me this ,:)Sth day of ()PLQJ“\“iJ ,20009.

FBrUOxTu¢x €§c§§Q
[5)

Notary Public State of Wisconsin

My Commission Expires S~ ~1/




NOTICE OF BUDGET
APPROPRIATION CHANGES
City of West Allis

-On December 1, 2009, the Com-
mon Council of the City of West
- Allis met at City Hall, 7525 West
Greenfield Avenue, and ap-
proved an appropriation change
to the 2009 City Budget. The ac-
tion was as follows: :

1. Transfer $59,902 from the
City’s Contingency Fund to the
Public Works Department Auto-
motive Capital Account for pur-
chasing three (3) vehicles- from.
Ewald Automotive Group (funds
to be paid back to the contin-
gency Fund in 2010 from budget-

_ed funds).

- Questions by the public in re-
gard to these changes may be
directed to the City Administra;
tive Office at City Hall. &
Published: -December 17, 2009




