

City of West Allis  
 Tabulation  
 RFQ #3349 Lamps  
 October 28, 2013

Item	Qty	Crescent Electric	Grainger Industrial	Graybar Electric	Neher Electric	Werner Electric
A. Lamp, Metal Halide, Pulse Start, 70W, 70/U/ED28/PS, or Ventura 16017 or equal	24	30.85	No bid	Venture 16017 25.44	Venture ED28 24.00 Sylvania ED17 15.75	Venture MH70W/U/ED28/PS 22.75
Total/24		740.40		610.56	576.00/ 378.00	546.00
B. Lamp, Compact Fluorescent, CF32DT/E/IN/841/ECO or equal	12	4.90	No bid	GE F32TBX/841/ECO 4.88	3.00	Philips PLT32W/41/4P/ALTOCFL 6.29
Total/12		58.80		58.56	36.00	75.48
C. Lamp, T6, Metal Halide, 150W, CMH150TU/830/G12 or equal	8	40.49	SHB82 CMH150TU/830/G12 60.00	GE 33.00	16.95	Philips CDM150/T6/1830150W 23.96
Total/8		323.92	480.00	264.00	135.60	191.68
D. Lamp, Frosted, 60W, 130V Philips 60A or Equal	48	0.37	Luma Pro #2CVXI 12.87/24	GE57A/130V .32	0.29	Philips 60A130V Frosted .30
Total/48		17.76	25.74	15.36	13.92	14.40
E. Lamp, Frosted, 300W Medium Base, Philips 300M99-130V PS25 or equal	12	2.69	No bid	GE 300M/IF/130V 1.93	2.45	Philips 300M 120/130V 1.82
Total/12		32.28		23.16	29.40	21.84
F. Lamp, Flood, Compact, 23W, 120V, Par 38, Medium Base TCP1P3823 or equal	12	12.05	No bid	TCP1P3823 7.94	6.25	Philips EL/APAR38 23W 8.23
Total/12		144.60		95.28	75.00	98.76
G. Lamp, 32W, 48" T8, 3500K F32T8/TL735/ALTO or Equal	36	2.33	No bid	GE F32T8SP35/ECO 1.56	1.15	Philips F32T8/TL735/ALTO 1.65
Total/36		83.88		56.16	41.40	59.40
H. Lamp, Metal Halide 100W, HID MH100/U/MED or Equal	12	17.80	1E674 MVR100/U/MED 17.05	GE MVR100/U/MED 15.75	13.00	Philips MHC100/U/M/4K 17.81
Total/12		213.60	204.60	189.00	156.00	213.72

Item	Qty	Crescent Electric	Grainger Industrial	Graybar Electric	Neher Electric	Werner Electric
I. Lamp, Low Pressure Sodium, 55W, SOX55 or Equal	936	No bid	No bid	Philips 28.50	19.25	Philips SOX55 25.70
Total/936				26676.00	18018.00	24055.20
J. Lamp, Low Pressure sodium, 35W SOX35 or Equal	264	obsolete	No bid	Philips 23.50	18.50	Philips SOX35 24.57
Total/264				6204.00	4884.00	6486.48
K. Lamp, High Pressure Sodium, Lumulux 250W, GE LU250/H/ECO or Equal	172	8.50	3APT5 LU250/H/ECO 10.04	GE LU250/H/ECO 7.44	6.75	Philips C250S50/ALTO 14.17
Total/172		1462.00	1726.88	1279.68	1161.00	2437.24
L. Lamp, High Pressure Sodium, Lumulux 150W, GE LU150/55/ECO or Equal	756	10.90	2VAD7 LU150/55/ECO 10.24	GE LU150/55/ECO 6.64	6.50	Philips C150S55/ALTO 8.44
Total/756		8240.40	7741.44	5019.84	4914.00	6380.64
M. Lamp, Metal Halide, Pulse Start 250W, Sylvania MS250PS or Equal	36	33.55	4PL07 GE MVR250/VBU/PA 34.89	GE MVR250/VBU/PA 19.57	17.50	Philips MS250UPS 16.56
Total/36		1207.80	1256.04	704.52	630.00	596.16
N. Lamp, High Pressure Sodium, Lumulux 50W, GE LU50/H/ECO or Equal	120	11.65	1C292 LU50/H/ECO 13.20	GE LU50/H/ECO 6.76	6.35	Philips C50S68/ALTO 8.44
Total/120		1398.00	1584.00	811.20	762.00	1012.80
O. Lamp, High Pressure Sodium, Lumulux70W, GE LU70/H/ECO or Equal	300	11.60	2VAD4 LU70/H/ECO 11.74	GE LU70/H/ECO 6.76	6.35	Philips C70S62/ALTO 14.78
Total/300		3480.00	3522.00	2028.00	1905.00	4434.00
P. Lamp, High Pressure Sodium, Lumulux100W, GE LU100/H/ECO or Equal	24	10.90	2VAD5 LU100/H/ECO 10.24	GE LU100/H/ECO 6.38	6.35	Philips C100S54/ALTO 14.17
Total/24		261.60	245.76	153.12	152.40	340.08
Q. Lamp, Quartz, Halogen, 300W, 120W, GE Q300T3 or Equal	12	1.60	2V529 Q300T3 2.59	GE Q300T3 2.62	3.50 Import .90	Philips BC300T3Q/CL 14.72
Total/12		19.20	31.08	31.44	42.00/10.80	176.64

