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Matter Summary
File Number Title
R-2011-0055 Resolution Introduced

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of various suppliers for furnishing and delivering

chimney seals, valves, water boxes and extensions for a total sum 0f$157,510.47.

Introduced: 3/15/2011
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WEST ALLIS West Allis, W1 53214
Resolution

File Number: R-2011-0055 Final Action:
 MAR 15-2011

Sponsor(s): Public Works Committee

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of various suppliers for furnishing and delivering
chimney seals, valves, water boxes and extensions for a total sum of $157,510.47.

WHEREAS, The Purchasing/Central Services Division has reported that it duly advertised a request
for proposal for furnishing and delivering chimney seals, valves, water boxes, extensions and
various related hardware for the Public Works Department of the City of West Allis, that the
proposals received as shown on the attached bid report were reasonable; and,

WHEREAS, The Common Council deems it to be in the best interests of the City of West Allis that
the proposals of Ferguson Waterworks, First Supply-Milwaukee and HD Supply Waterworks be
accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Common Council of the City of West
Allis that the proposal dated March 7, 2011 submitted by Ferguson Waterworks for furnishing
chimney seals, gate valves and corporation stops in the amount of $65,696.55; the proposal dated
March 7, 2011 submitted by First Supply-Milwaukee for furnishing curb box extensions and gate
valves in the amount of $87,196.99 and the proposal dated March 5, 2011 submitted by HD Supply
Waterworks for furnishing butterfly valves in the amount of $4,616.93 for the total net sum of
$157,510.47 in accordance with City of West Allis RFP #1121 be and is hereby accepted.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Purchasing/Central Services Division be and is hereby
authorized to enter into contracts for the aforesaid materials.

PCSD1121

apoPTED  MAR 15 2011 APPROVED Bﬁg/"

Paul' M. Ziehler, City Aq;‘n/{n. Officer, Clerk/Treas. 4 Dan Devine, Mayor
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BID TABULATION
RFP #1121
Water Valves & Accessories
Due: 3/8/11, 10:00 AM

ITEM/QTY Ferguson Waterworks First Supply LLC HD Supply Waterworks
A. (50) 890 030 00001

Chimney Seal 7" x 26" extension

[Mfg/Model Cretex 092637 Cretex 092637 Cretex 092637
Price each 65.00 97.06 78.00
Total/50 3250.00 4852.50 3900.00

B. (50) 880 030 00002

Chimney Seal 10" x 26" extension

[Mfg/Model Cretex 092638 Cretex 092638 Cretex 092638
Price each 65.00 106.40 81.00
Total/50 3250.00 5320.00 4050.00

C. (150) 890 030 02010

Chimney Seal 26" taper, type T1

[Mfg/Model Cretex 092634 Cretex 092634 Cretex 092634
Price each 114.25 168.30 131.00
Total/150 17137.50 25245.00 19650.00

D. (261) 890 040 14003

Curb box bottom section 21"

Tyler 21B Tyler 21B Tyler 21B Tyler 21B
Price each 18.15 17.80 17.98
Total/261 4737.15 4645.80 4692.78

E. (24) 830 040 14004

Curb box extension, 9"

Tyler #151 Tyler #151 Tyler #151 Tyler #151
Price each 15.90 15.60 15.80
Total/i24 381.60 374.40 379.20

F. (24) 890 040 14005

Curb box extention 16"

Tyler #152 Tyler #152 Tyler #152 Tyler #1562
Price each 18.20 17.80 17.80
Total/24 . 436.80 427.20 427.20

G. (206) 830 040 14007

Curb box top section 30" w/lid & bolt

Tyler 30T Tyler 30T Tyler 30T Tyler 30T
Price each 29.70 29.70 29.80
Total/206 6118.20 6118.20 6138.80




ITEM/QTY Ferguson Waterworks First Supply LLC HD Supply Waterworks
H. (2) 890 040 14009

Curb box top, 12" wilid & bolt

Tyler #12T Tyler #12T Tyler #12T Tyler #12T
Price each 19.00 16.30 16.40
Total/2 38.00 32.60 32.80

I. (10) 830 040 14011 '

Curb box top 18", w/lid & bolt

Tyler #18T Tyler #18T Tyler #18T Tyler #18T
Price each 24.80 17.80 23.30
Tota/10 248.00 178.00 233.00
J. (2) 890 040 14014

Valve Box Base, #4

Tyler #4 Tyler #4 Tyler #4 Tyler #4
Price each 39.25 36.35 37.00
Total/2 78.50 72.70 74.00

K. (200) 880 040 14016

Curb box extension 30"

Tyler #154 Tyler #154 Tyler #154 Tyler #154
Price each 26.70 26.75 26.80
Total/200 5340.00 5350.00 5360.00
L. (173) 830 040 15002

Valve box top 26"

Tyler #26T Tyler #26T Tyler #26T Tyler #26T
Price each 50.15 51.20 51.80
Total/173 8675.95 8857.60 8961.40
M. (143) 890 040 15003

Valve box bottom section 36"

Tyler #36B Tyler #36B Tyler #368 Tyler #36B
Price each 51.60 49.70 52.80
Total/143 7378.80 7107.10 7550.40
N. (130) 830 040 15004

Valve box base #6

Tyler #6-600X Tyler #6-600X Tyler #6-600X Tyler #6-600X
Price each 44.35 45.25 45.80
Total/130 5765.50 5882.50 5954.00
O. (55) 830 040 15013

Valve box extension 14"

Tyler #58 Tyler #58 Tyler #58

Price each 33.45 40.10 34.40
Total/55 1839.75 2205.50 1892.00




ITEM/QTY

Ferguson Waterworks

First Supply LLC

HD Supply Waterworks

P. (8) 890 040 15009

Valve Box Extension 24"

Tyler #60 Tyler #60 Tyler #60

Price each 45.60 42.30 42.90
Total/8 364.80 338.40 343.20
Q. (193) 830 040 17001

Valve box lid, 5-1/4"

Tyler MWW 600-6 Tyler MWW600-6 Tyler MWW600-6

Price each 12.60 13.15 12.70
Total/193 2431.80 2537.95 2451.10

R. (100) 890 045 00010

Coupler, Lead-Pak, 3/4" XS Lead
X1" CTS-PJ

[ Mfg/Model McDonald 4758-22-67 McDonald 4758-22-67 Ford 390710-Q2434
Price each 25.45 29.50 25.90
Total/100 2545.00 2950.00 2580.00
S. (32) 880 045 18001

Coupler, Lead-Pak, 3/4" CTS x XS

[ Mfg/Model McDonald 4758-22-67 McDonald 4758-22-67 Ford
Price each 19.80 20.60 20.80
Total/32 633.60 659.20 665.60

T. (28) 880 045 18006

Couler, Lead-Pak, 3/4" XS

[ Mfg/Model McDonald 4753-67 McDonald 4753-67 Ford Q28-33
Price each 14.40 16.60 15.00
Total/28 403.20 464.80 420.00

U. (2) 880 045 18012

Coupler, Straight 5/8 x 3/4 Threaded/Flare

Mfg/Model Ford
Price each No bid No bid 12.00
Total/2 24.00

V. (7) 890 045 00018

Union Compression, 1-1/4" 3-pt

 Mfg/Mcdel Mueller H-15480 Ford
Price each No bid 30.40 18.99
Total/7 212.80 132.93
W. (4) 880 045 00038

Mechanical Joint Restraint, 8" oversized

| Mfg/Model Megalug 110800X Megalug 110800X
Price each 52.00 41.36 46.00
Total/4 208.00 165.44 184.00




ITEM/QTY Ferguson Waterworks First Supply LLC HD Supply Waterworks
X. (10) 830 045 00081

| Piggyback Nut, 1.5"x1.25"

[Mfg/Model McDonald 4755 Ford C02-45
Price each No bid 37.15 23.50
Total/10 371.50 235.00

Y. (2) 880 045 02011

Union Compression pipe, 3/4" 3-pt

Mfg/Model McDonald M4758QF Mueller H-15403 Ford
Price each 9.70 10.75 10.40
Total/2 19.40 21.50 20.80

Z. (3) 830 045 03006

3/4" Curb Stop, Flare-Flare

| Mfg/Model McDonald 6100-F Mueller B25204 Ford B22-333
Price each 35.60 38.80 36.00
Total/3 106.80 116.40 108.00
Aa. (15) 880 045 02001

1" Curb Stop, Flare-Flare

| Mfg/Model McDonald 6100 Mueller B25204 Ford
Price each 48.15 53.25 49.80
Total/15 722.25 798.75 747.00
Bb. (166) 890 045 01001

Corporation Stop 1"

| Mfg/Model McDonald 4701B Mueller B-25000 Ford FB600-4
Price each 30.30 33.85 32.40
Total/166 5029.80 5619.10 5378.40
Cc. (2) 890 045 01002

Corporation Stop 1-1/2"

| Mfg/Model McDonald 47018 Mueller B25000 Ford FB600-6
Price each 69.25 72.05 71.00
Total/2 138.50 144.10 142.00
Dd. (2) 890 045 01003

Corporation Stop, 2"

[Mfg/Model McDonald 47018 Mueller B25000 Ford FB600
Price each 118.40 125.10 123.80
Total/2 236.80 250.20 247.60
Ee. (5) 830 045 02002

Curb stop 1-1/2", flare-flare

|Mfg/Model Mueller B25204 Ford B22-666
Price each 107.00 116.95 111.00
Total/5 535.00 584.75 555.00




ITEM/QTY

Ferguson Waterworks

First Supply LLC

HD Supply Waterworks

Ff. (75) 830 045 02005

Curb stop 1", PK-joint

| Mfg/Model Mueller B25209 Ford B44-444
Price each 50.10 40.65 53.80
Total/75 3757.50 3048.75 4035.00
|Gg. (9) 890 045 04009

Tapping saddle, bronze-double strap,

w/AWWA taper thread (c.c.) 8" x 1-1/2"
| Mfg/Model McDonald 3825 Mueller BR2B0899CC Mueller BR2B0893CC
Price each 87.00 105.50 94.00
Total/9 783.00 949.50 846.00

Hh. (1) 880 045 04011

Tapping Saddle, Bronze-Double Strap,

AWWA Taper Thread (c.c) 12" x 1-1/2"
[Mfg/Model McDonald 3825 Mueller BR2B1314CC Mueller BR2B1314CC
Price each 139.40 160.15 161.00
Total/1 139.40 160.15 161.00

li. (3) 890 045 04015

Tapping saddle, bronze-double strap,

wW/AWWA taper thread (c.c.) 8"x 2"
|Mfg/Model McDonald 3825 Mueller BR2B0899CC Mueller BR2B089SCC
Price each 97.70 97.90 103.00
Total/3 293.10 293.70 309.00

Jj. (72 ft) 890 045 07004

Ductile Iron Pipe, 6" Class 53, Cement

Lined, 18 Or 20 ft sections

Mfg/Model Clow Pipe USP6CL5318 Griffin
Price each 16.12' 14.55' 15.70'
Total/72 ft 1160.64 1047.60 1130.40

Kk. (2) 880 045 10003

Stainless Steel Repair Clemp, 6" x 20"

Romac §S1-7.24x20

Price each 152.00 No bid 160.00
Totall2 304.00 320.00

LI. (71) 830 045 10003

Gate valve, 6", R/S. open-right, MJ,

over-sized cut-in, wihardware

Kennedy 1571X or

Mfg/Model Clow F6111 Mueller F6111 Mueller C-2360
Price each 862.00 735.00 774.00
Total/71 61202.00 52185.00 54954.00
Mm (12) 830 045 10004

Gate valve 8", R/S, open right, MJ,

over-sized cut-in, w/hardware
|Mfg/Model Clow F6111 Mueller C-2360

Price each 1266.00 1142.55 1164.00
Total/12 15192.00 13710.60 13968.00




ITEM/QTY Ferguson Waterworks First Supply LLC HD Supply Waterworks
Nn. (5) 830 045 11001
12" Butterfly valve, MJ open right,
w'hardware

Mueller 3211-20 or
[ Mfg/Model Clow Mueller 3211-20 M&H 450
Price each 966.00 882.15 845.00
Total/5 4830.00 4410.75 4225.00
Qo. (12) 890 045 00034
24" Butterfly valve, MJ, open right,
w/adapter & hardware

Mueller 3211-20 or
[ Mfg/Model Clow Mueller 3211-20 M&H 450
Price each 3617.00 3445.00 3339.00
Total/12 43404.00 41.340.00 40068.00
Pp (1) 830 045 11010
Adapter for 12" butterfly valve
Mfg/Model ADI12BTY Adaptor Inc
Price each 82.00 77.75 80.00
Total/1 82.00 77.75 80.00
Qq. (1) 830 045 10016
Adapter for 6" gate valve
[Mfg/Model ADI6MUC Adaptor Inc
Price each 72.25 68.50 71.00
Total/1 72.25 68.50 71.00
Rr (1) 890 045 10018
Adaper for 8" gate valve
[Mfg/Model ADISMUE Adaptor Inc
Price each 73.50 69.60 72.00
Total/1 73.50 69.60 72.00
Delivery 30 days 21 days 21 days
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Credit Card Payment Accepted Yes Yes Yes




