BID
ITEM
LETTER

O O O W T m

. . Midwest Arborist Site-one, Matt Tree Forestry |Sherrill
Item | Qty | U/M Description Bartlett Arbotist Supply Supply, Todd Haefke McCarroll Stuff Supplie)r/s Tree
perunit | extended | perunit | extended | perunit | extended per unit per unit
A 99 |Pkg [#070-0155 Arborjet Arbor Plugs #4 3/8”, 100/pkg $45.00 | $4,455.00 | $40.05 | $3,964.95 | $40.05 | $3,964.95
B |8 |Btl |#030-2030 Arborjet Clean-jet cleaner and lubricant, 1 liter/bottle $9.60 $76.80 $7.05 $56.39 $10.14 $81.12
C |104 |Btl |#040-4100 Arborjet Tree-age Insecticide, 1 liters $416.00 | $43,264.00| $439.66 | $45,724.64 | $439.65 | $45,723.60
D |6 |Btl |#040-6300 Arborjet Propizol Insecticide, 1 liters $60.00 $360.00 $59.18 $355.06 $59.17 $355.02
E |1 |Btl ]#040-2003 Arborjet IMA-jet Insecticide, 1 liters $250.00 | $250.00 | $252.80 | $252.80 | $252.80 | $252.80 no bid,
H |1 |Pkg |#070-0501 Arborjet Quick-jet Air Viper Needles, 4/pkg no bid no bid $27.06 $27.06 $27.05 $27.05 no bid unable to no bid
total $48,405.80 total $50,353.84 total $50,377.49 get these
awarded | $43,514.00| awarded $56.39 awarded | $4,319.97 | $47,890.36 items
_$1,594.40 $3,188.80 | $1,685.08 | $3,370.16 | $1,685.08 | $3,370.16
$16.00 $32.00 $16.91 $33.82 $16.91 $33.82
total $3,220.80 total $3,403.98 total $3,403.98
awarded  $3,220.80 awarded $0.00 awarded $0.00

Total not to exceed $50,566.
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