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Matter Summary
File Number Title
R-2009-0021 Resolution

In Committee

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of Ewald Automotive Group and Badger Truck for
furnishing and delivering seven (7) vehicles for a total sum of $119,040.78.

Introduced: 1/20/2009

Sponsor(s): Public Works Committee

Controlling Body: Public Works Committee
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Resolution
File Number: R-2009-0021 Final Action:
Sponsor(s): Public Works Committee JAN 2 O 2009

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of Ewald Automotive Group and Badger Truck for
furnishing and delivering seven (7) vehicles for a total sum of $119,040.78.

WHEREAS, The Purchasing/Central Services Division has reported that it has received a joint
proposal through V.A.L.U.E. in Local Government for furnishing and delivering vehicles for the
Fire and Public Works Department of the City of West Allis, that the proposals received as shown
on the attached bid report were reasonable; and,

WHEREAS, The Common Council deems it to be in the best interests of the City of West Allis that
the proposals of Ewald Automotive Group and Badger Truck be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Common Council of the City of West
Allis that the proposals submitted by Ewald Hartford Ford for three (3) Ford F250 8600 GVW, 4x2
long bed pickups for $48,057.00 and one (1) Ford F350 11000 GVW Cab & Chassis for $17,954.00;
Ewald Chrysler for one (1) DH7L.42 8600 GVW, 4x2 Crew Cab, long bed pickup for $18,929.00;
and Badger Truck for two (2) Ford Escape 4000 GVW 4x4 SUV's for $34,100.78 for a total net sum
0f $119,040.78 be and is hereby accepted.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Purchasing/Central Services Division be and is hereby
authorized to enter into a contract for the aforesaid equipment.
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Paul M. Ziehler, Cit§’ Admin. Officer, Clerk/Treas. > Dan Devine, Mayor
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Pickup, 8600 GVW, 4x2 and 4x4 as specified below
Bed Size as specified below

Ewald's Temay
ltem # |Description Qty |UOM | Badger Truck Bob Fish Ewald Chevy | Ewald Chrysler| Hartford Ford | Holz Motors Autogroup
Pickup, 86060 GVW, 4x4, Long Bed, Largest V-8/V-10. i
Price to include: Air Condilioning, 4 wheel ABS, Limited Slip
(posi-traction) differential, tilt steering, power windows, power i
22|locks, auto locking front hub. Each | $§  25,534.69 |$ 2099600 |% 20,769.00 | $ 22,139.00{$  20,785.00 NO BID
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each 3 (68.00) $ (68.00)
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each $ (120.00)
CHEV
Chevy Silverado |Dodge Ram SILVERADO
Make/Model Number Ford F250 CK20803 2500 DH7H62 Ford F250 F21 |CK20803
N 3 yr./36,000 ;
. Bumper to Basic 3 Basic 3 Basic 3 36mo/36000mile
' Bumper /5§ . . |yr./36,000/ yr./36,000 / yr./36,000 / bumper-bumper
yr./60,000 Power| ‘| Powertrain § Powertrain 3 Powertrain 5 5y/100000mile
Warranty Train "yr./100,000 yr./36,000 yr./60,000 power train
DELIVERY
Deliver to: Waukesha County (Internal Note: F731) INCLUDED
Includes Roof
Light/Side
Step/Back up KRR
Alarm/Spray-in  |Price quoted is
Bediiner/Upfit  [without OnStar:
COMMENTS: swilches/V-10  |and XM Radio "
Pickup, 8600 GVW, 4x2, Long Bed. Price to include:
Trailer/Tow Mirrors Manual, Mud Flaps Front & Rear, Extra
Keys (2), Sliding Rear Window, Bed liner Insert Over Rail, L
23| Trailer Package. Delete Adir Conditioning. 3Each | $ 2059669]|% 17727.00|$ 1857700]% 17.986.00($  ~16,01900]$  18,349.00 NO BID
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each 3 (68.00) 18 (68.00)
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each $ (120.00) i
: -} CHEV
Chevy Silverado |Dodge Ram il - |SILVERADO
Make/Model Number Ford F250 GMC TC20903 |CC20803 2500 DH7L62  |Ford F250 F20 |CC20803
3yr./36,000 [
Bumper to Basic 3 Basic 3 Basic3 - -|36mo/36000mile
Bumper /5 yr./36,000 / yr./36,000 / yr:/36,000/.:" " {bumper-bumper
yr./60,000 Power Powertrain 5 Powertrain 3 Powertrain 5. .- '|5y/100000mile
Warranty Train 3 /36,000 yr./100,000 yr./36,000 yr./60,000 - |power train
- “or 7. | DELIVERY
Deliver to: City of West Allis .7 |INCLUDED
Includes Roof
Light/Side
Step/Back up
Alarm/Spray-in
COMMENTS: Bedliner No Air Delete
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Pickup, 8600 GVW, 4x2 and 4x4 as specified below

Bed Size as specified below
Ewald's Temay
Item # Description Qty |uom Badger Truck Bob Fish Ewald Chevy | Ewald Chrysler| Hartford Ford Holz Motors Autogroup
Pickup, 8600 GVW, 4x2, Crew/Quad Cab, Long Bed.
Price to include: Traiter/Tow Mirrors Manual, Mud Fiaps
Front & Rear, Extra Keys (2), Sliding Rear Window, Bed liner
24jInsert Over Rail, Trailer Package. Delete Air Conditioning. 1|Each | $ 21,455.69 | $ 20,992.00 [ $ 21,821.00 19,886.00 | $ 21,543.00 NO BID
Delete OnStar only, if applicable $ (68.00) 3 (68.00)
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable 3 (120.00)
CHEV
SILVERADO
Make/Model Number Ford F250 GMC TC20943 |CC20943 Ford F250 W20 |CC20943
3 yr./36,000 ) :
Bumper to Basic 3 Basic3 Basic 3 36mo/36000mile
Bumper /5 yr./36,000 / yr:/36,000 / yr./36,000 / bumper-bumper
yr./60,0600 Power Powertrain 5 Powertrain 3 Powertrain 5 5y/100000mile
Warranty Train 3 /36,000 yr./100,000 yr./36,000 yr./60,000 power train
DELIVERY
Deliver to: City of West Allls INCLUDED
Includes Roof
Light/Side
Step/Back up Air conditioning |Air conditioning
Alarm/Spray-in  |delete is not delete is not NO AIR
COMMENTS: Bedliner available available DELETE
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Cab/Chassis, GVW and C/A Rating
As specified below

Ewald's Temay
Item # |Description Qty |UOM | Badger Truck Bob Fish Ewald Chevy | Ewald Chrysier| Hartford Ford | Holz Motors Autogroup
Cab&Chassis, 11000 GVW, 4x2, 60" C/A. Price to include:
Trailer/Tow Mirrors Manual, Extra Keys (2), HD Package,
Mud Flaps Front, Back up Alarm Electric 87 dba mounted
33)away from road splash. Deduct Air Conditioning. Each | $ 21,887.69| 3 18,271.00 |1 $ 18,373.00 | § 18,236.00 3 18,034.00 NO BID
CHEV
Dodge Ram . |SILVERADO
Make/Model Number Ford F350 GMC TC31003 |Silverado 3500 |3500 DC3L63 CC31003

3 yr./36,000 :

Bumper to Basic 3 Basic 3 36mo/36000mile,

Bumper / 5 yr./36,000 / yr./36,000 / bumper-bumper

\ yr./60,000 Power Powertrain 5 Powertrain 3 5y/100000mile
Warranty Train 3 /36,000 yr./100,000 yr./36,000 power train
| DELIVERY

Deliver to: City of West Allis {INCLUDED

Includes Roof

Light, Ziebart

Treatment, Back To delete OnStar
COMMENTS: up Alarm deduct $68
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SUV, 4000 GVW, 4 x 4

No Award for Items #35, 36, 37 anid 38 as hybrid Escape order cut-off was in July 2008 for th

.No authorization has, ben received to begin quoting 2010 model

Ford Escape hybrid’s: ‘It is'projected that the verdors wili be able to provide 2010 prlcinlsomn'tlme"du [ o flrst g_uarler of 2009. " _
Ewald's Cemay
ltem# |Description Qty |UOM | Badger Truck Bob Fish Ewald Chevy | Ewald Chrysier| Hartford Ford | Holz Motors Autogroup
SUV, 4000 GVW, 4x4, HYBRID, Ford Escape Only. Price
to include: Cruise Control/Tilt Steering, Power
Windows/Locks, Power Mirrors, Mud Flaps FronVRear,
38{Engine Block Heater Each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each
Make/Model Number
Warranty
Deliver to: Waukesha County (Internal Note: Highway
Ops. H1 and H10)
COMMENTS:
SUV, 4000 GVW, 4x4, 4 Cylinder Engine (Escape only).
Price to include: Cruise Control/Tilt Steering, Power :
Windows/Locks, Power Mirrors, Mud Flaps Front/Rear, Extra EE
39|Keys (2) Each | $. - 17,050.38- NO BID NO BID NOBID|$  17.404.00 NO BID NO BID
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each
SR Ford Escape
Make/Model Number Ford Escape . us2
S L Basic 3
3yr./36,000° . yr./36,000 /
Bumperto ... ; Powertrain 5
Warranty Bumper yr./60,000
Deliver to: City of West Allis R
Tires are All
COMMENTS: Season
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