CITY OF WEST ALLIS
BID TABULATION

RFQ #999
LED TRAFFIC SIGNALS
OPENED: 7/29/08

ITEM | QTY [DESCRIPTION - ‘ l.eotek Electronics USA Corp TAPCO
12" Red Ball LED Traffic Signal
WA #550-081-52088
Mfg/Part # Leotek TSL-12R-LX-IL3-A1 Dialight 433-1210-003XL
A 403 |Pricel/each 35.85 34.57
Total/403 14,447.55 13,931.71
12" Amber Ball LED Traffic Signal
WA #550-081-52089
Mfg/Part # Leotek TSL-12Y-LX-IL3-A1 Dialight 433-3231-001XL
B 91 {Price/each 42.00 40.92
Total/91 3,822.00 - 3,723.72
12" Green Ball LED Traffic Signal :
WA #550-081-52070
Mig/Part # Leotek TSL-12G-LX-IL3-A1 Dialight 433-2220-001XL
C 87 |Price/each 53.76 52.37
Total/87 4,676.25 4,556.19
12" Amber Arrow LED Traffic Signal
WA #550-081-52071
Mfg/Part # Leotek TSL-12YA-LD-A1 Dialight 431-3334-901X0D
D 26 |Priceleach 3410 33.43
Total/28 886.60 869.18
12" Green Arrow LED Traffic Signal
WA #550-081-52072
|Mfg/Part # Leotek TSL-12GA-LD-A1 Dialight 432-2324-001X0D
E 28 {Priceleach 39.75 38.98
Total/26 1,033.50 1,012.96
8" Amber Ball LED Traffic Signal
WA #550-081-52066
Mig/Part # Leotek TSL-08Y-LX-IL3-A1 Dialight 433-3130-801XL
F 334 |Priceleach 30.85 29.77
Total/334 10,303.90 9,843.18
8" Green Ball LED Traffic Signal
WA #550-081-52087
Mfg/Part # Leotek TSL-08G-LX-IL3-A1 Dialight 433-2120-001XL
G 328 |Priceleach 38.70 37.48
Total/328 12,693.60 12,293.44
12" LED Pedestrian Signal, Overlay,
Hand-Filted/Person Qutlined
Mfg/Part # Lectek TP12H-HM Dialight 430-6772-001X
H 370 |Pricefeach 77.05 74.37
Total/370 28,508.50 27,516.20
Total A-H 76,371.90 73,847.28
LED Pedestrian Traffic Signal
Housing Only
[ 185 [Eagle #3A301AC11BBB10 No Bid 56.62
Total/185 10,474.70




ITEM | QTY |DESCRIPTION Leotek Electronics USA Corp TAPCO
12" Red LED Signal and Housing
#122-1101BT +LED
Mfg/Part # Eagle/Dialight 122-1101BT+LED
J 16 |Price each No Bid 131.58
Total/16 2,105.28
12-8-8, RYG LED Traffic Signals with
Housing
Eagle SA121A1C11BBB30, Part # 122-03121BT+LEDs
K 28 |Price/each No Bid 248.53
Total 28 6,958.84
12-12-12, RYG LED Traffic Signal
wiHousing
Eagle SA103A, black, vertical, Part # 122-03103BT+LEDs
L 4 |Price/each No Bid 343.44
Total/4 1,373.76
Total I-L 20,912.58
TERMS Net $1800 discount if A-L awarded
DELIVERY 45 days 4-6 weeks




