City of West Allis

RFP 1272

Electrical Wire, Conduit, Luminaires & Accessories

Open: March 26, 2015- 10:00 AM

CED Interstate Electric

Crescent Electric Supply

GexPro

Graybar Electric

MSC Industrial

Neher Electric Supply

A. (10 rls) Wire Copper, THHN,
Stranded, #10 black, 500 ft/roll

United #THHN10STR

CME 10THHNSTR BLK

Southwire or Alan Wire
THHN10STRBLK-500R

Encore 10THHNSTR BLACK

Price/roll 67.50 72.25 70.00 68.59 108.66 75.50

Total 10 rolls 675.00 722.50 700.00 685.90 1086.60 755.00

B. (10 rls) Wire, Copper, THHN,

Stranded, #10 red, 500 ft/roll United #THHN10STR CME 10THHNSTR RED THHN10STRRED-500R Encore 10THHNSTR RED
Price/roll 67.50 72.25 70.00 68.59 108.66 75.50

Total 10 rolls 675.00 722.50 700.00 685.90 1086.60 755.00

C. (4 rls) Wire, Copper, XHHW,

Stranded, #6 Black, 5,000 ft/roll United #XHHW6 CME 6XHHWSTR BLK-5000 XHHW6STRBLK Service Wire XH6BK5000
Price/roll 1700.00 1925.00 1866.80 1874.10 2702.02 1755.00

Total 4 rolls 6800.00 7700.00 7467.20 7496.40 10808.06 7020.00

D. (6 rls) Wire, Copper, XHHW,

Stranded, #6 Red, 5000 ft/roll United #XHH6 CME 6XHHWSTR RED-5000 XHHWGSTRRED Service Wire XH6RD5000
Price/roll 1700.00 1925.00 1866.80 1874.10 2702.02 1755.00

Total 6 rolls 10200.00 11550.00 11200.80 11244.60 16212.08 10530.00

E. (7 rls) Wire, Copper, XHHW,

Stranded, #6, Green, 2,500 ft/roll United #XHH6 CME 6XHHWSTR GRN-2500 XHHW6STRGRN Service Wire XH6GN2500
Price/roll 850.00 962.50 934.40 937.05 1351.01 627.50

Total 7 rolls 5950.00 6737.50 6540.80 6559.35 9457.05 6142.50

F. (200 ea) Fuse Holder, 30 Amp,

600V, In-Line LF OLEBOOAAXK Bussmann HEB-AA Bussmann HEB-AA Little Fuse LEBAA Bussmann HEB-AA
Price/each 5.25 13.50 10.96 11.47 34.29 10.20

Total 200 1050.00 2700.00 2192.00 2294.00 6858.00 2040.00

G. (300 ea) Fuses, 5 Amp, 500V,

Time-Delay LF FLQOOS5.T Bussmann FQN-5 Bussmann FQN-5 Little Fuse FLQ-5 Bussmann FQN-5
Price/each 4.25 6.55 5.33 5.67 23.33 4.95

Total 300 1275.00 1965.00 1599.00 1701.00 6999.99 1485.00

H. (300 ea) Connector, Multi-tap, 3

ports, 600V, 140-4 AWG llsco PBTS-3-4 llsco PBTS-3-4 no bid llsco PBTS-3-4 no bid
Price/each 10.25 12.60 11.87 33.94

Total 300 3075.00 3780.00 3561.00 10182.00

1. (8 ea) Circuit Breaker w/trip flag,

30A, 120/240V, 2-pole Eaton CHF230 Eaton CHF230 no bid no bid Eaton CHF230 no bid
Price/each 9.95 13.30 20.38

Total 8 79.60 106.40 163.04




CED Interstate Electric Crescent Electric Supply GexPro Graybar Electric MSC Industrial Neher Electric Supply

J. (50 ea) Luminaire, LED, 40W,
120V STR-LWY-2MB-HT-04-E-UL-SVA
525-40K CREE CREE CREE CREE CREE
Price/each 415.00 440.00 425.75 430.90 711.60 416.00
Total 50 20750.00 22000.00 21287.50 21545.00 35580.00 20800.00
K. (9 ea) Luminaire, LED, 30W,
120V STR-LWY-2S-HT-03-E-UL-SV-
700-40K CREE CREE CREE CREE CREE
Price/each 345.00 365.00 353.06 357.33 603.47 345.00
Total 9 3105.00 3285.00 3177.54 3215.97 5431.23 3105.00
L. (7000 ft) Conduit, PVC, 2",
Schedule 40, 10 ft. lengths PVC #CONO2 Allied 200PVC40 IPEX Scepter COND2 Heritage 512010
Price/ft 0.59 0.65 0.58 0.64 0.88 0.65
Total 7000 ft 4130.00 4550.00 4060.00 44380.00 6139.00 4550.00
M. (50 ea) PVC Elbow, 90 degree,
2"Dx24"R Plain End PVCE12 Carlon UA9DJ Allied 200PVC90 ELL90224R 068725 Heritage 611351
Price/each 1.50 5.83 5.76 6.60 10.79 4.75
Total 50 75.00 291.50 288.00 330.00 539.50 237.50
N. (4500 ft) Conduit, PVC, 1.5",
Schedule 40, 10 ft lengths . .

PVC COND1-1/2 Allied 112PVC40 COND1-1/2 Heritage 511510
Price/ft 0.47 0.51 0.46 0.50 0.77 0.53
Total 4500 ft 2115.00 2295.00 2070.00 2250.00 3474.00 2385.00
0. (20 ea) PVC Elbow, 90 degree,
1.5"Dx12'R Bell End PVCELL-1/2 Carlon UA9AHB Allied 112PVC90 ELL901-1/2 068424 no bid
Price/each 0.90 1.74 0.81 1.41 4.31
Total 20 18.00 34.80 16.20 28.20 86.20
P. (20 ea) PVC End Bell, 1.5" PVC BE1-1/2 Carlon E997H Allied 112PVCBE Bell END1-1/2 BE1-1/2 Heritage 610341
Price/each 1.25 1.65 1.58 1.29 3.02 1.90
Total 20 25.00 33.00 31.60 25.80 60.40 38.00
Q. (20 ea) PVC End Bell, 2" PVC BEZ Carlon E997) Allied 200PVBE Bell END2 BE2 Heritage 610342
Price/each 1.35 2.43 2.26 2.38 3.55 1.95
Total 20 27.00 48.60 45.20 47.60 71.00 39.00

i 1-28 days
Delivery X
40 days 45-60 Days 1-15 days 4-6 weeks-fixtures 1-5 days 7-45 days

Terms 1%-10 Net Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Credit Card Payment Accepted? Yes Yes Yes Yes No




