CITY OF WEST ALLIS

BID TABULATION

RFP #1194-Aluminum Street Lighting Poles
Open: April 24, 2013, 10:00 AM

Graybar Electric

Neher Electric

Traffic & Parking Control

I. (17) round tapered aluminum poles,
30' mounting height, w/twin 12' truss
arms w/ dark bronze anodized finish.

2013 Holophane
RTA30(2) 12TRUSSAZUD

2013 Flagpole

2013 Flagpole

Yr/Mfg/Model ABRFD149507 FPSLS84300-2-12-VD DBZA.WA FPSLS8430D-2-12-VD DBZA-WA
Price Each 1,776.00 1,758.25 1,829.47
Total/17 30,192 .00* 29,890.25 31,100.99
Il. (1) round aluminum pedestrian signal 2013 Holophane 2013 Holophane
pole, 9" mounting height w/green finish. (AOL29452) ZNY9T5/17CA/CSH (AOL29452)ZNY9T517CACSH
Yr/Mfg/Model AB314SBFCACSH RAL6005 no bid AB-31-3-SBFCACSH RAL6005
Total/1 1,065.65 1,109.53
l1l. (6) aluminum arm fitter, green finish. 2013 Holophane 2013 Holopane
Yr/Mfg/Model BH2F200SCA(RAL6005) no bid BHLF200SCA RAL6005
Price Each 171.70 177.87
Total/6 $1,030.20 $1,067.22
IV. (1) Cast aluminum twin cross arm for
street light pole, green finish. 2013 Holophane 2013 Holophane
Yr/Mfg/Model CAM144120331B RFD106132 no bid CAM144/2U231B RFD106132
Total/1 $1,035.35 $1,077.74
V. (1) Decorative luminaire, Holophane
Boardwalk style, dark green, 250w, MH,
pulse, 120 volt. 2013 Holophane 2013 Holophane
Yr/Mfg/Model BWYV 250PM MC RALL60053 no bid BWU 250PM MC RAL60053
Total/1 984.85 1,025.33

. Holophane 7-8 weeks
Delivery

49-63 days 10-12 weeks Flagpoles 10-12 weeks

Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Credit Card Payment Accepted? Yes No Yes

*Total including 1.45% rebate for paying with credit card = $29,754.22




