City of West Allis

RFP 1323
Electrical Wire, Conduit, Luminaires & Accessories

Open: April 25, 2016 at 2:00 PM

CED Interstate Electric Crescent Electric GexPro Millennium MSC Industrial Supply | Neher Electric Supply Werner Electric
A. (8 rls) Wire Copper, THHN, Republic Wire Republic Southwire
Stranded, #10 black, 500 ft/roll United THHN10ST Cu-Wire 148644 United Copper 68873 10-19STR-THHN-BLK Southwire 10 THHN STR BLACK 10 STR BLK
Price/roll 57.50 64.1875 58.79 61.00 80.16 65.00 61.88
Total 8 rolls 460.00 513.50 470.32 488.00 641.28 520.00 495.04
Total price with discount terms 460.91 490.08
B. (4 1ls) Wire, Copper, THHN, Republic Wire Republic Southwire
Stranded, #10 red, 500 ft/roll United THHN10ST Cu-Wire 151433 United Copper 68712 10-19STR-THHN-RED Southwire 10 THHN STR RED 10 STR RED
Price/roll 57.50 64.1875 58.79 61.00 80.16 65.00 61.88
Total 4 rolls 230.00 256.75 235.16 244.00 320.64 260.00 24750
Total price with discount terms 230.45 245.02
C. (100 ea) Connector, Multi-tap, 3
ports, 600V, 14-4 AWG Ilsco PBTS-3-4 Ilsco PBTS-3-4 No bid Ilsco PBTS-3-4 No bid No bid Ilsco PBTS-3-4
Price/ea 10.25 14.84 15.91 12.45
Total /100 1025.00 1484.00 1591.00 1245.00
Total price with discount terms 1232.55
D. (880 ft) Conduit, PVC, 3", Schedule National
40, 10 ft lengths Allied Cond 3 PVC Con 54390 National Pipe 43163 Cantex A52DA12 No bid No bid PVC 3" Sch 40
Price/ft 1.05 1.0446 1.03 0.94 0.97
Total /880 924.00 919.26 906.40 827.20 853.60
Total price with discount terms 888.27 845.06
E. (9800 ft) Conduit, PVC 2", Schedule National
40, 10 ft lengths Allied Cond 2 PVC Con 52898 National Pipe 43435 Cantex A52CA12 No bid No bid PVC 2" Sch 40
Price/ ft 0.50 0.5447 0.54 0.53 0.51
Total /9800 4900.00 9338.35 9292.00 ©194.00 4998.00
Total price with discount terms 5186.16 4948.02
F. (2 ea) Breaker, 20 amp, single pole Eaton CHF120 Eaton CHF120 No bid No bid Eaton CHF120 Eaton CHF120 Eaton CHF120
Price/ea 4.25 18.994 8.68 4.75 4.45
Total/2 3.50 37.99 17.36 9.50 8.90
Total price with discount terms 8.81
G. (3 ea) Breaker, 15 amp, single pole EatonCHF115 Eaton, CHF115 No bid No bid Eaton CHF115 Eaton CHF115 Eaton CHF115
Price/ea 4.25 18.994 8.78 4.75 4.45
Total/3 12.75 96.98 26.34 14.25 13.35
Total price with discount terms 13.21




CED Interstate Electric Crescent Electric GexPro Millennium MSC Industrial Supply | Neher Electric Supply Werner Electric
H. (210 ea) Fuse Holder, 30 amp, 600V,
in-line LF Bussmann HEB-AA Bussmann HEB-AA No bid Bussmann HEB-AA Bussmann HEB-AA Ferraz FEB-11-11
Price/ea 5.75 21.172 5.29 8.65 5.25 15.22
Total /210 1207.50 4446.12 T170.90 1816.50 110250 3196.20
Total price with discount terms 1088.68 3164.23
I. (170 ea) Fuses, 5 amp, 500V, Time-
Delay LF Bussmann FQN-5 Bussmann FQN-5 No bid Bussmann FQN-5 FNQ-S Bussmann FQN-5
Price/ea 475 10.586 3.68 6.55 3.64 11.41
Total /170 807.50 1799.62 625.60 T113.50 618.80 1939.70
Total price with discount terms 613.08 1920.30
J. (60 ea) Luminaire, LED, 40W, 120V,
STR-LWY-2S-HT-04-E-UL-SV-700-40K CREE No bid CREE No bid No bid CREE CREE
Price/ea 418.00 418.18 430.00 440.87
Total 60 25080.00 25090.80 25800.00 26452.20
Total price with discount terms 24588.98 26187.67
K. (11 ea) Luminaire, LED, 30W, 120V,
STR-LWY-2S-HT-03-E-UL-SV-700-43K CREE No bid CREE No bid No bid CREE CREE
Price/ea 357.00 356.98 367.00 376.35
Total /11 3927.00 3926.78 4037.00 4139.85
Total price with discount terms 3848.24 4098.45
L. (2 ea) Surge Protector, Secondary,
144V SQD SDSA1175 SQD SDSA1175 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Price/ea 39.00 43.585
Total/2 78.00 87.17
M. (2 ea) Contactor, 12 pole, Lighting,
TypeL SQD 8903LG1200V02 SQD 8903LG1200V02 No bid No bid SQD 8903LG1200V02 No bid No bid
Price/ea 495.00 872.642 1088.91
Total/2 990.00 174528 217782
N. (2 ea) Control Station, Switch SQD 9001KYK111 SQD 9001KYK111 No bid No bid SQD 9080GC6 No bid No bid
Price/ea 165.00 183.698 178.10
Total/2 330.00 367.40 356.20
O. (2 ea) Barrier Terminal Block, 3-
part, double row, open bottom Cinch 3-150 Bussmann TB100-03 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Price/ea 11.00 0.803
Total/2 22.00 T.61*




CED Interstate Electric Crescent Electric GexPro Millennium MSC Industrial Supply | Neher Electric Supply Werner Electric
P. (12 ea) Terminal Block, 600V, 85A,
NEMA + Options SQD 9080GC6 SQD 9080GC6 No bid No bid SQD 9080GC6 No bid No bid
Price/ea 3.00 3.038 3.853
Total/12 36.00 36.46 46.24
Q. (2 ea) Electrical Timer Switch (24
hours) Intermatic ET1105C Intermatic ET1105C Intermatic ET1105C No bid Intermatic ET1105C Intermatic ET1105C No bid
Price/ea 110.00 101.779 90.81 117.38 112.20
Total/2 220.00 203.56 181.62 234.76 22440
Total price with discount terms 177.98
R. (2 ea) Main Load Center Panel Eaton CH32B200] Eaton CH32B200] No bid No bid Eaton CH32B200] No bid Eaton CH32B200]
Price/ea 140.00 525.449 307.89 122.99
Total/2 280.00 1050.90 615.78 245.98
Total price with discount terms 243.52
S. (2 ea) Main Load Center Cover Eaton CHS8JS Eaton CHS8JS No bid No bid Eaton CHS8JS No bid Eaton CHS8]JS
Price/ea 10.00 89.166 46.21 25.38
Total/2 20.00 178.33 9242 50.76
Total price with discount terms 50.25
T. (60 ea) Electric Photo Control Intermatic LC4521C Intermatic LC4521C Intermatic LC4521C No bid Intermatic LC4521C Intermatic LC4521C Tork 5021M
Price/ea 6.50 7.143 7.05 5.68 6.75 5.63
Total/60 390.00 428.58 423.00 340.98 405.00 337.80
Total price with discount terms 414.54 334.42
U. (8 ea) Electric Photo Control Intermatic K4221C Intermatic K4221C Intermatic K4221C No bid Intermatic K4221C Intermatic K4221C Tork 2001
Price/ea 9.50 10.062 9.44 7.94 8.62 8.20
Total/8 76.00 80.50 75.52 63.52 68.96 65.60
Total price with discount terms 74.00 64.94
V. (2 ea) Mounting Channel, 36 inch,
NEMA SQD 9080GH136 SQD 9080GH136 No bid No bid SQD 9080GH136 No bid No bid
Price/ea 6.50 7.108 9.01
Total/2 13.00 14.22 18.02
W. (2 ea) Metering Pedestal Milbank NU8980-0-KK | Milbank NU8980-0-KK No bid No bid No bid Milbank NU8980-0-KK | Milbank NU8980-0-KK
Price/ea 265.00 315.341 325.00 277.50
Total/2 530.00 630.68 650.00 555.00
Total price with discount terms 549.45
X. (18 ea) PVC Cement, quick set,
brush-on, QT Allied Carlon VC9982 Ipex 66441 Cantex 7210603 Carlon V(9982 No bid Krayloy 078886
Price/ea 8.00 10.8111 7.89 7.39 18.49 8.32
Total/18 144.00 ** 194.60 142.02 ** 133.02 ** 332.82 149.76 **
Total price with discount terms 139.17 148.26




CED Interstate Electric Crescent Electric GexPro Millennium MSC Industrial Supply | Neher Electric Supply Werner Electric
Y. (200 rolls) Vinyl Tape, Premium
Grade, Black, 3/4" x 66' 3M 88 SUPER 3M 88 SUPER 3M 88 SUPER 3M 88 Super 3M 88 SUPER 3M 88 SUPER 3M 88 SUPER
Price/ea 4.25 4.675 3.98 4.55 418 4.01 4.44
Total 200 850.00 935.00 796.00 910.00 836.00 802.00 888.00
Total price with discount terms 780.08 879.12
Z. (120 rolls) Splicing Tape, Premium
Grade, Black, 1" x 30' 3M 130C 3M 130C 3M 130C 3M 130C 3M 130C 3M 130C 3M 130C
Price/ea 11.50 11.29 14.23 14.16 12.80 13.52
Total /120 1380.00 1790.40 1354.80 1707.60 1699.20 1536.00 1622.40
Total price with discount terms 1327.70 1606.17
Delivery 48 days 10-14 days 7 days 5-10 days 1-30 days
Terms Net 30 Net 30 2% /Net 10 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Credit Card Payment Accepted? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

** Doesn't meet requirements




