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Item # |Item Name WAPart# | QTY | U/M OO (e Graybar Part Number Hein Unit Hein Neher Neher Total Total
nit Frice | Manutacturer Price | Manufacturer |Hein Part Number Unit Price | Manufacturer|Neher Part Number Price Price
#0-1  |Burial Cable XHHW-] 280-080-12002 | 20,000 FT [NOBID 1.8 ENCORE 8/2 #10 GG XHHW-2 TRAY CABLE 1.85 BASIC WIRE & CAB|6-2602-G $36,000.00
#0-2  |LED Street/ Area Lu| 285-050-00065 | 370 Each 175.7  |Cree- this is their ne{ GWYS-A-8L-30K7-3M-UL-GY-W10 177.4 CREE GWYS-A-8L-30K7-3M-UL-GY-W10 178 CREE GWYS-A-8L-30K7-3M-UL-GY-W10 | $65,009.00
#0-3  |LED Street/ Area Lu| 285-050-00066 | 40 Each 175.7  [Cree- this is their ne{GWYS-A-8L-30K7-3M-UL-BZ-W10 177.4 CREE GWYS-A-8L-30K7-3M-UL-BZ-W10 178 CREE GWYS-A-8L-30K7-3M-UL-BZ-W10 $7,028.00
#0-4  |Twist Lock Shorting { 285-050-00011 | 386 Each 5.07 Intermatic- sold per |SK4500KJ (50 PACK) 8 PACK OF 50 $1960 3.75| INTERMATIC  [SK4500K) 3.95 INTERMATIC SK4500K) $1,447.50
#0-5  |Multi-tap Connector| 285-010-00002 | 24 Each 10.53  [iLsco PBTS-2-4 9.89 ILSCO PBTS-2-4 NO BID $237.36
#0-6  |Multi-tap Connector| 285-010-45004 | 300 Each 15.26  [ILSCO PBTS-3-4 14.65 ILSCO PBTS-3-4 NO BID $4,395.00
#0-7  |Multi-tap Connector| 285-010-00003 60 Each 19.32  [iLsco PBTS-4-4 18.65 ILSCO PBTS-4-4 NO BID $1,119.00
#0-8  |Fuse, 5 Amp, 500V, f 285-034-22020 | 420 Each 3.5 LITTEL FUSE OFLQO05.T 3.25|  LITTLEFUSE  |FLQOO5 5.1 BUSS FNQ-5 $1,365.00
#0-9  |HEB In-Line Fuse Hol| 285-034-22019 | 300 Each 8.09 LITTEL FUSE OLEBOOAAXK 6.75|  LITTLEFUSE  |OLEBODAAXK 9.75 BUSS HEB-AA $2,025.00
#0-10  |Wire, THHN #10 Strd 280-024-54029 | 4500 | Feet 0.24 generic wire THHN-10-STR-RED-500S (GBID 88284528) 0.25 ENCORE THHN-10-STR-RED NO BID $1,080.00
#0-11  |Wire, THHN #10 Strd 280-024-54028 | 4500 | Feet 0.24 generic wire THHN-10-STR-BLK-5005 0.25 ENCORE THHN-10-STR-BLACK NO BID $1,080.00
#0-12  |Conduit, HDPE 2" SC| 285-019-00019 | 20000 | Feet 0.45 Duraline HDP200RSCHE4ORIBLKBLKNPP12DSSRS90M02500 0.45 DURA-LINE (2044592110 NO BID $9,000.00
#0-13  |Conduit, HDPE 2" SC TBD 10000 | Feet 0.45 Duraline HDP200RSCHE40RIORGORGNPP12DSSRS90MO02500 0.45 DURA-LINE (2044592120 NO BID $4,500.00
#0-14  |LED Lamp, 50 Watt, TBD 21 Each 40 Satco $49673 69.15 GE #22679 LED50ED23.5/740 67 GE #22679 $840.00
$75,037.00  $60,088.86
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