Pickup, $600 GVW, 4x2 and 4x4 as specified beiow
Bed Size as specified below

L &S Truck Les Stumpf Neuville
Item # Description Qty UOM | Badger Truck Bob Fisk Ewald Chevy | Ewald Chrysler Holz Motors Center Ford Chrysler Van Horn Chevy,
Pickup, 8600 GVW, 4x4, Long Bed, Price to include: Tilt :
Steering, Power Windows, Power Locks, Trailer/Tew Mirrors
Power, Mud Fiaps-Front & Rear, Auto Locking Front Hub,
Extra Keys (3}, Trailer Package Less Hitch Receiver,
Limited Slip/Posi-Traction/Locking Differential, Plow [
23 Package 2 Each| & 2150617 | $  23.002.00 $22,548.00 $21,733.00{7 $22,946.00 $21,802.00 NG BID NOBID | § 2566280
SUBTOTAL $ 43,812,534 1 § 46,604.00 | § 45,096.00 | § 43,466.00 $ 45892.00 | $ 43,204.00 3 51,325.60
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each Included -574.80
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each Included $85.00 -$88.00
2010
($22,145.17 -
2011) - Ford GMC Sierra CHEVY Chew/Silverado/C Silverado
Make/Model Number F250 F2B TK20803 CK20903 DJ7L62 K20903 FORD F250 2500HD K20803
3 yri36000
Basic 3 BASIC 1 3-yrf36000 bumper-to-
Yr./36,000 - 3¥R/36000 Basic 3 yr/36000 : bumperto bumper - &
Powertrain 5 DRIVETRAIN mile, Pwr § 3yrf36000 BTB- |bumper plus 5- yr/ 100000
Warranty Yr./60,000 3 ¥r./36,000 5¥R/100000 yr{100000 mile Syrf100000 PT  |yr/60000 powertrain
Deliver to: Waukesha County (Internal Note:
P310€6/P32072) $25 per vehicle
MIRRORS ARE Price quoted for
POWER & model year 2010
HEATED, BUT only. Model year
Cannot deiete NOT TRAILER 2011 price is
COMMENTS: hitch receiver TOW $22241
Pickup, 8660 GVW, 4x2, Long Bed. Price to include:
TrailerTow Mirrors Manual, Mud Flaps Front & Rear, Extra N
Keys (2), Slding Rear Window, Bed liner insert Over Ralil, * L
24 Trailer Package. Fach| § 16,088.147 | § 19,486.00 $19,368.00 $18.880.00 $19,952.00 $15,864.00 NQ BID NOBID | § 21,962.80
Delete OnStar only, if applicabie Each Included < -$74.80
Delete XM Radio anly, if applicable Each Included $85.00 -$88.00
2010
(92149117 -
2011) - Ferd GMC Sierra CHEVY ChewSilverado/C Silverado 2500
Make/Mode! Number F250 F2A TC20903 CC20803 DCDGE DJ2L82 £20803 FORD FZ50 C20603
3 yri36000
Basic 3 BASIC 3-yr/36000 bumper-to-
¥r.£36,000 - 3YR/3600C Basic 3 yr/3G000 bumper to bumper- S
Pewertrain 5 DRIVETRAIN mite, Pwr 5 3yr/36000 BTB- [bumper plus 5- yr/100000
Warranty Y¥1./60,000 3 ¥1./36,000 5YR/100000 yr/100600 mile Syr/100000 PT  [yr/60000 powertrain
Deliver to: City of West Allis $25 per vehicle
Under rail
bedliner insert.
Price quoted for
model year 2010
SLIDING REAR only. Model year
WINDOW IS 2011 price is
COMMENTS: NOT AVAILABLE $18256
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Cah/Chassis, GVW and C/A Rating
As specified below

L &S5 Truck Les Stumps Neuviile
Itemn # Cescription Qty [UOM | Badger Truck Bokb Fish Ewald Chevy | Ewald Chrysler! Ewald's Ford Holz Motors Center Ford Chrysler Van Horn Chevy
Cab & Chassis, 11600 GVWW, 4x4, Diesel, 60" Cab/Axie.
Price to include: Power Windows, Power Lacks, Trailer/Tow
Mirrors-Power, Off-Road Package, HD Package, Plow
33 Package, Extra Keys (3}, Allison Transmission 1 Each| $ 27,288.97 NQ BID NO BID $32,038.00 NO BID $26,775.00 NO BID NQ BID NO BID
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each
2010 (530,421.97
-2011) - Ford
Make/Model Number F360 F3H DODGE FORD F3350
3-yr/36000
bumper fo
bumper plus 5-
Basic 3 yr/60000
Yr./36,000 - Basic 3 yr/36000 powertrain plus
Powerirain & mile, Pwr 5 5/yr100000 $100
Warranty Yr./60,000 yr/100000 mile deductible engine
Deliver to: Waukesha County (Internal Note: P23386)
Off road package
and Aliison
transmission not
available. Price
quotad for model
ALLISON year 2010 only.
Allison Trans. TRANS. NOT Model year 2011
COMMENTS: N/A AVAILABLE price is $29908
Cab & Chassis, 15000 GVW, 4x2, Diesel, 60" C/A. Price to
include: Trailer/Tow Mitrors Manua!, HD Package, Back up
Alarm Electric 87 dba mounted away from road splash, Exira
Keys {2), Dual Batleries DEDUCT
34 AIR CONDITIONING 2 Each| § 28,221.82 NO BID NQ BIG $30,350.00 No Bid $27,728.00 NQ BiD NQ BID NO 8ID
SUBTOTAL $ 56,443.64 $ 60,700.00 $ 55,456.00
2010 ($31,136.82
- 2011) - Ford
Make/Model Number| F450 FAG DODGE DM4LB3 & Ford F450
3-yr/36000
bumper to
bumper plus 5-
Basic 3 yr/60000
Yr./35,000 - Basic 3 yr/36000 powertrain plus
Powertrain 5 mile, Pwr 5 5/yr100000 $100
Warranty NT./60,000 yr/100000 mile deductible engine

Deliver to: City of West Allis

COMMENTS:

Price quoted for
model year 2010
only. Model year
2011 price is

330642
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Van, Cargo, §600 GVW, 4x2
Standard Length unless otherwise specified

L &S Truck Les Stumpf Neuville
ltem # Description Qty |UOM | Badger Truck Bob Fish Ewald Chevy | Ewald Chrysier| Ewald's Ford Holz Motors Center Ford Chrysler Van Horn Chevy
Van, Cargo, 8600 GVW, 4x2, Glass in Rear Only. Price to
include: Sliding Side Docr in lieu of double, Trailer Package,
Power Windows/Locks, Power Mirrors, Power Seat, Exira
57 Keys (3), Galvanized Roof Rack 1 Each $ 18,431.00 $18,536.00 NO BID $17,885.00 $18,181.00 $18,597.00 NO BID NOBID! S 20,175.00
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each N/A NIA
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each N/A N/A
GMC Savana CHEVY Chev/Express/C Express Cargo
Make/Model Number TG23405 CG23405 FORD E2E G23405 Ford E250 Van CG23405
3-yr/36000 3 yr/38000
BASIC BASIC bumper te bumper-to-
3YR/36000 3YR/36000, bumper plus 5- bumper - 5
DRIVETRAIN DRIVETRAIN 3yr/36000 BTB- |yr/60000 yr/100000
Warranty 3 Yr1./36,000 5YR/M00000 5YR/G0000 5yr/ 100000 PT  |powerirain powertrain
Deliver to: Waukesha County {Internal Note: P20010) $25 per vehicle
COMMENTS:
Van, Cargo, 8600 GVW, 4x2, Standard Length, Glass in
Side and Rear Doors. Price to include: Trailer Package,
58 Mud Flaps-Front/Rear DEDUCT AIR CONDITIONING 1 |Each|$ 17,046.84 | $ 17,103.00 $16,946.00 NO BID $16,919.00 $17,088.00 NO BID NOBID | § 18,925.00
Delete OnStar only, if applicable Each N/A N/A
Delete XM Radio only, if applicable Each N/A NIA
Ford E256 Cargo|GMC Savana CHEVY Chev/Express/C Express Cargo
Make/Model Number Van E2E TG23405 C(523405 (23405 Ford E250 Van CG23405
3-yrf36000 3 yrf36000
Basic 3 BASIC bumper to bumper-to-
Yr./36,000 - 3YR/36000 bumper pius 5- bumper - 5
Powerirain 5 DRIVETRAIN 3yr/36000 BTB- |yr/60000 yr/10000C
Warranty Yr./60,000 3 Yr./36,000 SYR/100000 5yr/100000 PT  |powertrain powertrain

Deliver to: City of West Allis

$25 per vehicle

COMMENTS:
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