
Crescent Electric Grainger Industrial Graybar Electric Neher Electric Werner Electric

A.  (25) Wire, Copper stranded #8 

Bare, 500 ft/roll Cerro #008126 Southwire 10632802

Service Wire

BARECOSD#8 Encore Alan 16792

Price/roll .30/ft 179.20 119.65 135.00 128.00

Total Price 3750.00 4480.00 2991.25 3375.00 3200.00

B. (10) Wire Copper, THHN, 

Stranded, #10 black, 500 ft/roll Cerro #008090 Southwire 22973201 THHN#10STRBLK Encore Southwire 65620

Price/roll .18/ft 204.75 80.58 85.00 84.13

Total Price 900.00 2047.50 805.80 850.00 841.30

C. (10) Wire, Copper, THHN, 

Stranded, #10 red, 500 ft/roll Cerro #008094 Southwire 22975701 THHN10STRRED Encore Southwire 65650

Price/roll .18/ft 204.75 80.58 85.00 84.13

Total Price 900.00 2047.50 805.80 850.00 841.30

D. (3) Wire, Copper, XHHW, 

Stranded, #6 Black, 5,000 ft/roll Cerro #302418

Service Wire

XHHW6STRBLK Encore HWC 2110461

Price/roll .51/ft 2255.75 498.00/M 2741.11

Total Price 7650.00 No bid 6767.25 7470.00 8223.33

E. (3) Wire, Copper, XHHW, 

Stranded, #6 Red, 5000 ft/roll Cerro #324421

Service Wire

XHHW6STRRED Encore HWC 3923629

Price/roll .51/ft 2255.75 498.00/M 2741.11

Total Price 7650.00 No bid 6767.25 7470.00 8223.33

F. (100) Electric Photo Control 187933 Intermatic LC4521C Intermatic LC4521C

Price/each 6.70 9.11 5.25 5.36 7.37

Total Price 670.00 911.00 525.00 536.00 737.00

G. (10) Electric Photo Switch, Flush 

Mount, 120V #006250 Tork 3000-120VAC Intermatic K4021C K4021C

Price/each 6.90 18.17 8.00 6.82 8.00

Total Price 69.00 181.70 80.00 68.20 80.00
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Crescent Electric Grainger Industrial Graybar Electric Neher Electric Werner Electric

H. (1) Contactor, 12 pole, Lighting, 

Type L #019029 C-HC35

Price/each 730.00 795.08 1290.00

Total Price 730.00 No bid 795.08 No bid 1290.00

I. (2) Control Station Switch #267442 C-HTNI

Price/each 152.99 126.36 170.00

Total Price 305.98 No bid 252.78 No bid 340.00

J. (3) Selector Switch Plate, Hand-

Off-Auto #043751 SQD9001-KN260 #2377155

Price/each 2.80 3.63 2.29 3.89

Total Price 8.40 10.89 6.87 No bid 11.67

K. (3) Selector Switch Enclosure 1-

hole for push button PVIX #2373454

Price/each 63.44 40.21 98.22

Total Price 190.32 No bid 120.63 No bid 294.66

L. (3) Lighting Time Clock ET90115C ET90115C ET90115C ET90115C

Price/each 280.10 275.16 261.20 308.00

Total Price 840.30 No bid 825.48 783.60 924.00

M. (6) Terminal Block, 600V, 85A, 

NEMA +Options #081028 SQD9080GC6 XBUT16

Price/each 2.75 5.77 3.05 2.62

Total Price 16.50 34.62 18.30 No bid 15.72

N. (6) 24-hour Time Switch, SPST, 

30 amp #335971 Intermatic ET1105C Intermatic ET1105C

Price/each 84.80 139.77 106.45 101.00 117.96

Total Price 508.80 838.62 638.70 606.00 707.76

O. (5) Metering Pedestal #466123 Milbank NU8980-0-KK

Price/each 286.95 258.51 299.00 320.00

Total Price 1434.75 No bid 1292.55 1495.00 1600.00

P. (5) Breaker, 200 Amp, Plug-In #578721 Milbank UQFPH-200

Price/each 157.60 141.98 140.00 162.00

Total Price 788.00 No bid 709.90 700.00 810.00



Crescent Electric Grainger Industrial Graybar Electric Neher Electric Werner Electric

Q. (300) Fuse Holder, 30 Amp, 

600V, In-Line #10974 Bussmann HEB-AA Bussmann HEB-AA

Price/each 6.85 9.89 6.40 5.65 18.50

Total Price 2055.00 2967.00 1920.00 1695.00 5550.00

R. (300) Fuses, 5 amp, 500V, Time-

Delay #88141 Bussmann FNQ-5 FNQ5 FNQ-5 Bussmann FQN-5

Price/each 5.90 7.89 4.70 4.15 11.10

Total Price 1770.00 2367.00 1410.00 1245.00 3330.00

S. (100) PVC Bell End, 2" Cantex 5144008 Heritage 610342 Carlon #997J

Price/each 2.06 2.3848 147.70/c 3.30

Total Price 206.00 No bid 238.48 147.70 330.00

T. (4) PVC Bell End, 3" Cantex 5144010 Heritage 610344 Carlon #997L

Price/each 2.40 2.78 228.95/c 4.10

Total Price 9.60 No bid 11.12 9.12 16.40

U. (14000) Conduit, PVC, 2", 

Schedule 40, 10 ft. lengths Generic 041488 Cantex A52CA12 Heritage 512010 National 58079

Price/ft .62/ft 8.58/10 ft 57.74/c 54.50/c 5.89/10 ft

Total Price 8680.00 12012.00 8083.60 7630.00 8246.00

V. (10) PVC Coupling, 2", Split, 

Schedule 40 Cantex 6141684 Carlon E200JS6

Price/each 8.46 18.02 10.90

Total Price 84.60 No bid 180.20 No bid 109.00

W. (200) PVC Coupling, 2", 

Schedule 40 Cantex 6141628 Heritage 610005 Carlon E920J

Price/each 0.32 0.3477 30.15/c 0.38

Total Price 64.00 No bid 69.54 60.30 76.00

X. (30) PVC Elbow, 90 degree, 

2"Dx9.5"R Cantex 5233828 Heritage 611061 Carlon UA9AJB

Price/each 1.68 1.8733 149.00/c 2.19

Total Price 50.40 No bid 56.20 44.70 65.70

Y. (200) PVC Elbow, 90 degree, 

2"Dx24"R Plain End Cantex 5133836 Heritage 611351 Carlon UA9DJ

Price/each 6.10 4.7224 391.00/c 8.75

Total Price 1220.00 No bid 944.48 782.00 1750.00



Crescent Electric Grainger Industrial Graybar Electric Neher Electric Werner Electric

Z. (24) PVC Cement, quick set, 

brush-on, QT Cantex 7210413 Heritage 690019 Carlon VC9982

Price/each 9.72 10.0116 13.20 10.09

Total Price 233.28 No bid 240.28 316.80 242.16

AA. (100) Ground Clamp, 5/8" x1"
Erico CP58 Burndy CRC58 Burndy GRC58

Southern Grounding 

Products G-5 #17680

Price/each 1.25 18.33 1.7647 1.15 1.03

Total Price 125.00 1833.00 176.47 115.00 103.00

BB. (50) Ground Clamp, 1/2" x 1" Erico CWP1J Burndy C11N Burndy C11N Halex 36010B #17679

Price/each 2.95 25.25 1.5686 1.85 1.45

Total Price 147.50 1262.50 78.43 92.50 72.50

CC. (25) Ground Rod, Galvanized, 

UL 5/8" x 8' Erico 815880 #615880

Southern Grounding 

Products ZZ588 #815880

Price/each 7.15 8.25 5.85 8.57

Total Price 178.75 No bid 206.25 146.25 214.25

DD. (120) Luminaire, LED, 40W, 

120V, STR-LWY-2MB-HT-04-C-UL-

SV

Price/each 420.00 414.00

Total Price No bid No bid 50400.00 49680.00 No bid

EE. (1) Luminaire, Cobra, 100W, 

Parallel, American Lighting 

1145F113 11510SXHMT1R3SGNR

Price/each 144.40 137.08

Total Price 144.40 No bid 137.08 No bid No bid

FF. (2) Luminaire, shoe box type, 

bronze, 150W, 6.6A, 19"x10"

Price/each 369.25 350.42

Total Price 738.50 No bid 700.84 No bid No bid

GG. (3) Capacitor, dry, 24 

microfarad, 400v GECAP-24/400V-0 Phillips Adv 7C240P40R

Philips Advance 

7C240P40R

Price/each 10.30 33.55 21.95 57.75 30.43

Total Price 30.90 100.65 65.85 173.25 91.29



Crescent Electric Grainger Industrial Graybar Electric Neher Electric Werner Electric

HH. (6) Ballast, 50W, Pulse Start, 

MH, 4-tap GEM50MLTLA3D-5

Philips Advance 71A5191-

00D

Price/each 51.20 57.50 147.60 220.00

Total Price 307.20 No bid 345.00 885.60 1320.00

Delivery
Stocked - 1 day

Fixtures 4-6 weeks 1-2 days except Line U

1-28 days

Fixtures 4 weeks 5-30 days 1-7 days

Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Credit Card Payment Accepted? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes


