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R-2007-0054 Resolution In Committee

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of various suppliers for furnishing and delivering

chimney seals, valves, water boxes and extensions for a total sum of $79,680.55.
Introduced: 2/6/2007 Controlling Body: Public Works Committee

Sponsor(s): Public Works Committee

ADOP

COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATION

MOVER SECONDER | A¥E - - NO PRESENT

EXCUSED

ACTION Barczak =

DATE: Czaplewski

Dobrowski i

\

2450

Kopplin ‘

Lajsic

Narlock

Reinke

Sengstock

Vitale

Weigel [

) A A

Sl I AV

TOTAL

SIGNATURE WT TEE MEMBER

Chair Vice-Chair Member

COMMON COUNCIL ACTION ADOPT

MOVER SECONDER | PRESENT

=

NO

EXCUSED

ACTION

Barczak

DATE: Czaplewski

Dobrowski

uu

FEB ¢ 6 9nn7
M Kopplin

Lajsic

Narlock

Reinke

Sengstock

Vitale

NN SSNISN ]IS

T

Weigel

L)

TOTAL

City of West Allis Page |

Printed on 1/31/2007



1 ALTHE CEn . . 7525 W. Greenfield Ave.
B’& City of West Allis West Alis, WI 53214

WEST ALLIS Resolution
File Number: R-2007-0054 Final Action:
Sponsor(s): Public Works Committee FE By 6 2@07

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of various suppliers for furnishing and delivering
chimney seals, valves, water boxes and extensions for a total sum of $79,680.55.

WHEREAS, The Purchasing/Central Services Division has reported that it duly advertised a request
for proposal for furnishing and delivering chimney seals, valves, water boxes, extensions and
various related hardware for the Public Works Department of the City of West Allis, that the
proposals received as shown on the attached bid report were reasonable; and,

WHEREAS, The Common Council deems it to be in the best interests of the City of West Allis that
the proposals of Davies Water Equipment, First Supply-Milwaukee, First Supply-Madison and HD
Supply Waterworks be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Common Council of the City of West
Allis that the proposal dated January 29, 2007 submitted by Davies Water Equipment for furnishing
chimney seals in the amount of $21,760.00; the proposal dated January 30, 2007 submitted by First
Supply-Milwaukee for furnishing gate valves, curb box extensions and gate valve adapters in the
amount of $47,909.55; the proposal dated January 29, 2007 submitted by First Supply-Madison for
furnishing chimney seal extensions in the amount of $2,416.00 and the proposal dated January 25,
2007 submitted by HD Supply Waterworks for furnishing curb box sections in the amount of
$7.595.00 for the total net sum of $79,680.55 in accordance with City of West Allis RFP #945 be
and is hereby accepted.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Purchasing/Central Services Division be and is hereby
authorized to enter into gentracts for the aforesaid materials.

PCSD9%45
ADOPTED FEB 0.6 2007 APPROVED 7 g 24
Paul M. Zlehler City Ad/ min. Ofﬁcer Clerk/Treas. Jeannette Bell, Mayor
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CITY OF WEST ALLIS

BID TABULATION

RFP #945

Chimney Seals, Water Main Valves, Water Boxes & Extensions
Open: 1/30/07, 10:30 AM

ITEM/QTY

Davies Water

First Supply-Milwaukee

First Supply-Madison

HD Supply Waterworks

A. 30 (89004014003)

Curb Box Bottom Section 21"

Tyler 100F

Price/ea

15.40

14.85

no bid

15.00

Total/30

462.00

445.50

450.00

B. 30 (89004014011)

Curb Box Top Section 18"

Tyler 18T

Price/ea

19.85

19.15

no bid

19.00

Total/30

595.50

574.50

570.00

C. 80 (89004014016)

Curb Box Extension 30"

Tyler #154

Price/ea

23.50

22.65

no bid

23.00

Total/80

1,880.00

1,812.00

1,840.00

D. 25 (89004014005)

Curb Box Extension 16"

Tyler #152

Price/ea

15.40

14.85

no bid

15.00

Total/25

385.00

371.25

375.00

E. 45 (89004014007)

Curb Box Top Section 30"

Tyler 30T

Price/ea

26.10

25.20

no bid

25.00

Total/45

1,174.50

1,134.00

1,125.00

F. 75 (89004015002)

Valve Box Top, 26"

Tyler 26T

Price/ea

44.75

41.15

no bid

40.00

Total/75

3,356.25

3,086.25

3,000.00

G. 25 (89004015004)

Valve Box Base #6

Tyler #6-600X

Price/ea

39.15

37.75

no bid

26.00

Total/25

978.75

943.75

650.00

H. 25 (89004015003)

Valve Box Bottom Section, 36"

Tyler #36B

Price/ea

46.15

43.70

no bid

40.00

Total/25

1,153.756

1,092.50

1,000.00




ITEM/QTY

Davies Water

First Supply-Milwaukee

First Supply-Madison

HD Supply Waterworks

I. 125 (89004017001)

Valve Box Lid, 5-1/4"

Tyler MWW600-6

Price/ea

10.75

10.35

no bid

10.00

Total/125

1,343.75

1,293.75

1,250.00

J. 72 (89004510003)

Gate Valve, 6", R/S

Mfg/Model

Kennedy or Clow

Kennedy

Kennedy

Price/ea

483.35

453.85

no bid

460.00

Total/72

34,801.20

32,677.20

33,120.00

K. 12 (89004510004)

Gate Valve, 8", R/S

Mfg/Model

Kennedy or Clow

Kennedy

Kennedy

Price/ea

747.40

701.75

no bid

715.00

Total/12

8,968.80

8,421.00

8,580.00

L. 52 (89004510016)

Gate Valve Adapter, 6"

Mfg/Model

Kennedy or Clow

Kennedy

Kennedy or Mueller

Price/ea

64.15

61.25

no bid

63.00

Total/52

3,335.80

3,185.00

3,276.00

M. 16 (89004510018)

Gate Valve Adapter 8"

Mfg/Model

Kennedy or Clow

Kennedy

Price/ea

65.20

62.35

no bid

63.00

Total/16

1,043.20

997.60

1,008.00

N. 150 (89003002010)

Chimney Seal 26" w/taper sleeve

Mfg/Model

Cretex

Cretex

Cretex

Price/ea

128.00

no bid

148.00

134.00

Total/150

19,200.00

22,200.00

20,100.00

0. 20 (89003002015)

Chimney Seal 24" straight w/bands

Mfg/Model

Cretex

Cretex

Cretex

Price/ea

128.00

no bid

148.00

134.00

Total/20

2,560.00

2,960.00

2,680.00

P. 16 (89003000002)

Chimney Seal Ext. 10" x 24" w/band

Mfg/Model

Cretex

Cretex

Cretex

Price/ea

100.70

no bid

88.00

90.00

Total/16

1,611.20

1,408.00

1,440.00

Q. 12 (89003000001)

Chimney Seal Ext. 7" x 26" w/band

Mfg/Model

Cretex

Cretex

Cretex

Price/ea

94.15

no bid

84.00

85.00

Total/12

1,129.80

1,008.00

1,020.00

Delivery

stock to 30 days

4 days

14 days

Terms

net

net

net

net 30




