Jeffrey Warchol

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Jenna Merten

Monday, June 22, 2015 12:53 PM

Jeffrey Warchol

FW: Online Form Submittal: Email City Attorney RECEIVED
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WESTAL
CITYATTORLAIIZY

From: noreply@civicpius.com [mailto:noreply@civicplus.com]

Sent: Friday, June 19, 2015 6:00 PM

To: Jenna Merten

Subject: Online Form Submittal: Email City Attorney

Email City Attorney

Use this form to send an email message to the City of West Allis City Attorney's Office. Emails
are answered during normal business hours, 8:00 am - 5:00 pm Monday - Friday. If your
message is urgent, life threatening or you are experiencing an emergency, please contact the
West Allis Police Department Dispatch Center at (414) 302-8000.

From:;:

Message:

clor86@gmail.com

June 19, 2015 City Attorney’s Office 75256 W Greenfield Ave
Room 232 West Allis, Wl 53214 To the office of the City
Attorney Scott Post, | am writing in regards to a parking citation
and towing fee that | received on Monday, May 25th, 2015. |
was parked legally on west National Avenue on Sunday and
was out of town as it was the Memorial Holiday weekend. On
Monday | discovered that my vehicle had been ticketed and
towed because of the Memorial Day parade route that came
through the neighborhood. | was unaware of this as | had just
recently moved into the neighborhood. | have paid the towing
and citation fees, which totaled $136.16. Both the police officer
and the clerk at the police station have advised me to contact
you in an attempt to receive reimbursement for the fees which |
have paid. Please consider this on my behalf as | was legally
parked the Sunday prior to the event and also out of town
visiting my family. Additionally, please advise as to how | can
submit photos/copies of the necessary receipts and citations as
| am unable to copy/attach them to this form. Thank you, Chee
Lor
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Ann Neff

From: chee for <clor86@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, June 25, 2015 10:40 AM
To: Ann Neff

Subject: - Re: West Allis e-mail claim

My contact information is as follows:

Chee Lor

7010 W. National Ave
West Allis, WI 53214
Telephone: 608-957-9839

On Thu, Jun 25, 2015 at 8:33 AM, Ann Neff <ANeff@westalliswi.cov> wrote:

The Clerk’s Office received your request for reimbursement of an incident on May 25, 2013.

To properly process this claim please provide us with your mailing address and a contact
telephone number.

If you would like to supply any copies of your receipts, citations, or photos you may mail
them to us at:

Clerk’s Office
Common Council
7525 W. Greenfield Ave.

West Allis, WI 53214
You may contact me if you have any further questions at this time.

Sincerely,

(nn Manie Neff



