BID Tabulation RFQ # 24-004, Cable, Luminaires & Electrical Supplies
Due: Tuesday, February 27, 2024 @ 11 AM CT

TEXPTO;
Werner Crescent,
Supplier =| Electric Hein City Electric Graybar Neher
ltem aty Description Mfg/Model Price Each /| Price Each] Price Each /| Price Each/ | Price Each/
P And Part Total / Total Total Total Total
Number
$9.35 each
Fuse, 5 Amp, 500V, FNGQ, S151040| 52,0250 $2,618.00
A 280 each | Time-Delay. Bussmann A o No Response NO BID
FNQ5 or equal Littelfuse Mersen Bussmann
qual. FLQO05 ATQ5 FNQS5
$10.55 ea.
HEB In-Line Fuse Holder, $1,477.00 $$19'39986€868 2]04'22 gg
B 140 each Bussmann HEB-AA or Littelfuse ’ . ’ ) NO BID
Mersen FEB: Bussmann
Equal oLEBOOAAX 11-11 HEB-AA
K
Multi-Tap Connector. $15.44 ea.
C | 132each| 3-wire, ILSCO PBTS-3-4 $2,038.08 %129;37%? 2531?2 gg NO BID
NO SUBS lisco ’ ’ ’ ’
Multi-Tap Connector, $19.64 ea. | $25.24 ea. $30.01 ea
D 20 each 4 wire, ILSCO PBTS-4-4 $392.80 $504.88 $660 20 NO BID
NO SUBS llsco lisco ’
. $0.21879 ft | $0.2069 ft $0.20147 ft
E 85&022: W";Té;(H';(';'Oﬁlg’t ng;‘o‘fd $109.395 1 | $103.45 rl $100.735roll | NO BID
’ P $875.16 | $827.40 $805.88
) $0.21879 ft | $0.2069 ft $0.20147 ft
F 2&023‘ W'rSégHs"é% zeot’ Setrrargﬁed $109.395 1 | $103.45 rl $100.735r0ll | NOBID
’ P $875.16 $827.40 $805.88
LED Street Luminaire, Type $195.80 ea. $195.88 ea $193.45 ea
G 300 each |lll, 8K, XSPSM-D-HT-3ME- NO BID $58,740.00 $58 76'4 Cree $58,035.00
8L-30K7-UL-SV Silver Cree ’ Cree
$9.28 ea
) . $9.25 ea $3.75 each
H  [#345 each [ TSt hock Shorting Cap for NOBID | $3,191.25 8320190 | 's1,125.00
Cree XSLSHRT Intermatic
LED Street Luminaire, Type $195.80 Ea $195.88 ea | $193.45 each
| 45 each |lll, 8K, XSPSM-D-HT-3ME- NO BID 8 8.11 00' $8,814.60 $8,705.00
8L-30K7-UL-BZ Bronze ’ ’ Cree Cree
Burial Cable, Type TC
17009 || Power Cable, XHHW, 8- 2260282773 Sl $1.91158ft | 1596 ft
feet, 2 | gauge, 600v, 2-conductor, Orynni 6 $15,705.05 $1'9 115.80 $15’ 960.00
J reels of | red and black with ground, Encore 8/2 e A
. . 2602-G Omni Wire Basic Wire 6-
5,000 feet |heat, moisture, and sunlight 48/9C #10GG A10803 2602-G
each resistant, Basic Wire #6- W/GRD XHHW-2
2602-G or Equal
1- 70 Days 50 Days 21-70 Days
TOTAL ORDER FOR EACH VENDOR = $5,218.28 ]$15,705.05 $1,611.76 $67,865.00
Total all order=] $90,400.09

Line A & B ordered as a set, with lowest combined costs.

Line H Quantity changed from 300 each to 345 each.
Line J, Encore cable approved by DM Electrical.




