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Matter Summary
File Number Title Status
R-2008-0034 Resolution In Committee

COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATION  ADCY) |

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of various suppliers for furnishing and delivering
chimney seals, valves, water boxes and extensions for a total sum 0f$72,449.75.

Introduced: 2/5/2008 Controlling Body: Public Works Committee

Sponsor(s): Public Works Committee
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Resolution
File Number: R-2008-0034 Final Action:
Sponsor(s): Public Works Committee FEB 0 5 2008

Resolution relative to accepting the proposal of various suppliers for furnishing and delivering
chimney seals, valves, water boxes and extensions for a total sum of $72,449.75.

WHEREAS, The Purchasing/Central Services Division has reported that it duly advertised a request
for proposal for furnishing and delivering chimney seals, valves, water boxes, extensions and
various related hardware for the Public Works Department of the City of West Allis, that the
proposals received as shown on the attached bid report were reasonable; and,

WHEREAS, The Common Council deems it to be in the best interests of the City of West Allis that
the proposals of Davies Water Equipment, First Supply-Milwaukee, First Supply-Madison and HD
Supply Waterworks be accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Common Council of the City of West
Allis that the proposal dated January 21, 2008 submitted by Davies Water Equipment for furnishing
curb box extension in the amount of $27,617.75; the proposal dated January 29, 2008 submitted by
First Supply-Milwaukee for furnishing corporation stops in the amount of $2,247.00; the proposal
dated January 14, 2008 submitted by First Supply-Madison for furnishing chimney seal extensions
in the amount of $3,160.00 and the proposal dated January 25, 2008 submitted by HD Supply
Waterworks for furnishing gate valves in the amount of #39,425.00 for a total net sum of
$72,449.75 in accordance with City of West Allis RFP #983 be and is hereby accepted.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Purchasing/Central Services Division be and is hereby
authorized to enter into contracts for the aforesaid equipment.

PCSD983
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Paul M. Ziehler, City Admin., Officer, Clerk/Treas.

City of West Allis Page 1 of 1 Printed on 1/30/2008



B8ID TABULATION

RFP #983

Water Valves & Accessories
Due: 1/29/08, 10:30 AM

ITEM/IQTY

Davies Water

First Supply-Oak Creek

First Supply-Madison

HD Supply Waterworks

A. 25 (89004014005)

Curb Box Bottom Section 16"

Tyler 152

Price/ea

' 16.40

17.15

No bid

18.00

Total/10

164.00

171.50

180.00

B. 45 (89004014007)

Curb Box Top Section 30"

Tyler 30T

Price/ea

28.60

No bid

29.00

Total/10

286.00

290.00

C. 75 (89004015002)

Valve Box Top, 26"

Tyler 26T

Price/ea

_an

49.30

No bid

46.00

Total/120

' '5,250.00

5,916.00

5,520.00

D. 25 (88004015004)

Valve Box Base #6

Tyler #6-600X

Price/ea

38.30

42.85

No bid

43.00

Total/110

4,713.50

4,730.00

E. 25 (89004015003)

Valve Box Bottom Section, 36"

Tyler #368

Pricelea

4815

50.70

No bid

48.00

Total/115

. 5192.25

5,830.50

5,520.00




ITEM/IQTY Davies Water First Supply-Oak Creek First Supply-Madison HD Supply Waterworks

F. 125 (89004017001)

Valve Box Lid, 5-1/4"

Tyler MWWB600-6

Pricelea '10.55 12.156 No bid 13.00
Total/150 1,582.50 1,822.50 1,950.00
G. 72 (89004510003)

Gate Valve, 6", R/S

| Mfg/Model Kennedy 157 Mueller C-2360 No bid Mueller C-2360
Pricelea 478.40 497.50 T 459.00
Total/55 26,312.00 27,362.50 . 25,245.00
H. 12 (89004510004)

Gate Valve, 8", R/S

Mfg/Mode! Kennedy 157 Mueller C-2360 No bid Mueller C-2360
Pricelea 739.60 775.00 | 709.00
Total/20 14,792.00 15,500.00 14,180.00
I. 52 (89004510016)

Gate Valve Adapter, 6"

Mfg/Model Kennedy Mueller No bid Kennedy or Mueller
Pricelea 61.40 69.30 72.00
Total/85 5,219.00 5,890.50 6,120.00
J. 16 (89004510018)

Gate Valve Adapter 8"

| Mfg/Mode! Kennedy Mueller No bid Kennedy or Mueller
Price/ea 62.40 70.60 73.00
Total/24 ' 1,497.60 1,694.40 1,752.00




ITEM/QTY

Davies Water

First Supply-Oak Creek

First Supply-Madison

HD Supply Waterworks

K. 4 (89004511001)

Butterfly Valve, MJ, 12" open right

M_fg/Model

M&H 450

M&H 450

No bid

Mueller B-3211

Price/ea

755.35

1,190.10

800.00

Total/l4

3,021.40

4,760.40

3,600.00

L. 1 (89004511002)

Butterfly Valve, MJ, 16" open right

Mfg/Model

M&H 450

M&H 450

No bid

Mueller B-3211

Price/ea

1,468.25

2,352.20

1,650.00

Total/1

1,468.25

2,352.20

1,650.00

M. 40 (88004501001)

Corporation Stop, 1"

Mfg/Model

McDonald 4701B

No bid

Ford FB600

Price/ea

30.15

Mueller B25000

e

31.00

Total/40

1,206.00

1,240.00

N. 10 (88004501003)

Corporation Stop, 2"

Mfg/Model

No bid

Ford FB600

Price/ea

113.95

115.00

Total/10

1,139.50

1,150.00

0. 20 (88003002010)

Chimney Seal 26" witaper sleeve

M_fglModeI

Cretex 092634

No bid

Cretex 092634

Cretex 092634

Price/ea

164.00

" 158.00

175.00

Total/20

3,280.00

' 3,160.00

3,500.00

Delivery

30 days

60 days

7 days

12 days

Terms

Net

Net 30

Net 30

Net 30
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