
Crescent Electric Gexpro Milwaukee Graybar Neher Electric Werner Electric Supply

1.  6 rolls Wire THHN #10 Black, 

Stranded, 500' rl

Mfg/ Model

Cerro or Alan Wire

CU-500S/K

THHN-10-BLK-19STR CME Wire & Cable Co

Southwire

THHN10-STR-BLK-500S

Encore

10THHN-BLK-5M

Southwire

THHN#10 Black

Price/roll 107.35 94.66 100.00 105.00 91.90

Total Price 644.10 567.96 600.00 630.00 551.40

2.  6 rolls Wire THHN #10 Red, 

Stranded, 500' rl

Mfg/ Model

Cerro or Alan Wire

CU-500S/K

THHN-10-RED-19STR CME Wire & Cable Co

Southwire

THHN10-STR-RED-500S

Encore

10THHN-BLK-5M

Southwire

THHN#10 Red

Price/roll 107.35 94.66 100.00 105.00 91.90

Total Price 644.10 567.96 600.00 630.00 551.40

3.  2 rolls Wire XHHW #6 Black, 

Stranded 5000' rl

Mfg/ Model

Cerro Wire

XHHW#6BLK.STR-5000EL CME Wire & Cable Co

Service Wire

XHHW-2-6-STR-BLK-

5000R no bid

Southwire

XHHW#6 Black

Price/roll 3319.50 3347.00 .54/ft 2918.05

Total Price 6639.00 6694.00 5400.00 5836.10

4.  4 rolls Wire XHHW #6 Red, 

Stranded, 2500' rl

Mfg/ Model

Cerro Wire

XHHW#6Red.Str-2500R CME Wire & Cable Co

Service Wire

XHHW-2-6-STR-RED no bid

Southwire

XHHW#6 Red

Price/roll 1659.75 1673.50 .54/ft 1459.03

Total Price 6639.00 6694.00 5400.00 5836.10

5.  4 rolls Wire XHHW #6 Green

Copper Stranded, 2500' rl

Mfg/ Model

Cerro Wire

XHHW6green,Str-2500R CME Wire & Cable Co

Service Wire

XHHW-2-6-STR-GRN-

2500R no bid

Southwire

XHHW6 Green

Price/roll 1659.75 1673.50 .54/ft 1459.03

Total Price 6639.00 6694.00 5400.00 5836.10
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Crescent Electric Gexpro Milwaukee Graybar Neher Electric Werner Electric Supply

6.  5000" Conduit PVC 2", Schedule 

40, 10' Length

Mfg/ Model Prime or Allied Cantex

Cantex

PVC-2 512010

Nat'l Pipe & Plastic

PVC3" SCH40

Price/ft .48/ft .4511/ft .48/ft .55/ft .46/ft

Total Price 2400.00 2255.50 2400.00 2750.00 2300.00

7.  30 ea PVC Elbow 90° 2" dia x 24" 

R Plain End 

Mfg/ Model

Cantex

5133836 Cantex

Cantex

5133836 90° 2x24"R

Carlon

PVC Elbow 90° 2"

Price/each 5.95 6.88 7.75 8.50 7.87

Total Price 178.50 206.40 232.50 255.00 236.10

8.  50 ea Fuse 5A-500V Time Delay 

Type FNQ

Mfg/ Model

Bussman

FNG5

Bussman

FNQ5

Buss

FNQ5

Bussman

FNQ-5

Ferraz

5A-500V Time Delay FNQ

Price/each 7.25 7.56 7.25 8.25 9.36

Total Price 362.50 378.00 362.50 412.50 468.00

9.  100 ea Multi-Tap Connector,

 3-Wire Range 14>4 /AWG

Mfg/ Model

ILSCO

PBTS-3-4

Burndy

1PL43

ILSCO

PBTS-3-4 no bid

ILSCO

PBTS 3-4

Price/each 11.80 9.60 11.90 11.29

Total Price 1180.00 960.00 1190.00 1129.00

10.  2 ea Selector Switch

Mfg/ Model

SQD

9001KS43-BH13 no bid

SQD

9001K543BH13 no bid no bid

Price/each 62.50 62.54

Total Price 125.00 125.08

11.  3 ea Terminal Block, 600V, 85A 

NEMA

Mfg/ Model

SQD

9080GC6 no bid

SQD

9080GC6 no bid no bid

Price/each 2.55 3.50

Total Price 7.65 10.50



Crescent Electric Gexpro Milwaukee Graybar Neher Electric Werner Electric Supply

12.  1 ea Metering Pedestal

Mfg/ Model

Milbank

NU8980-0-KK Milbank

Milbank

NU8980-O-KK no bid

Milbank

NU8980-0-KK

Price/each 264.75 241.10 315.15 284.02

Total Price 264.75 241.10 315.15 284.02

13.  2 ea Circuit Breaker, 200A, 

2-pole

Mfg/ Model

Milbank

UQFPH-200 Milbank

Milbank

UQFPH-200 no bid

Milbank

UQFPH-200

Price/each 145.40 124.91 173.10 140.40

Total Price 290.80 249.82 346.20 280.80

14.  45 ea LED Streetlight 

Luminaire, silver, Type II

Mfg/ Model

RUUD-BETA

STR-LWY-2MB-HT-04-C-

UL-SV

Beta

STR-LWY-2MB-HT-04-C-

UL-SV

Beta

STR-LWY-2MB-HT-04-C-

UL-SV

RUUD/Beta

LED-STR-LWY-2MB-HT-04-

C-UL-SV

Beta

STR-LWY-2MB-HT-04-C-

UL-SV

Price/each 427.00 436.00 406.00 415.00 445.66

Total Price 19215.00 19620.00 18270.00 18675.00 20054.70

Delivery 15-30 days 14 days

15 days

#14 - 5-6 weeks

3-7 days

#14 - 2-5 weeks

10 days

#14-4-6 weeks

Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 1%-10

Credit Card Payment Accepted? yes yes yes no yes


