CITY OF WEST ALLIS

BID TABULATION

RFQ # 1095 - STREET LAMPS

Due: 9/15/10, 1:00 PM

Batteries Plus Grainger Graybar Electric Neher Electric WESCO Distribution
1056 ea, Lamp, Low Pressure
Sodium, 55W, 12/cs Sylvania Osram Philips
Mfg/Model LPS10002 no bid no bid SOX.55 321513-SOX55
Price/ea 27.20 13.95 21.80
Total/1056 28,723.20 14,731.20 23,020.80
144 ea, Lamp, Low Pressure
Sodium, 35W, 12/cs Sylvania Osram Philips
Mfg/Model LPS10001 no bid no bid SOX.35 327817-SOX35
Price/ea 26.10 12.45 21.80
Total/144 3,758.40 1,792.80 3,139.20
1056 ea, Lamp, High Pressure
Sodium, 150W, Mogul Base, SATCO GE Lighting GE Osram Philips
20/cs, Mfg/Model HPS10020 LU150/55/H/ECO LU150/55/ECO LU150/55/ECO 368746-C150S55/Alto
Price/ea 8.16 7.66 6.78 6.45 7.34
Total 1056 8,616.96 8,088.96 7,159.68 6,811.20 7,751.04
108 ea, Lamp, High Pressure
Sodium, 250W, Mogul Base, SATCO GE Lighting GE Osram Philips
12/cs, Mfg/Model HPS10023 LU250/H/ECO LU250/ECO LU250ECO 368795-C250S50/Alto
Price/ea 8.16 7.78 6.70 6.80 8.29
Total/108 881.28 840.24 723.60 734.40 895.32
168 ea, Lamp, High Pressure
Sodium, 70W, Mogul Base SATCO GE Lighting GE Osram Philips
20/cs, Mfg/Model HPS10010 LU70/H/ECO LU70/H/ECO LU70ECO 368696-C70S62/Alto
Price/ea 8.16 7.78 6.70 6.45 7.97
Total/168 1,370.88 1,307.04 1,125.60 1,083.60 1,338.96
Delivery 10 days 3-28 days 14 days
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30




